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Substance dependence is an urgent and growing public 
health problem. In a recent national survey, 60 million 
Americans reported abusing alcohol within the month 
prior to the survey (Substance Abuse and Mental Health 
Services Administration [SAMHSA], 2023). Nearly 20 mil-
lion Americans reported using illegal drugs (e.g., her-
oin) or using prescription drugs (e.g., opioids) for 
nonmedical reasons in the year before. Drug overdose 
rates have been steadily increasing over the past 20 
years (National Institute on Drug Abuse [NIDA], 2023); 
see Figure 1. Between April 2020 and April 2021, drug-
related deaths surpassed 100,000 for the first time 
(Centers for Disease Control and Prevention, 2023). This 
increase has been driven primarily by opioid and stimu-
lant use (NIDA, 2023); see Figure 2. Although there are 
numerous effective evidence-based treatments for sub-
stance dependence (Ali et al., 2017; Chiesa & Serretti, 
2014; Steinka-Fry et  al., 2017), treatment seeking 
remains relatively low, particularly within the first few 
years of disorder onset (Blanco et  al., 2015; Kessler 

et  al., 2001) and among underrepresented minority 
populations (Pinedo, 2020).

Stigma has been identified as fuel for substance 
dependence and for America’s addiction crisis more 
broadly (Fogler, 2020). Stigma is one of the strongest 
predictors of treatment hesitancy and thus a key barrier 
to recovery (P. Corrigan et al., 2017; Crapanzano et al., 
2019; Hammarlund et al., 2018). Stigma has a range of 
additional negative consequences, including limiting 
access to employment and housing, disrupting inter-
personal relationships, harming physical and mental 
health, and reducing help-seeking (Frost, 2011; Link 
et al., 2001; Rüsch et al., 2005; Sickel et al., 2014). All 
of these serve to weaken ties to other individuals and 
social institutions and to simultaneously increase 
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experiences of stress and trauma that exacerbate sub-
stance use.

Comparative studies suggest that substance depen-
dence is one of the most stigmatized health conditions 
an individual can have (Hinshaw & Stier, 2008; Perry 
et al., 2020). However, research on stigma toward peo-
ple with substance use disorders (SUDs) is relatively 
limited compared with the large, cross-disciplinary 
studies on mental illness stigma, which span the fields 
of psychology, sociology, and public health (Arnaez 
et al., 2020; P. Corrigan et al., 2017; P. W. Corrigan et al., 
2014; Hammarlund et al., 2018; Pescosolido & Martin, 
2015; Sickel et  al., 2014). We lack a comprehensive 
understanding of the causes and consequences of SUD 
stigma and of how, if at all, it differs from other types 
of mental illness stigma (Barry et al., 2014; Schomerus 
et al., 2011). The goal of this review is to take stock of 
the literature on SUD stigma, providing a clear set of 
foundational principles and a blueprint for future 
research and translational activity.

Characterizing the nature and etiology of SUD stigma 
is critical for developing tailored and effective interven-
tions to combat it. The first section of this review exam-
ines the consequences of stigma in several key domains 

(i.e., self-perception, employment, interpersonal rela-
tionships, treatment). The next two sections consider 
two key drivers of stigma—beliefs about the stigmatized 
condition and the affective responses they elicit toward 
stigmatized individuals. The final section leverages 
existing research on mental illness stigma reduction to 
identify potential interventions that could reduce SUD 
stigma. We aim to provide a road map of what we know 
about SUD stigma, what remains to be studied, and 
what interventions might be effective in reducing this 
stigma.

Consequences of Stigma Toward SUD 
and Other Mental Illness

Stigmatization is a social psychological and sociological 
process that has four basic components: labeling, ste-
reotyping, rejection, and discrimination (Link & Phelan, 
2001; Pescosolido & Martin, 2015). These components 
exist on a continuum from relatively mild to very severe, 
with consequences that differ across distinct stigmatized 
conditions as well as social and cultural contexts (Link 
& Phelan, 2001; Pescosolido & Martin, 2015). 
Stigmatization is perpetuated by power dynamics; some 
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Fig. 1.  Total number of overdose deaths in the United States from 1999 to 2021 by gender. Rates are collapsed across age groups, multiple 
substance types, and intentional, unintentional, and undetermined causes of death. Data were obtained from CDC WONDER (2023).
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scholars argue that it serves as a means of exploiting 
and dominating specific individuals or groups (Phelan 
et al., 2008), and others suggest that it preserves exist-
ing social structures ( Jost & Banaji, 1994). These moti-
vations may differ across conditions and communities and 
are reflected in individual and system levels of stigma.

Mental illness and SUD stigma are generally mea-
sured along three key dimensions: public stigma (i.e., 
negative beliefs that members of society attribute 
toward stigmatized individuals), self-stigma (i.e., nega-
tive beliefs that individuals with a stigmatized condition 
attribute to themselves), and structural stigma (i.e., 
systemic rules, policies, and practices that constrain 
opportunities and resources of a stigmatized group; 
Brown et  al., 2015; Campbell & Deacon, 2006; P. W. 
Corrigan et al., 2004; Hatzenbuehler, 2016; Livingston 
& Boyd, 2010; Sheehan et al., 2017). These three kinds 
of stigma likely interact and influence one another in 
various ways (P. W. Corrigan & Wassel, 2008; Vogel 
et al., 2010), although the full scope of these intercon-
nections remains to be determined. At the most basic 
level, public and structural stigma contribute to the 
individual- and system-level power dynamics of mental 
illness and SUD stigma.

Stigma has effects across myriad domains, including 
self-perception, interpersonal relationships, employ-
ment and housing, health and health care, and help-
seeking. These adverse outcomes occur through 
multiple pathways, creating barriers associated with 
self-, public, and structural stigmas. When a person is 
labeled with SUD (whether by laypersons or profes-
sionals or via self-diagnosis), the negative beliefs asso-
ciated with these conditions become relevant to the self 
and may be internalized (i.e., self-stigma). This inter-
nalization leads to social psychological and behavioral 
consequences, such as secrecy, withdrawal from social 
relationships and roles, and downgrading of life goals 
and aspirations, all of which are self-sabotaging. At the 
same time, because of pervasive public stigma, people 
with stigmatized conditions experience social rejection 
and discrimination from various figures in their lives—
family members, friends, neighbors, current and poten-
tial employers, etc.—resulting in additional adverse 
outcomes. Finally, structural stigma through laws, poli-
cies, and procedures exacerbates the impact of stigma 
at the individual level, reducing opportunities and 
erecting barriers to maintaining social and institutional 
connections (e.g., friendships, jobs, stable housing, 
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Fig. 2.  Total number of overdose deaths in the United States from 1999 to 2021 by substance type and gender. Rates are collapsed across 
age groups and intentional, unintentional, and undetermined causes of death. Data were obtained from CDC WONDER (2023).
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treatment access) that would facilitate recovery and 
community reintegration. Thus, stigma infiltrates virtu-
ally every aspect of an affected person’s life at multiple 
levels, from micro to meso to macro, exacerbating the 
primary impact of SUD symptoms on well-being, life 
satisfaction, relationships, and life chances.

For social psychologists, the focus of the work on 
the consequences of stigma on its targets has primarily 
been on the psychological implications of stigma. 
Sociologists and public health researchers, however, 
have focused predominantly on the social, structural, 
and health implications of stigma. This divergence pres-
ents a core strength of a cross-disciplinary approach 
because it provides a wider lens for characterizing and 
understanding the negative implication of stigma. 
However, a limitation of interdisciplinary research is 
that it has primarily focused on mental illness stigma. 
Indeed, the few studies that have considered both men-
tal illness and SUD stigma have not dissociated the two. 
Thus, the following review of the consequences of 
stigma leans more heavily on the mental illness litera-
ture to shed light on the potential impact of stigma on 
individuals with SUD across these myriad domains. 
Identifying downstream consequences of SUD stigma 
for social stratification, well-being, and recovery is 
essential for developing policies and programs targeted 
at alleviating structural stigma.

Self-perception

Social psychological theories of stigma have focused 
on numerous psychological effects of stigma on its 
targets. The most relevant for SUD stigma are negative 
treatment, greater self-stigma (Evans-Lacko, Brohan, 
et al., 2012), and social identity threat (Major & O’Brien, 
2005). Being stigmatized negatively affects individuals’ 
psychological well-being (Hoyt et al., 2019; Pachankis 
et al., 2018; Yu et al., 2021) and is a direct threat to the 
individual as a member of a devalued group (Tajfel & 
Turner, 2004). As a result, stigmatization can negatively 
impact self-esteem because it creates an ambiguity for 
a stigmatized individual about whether negative treat-
ment they might receive is due to their own behavior 
or their stigmatized identity (Crocker et al., 1998).

Self-esteem plays an important role in preserving 
individuals’ self-efficacy (beliefs that they have the 
resources and ability to overcome any possible barri-
ers), which is essential for successfully engaging in and 
completing treatment (Livingston & Boyd, 2010; Major 
& O’Brien, 2005; Ritsher & Phelan, 2004). Reduced self-
efficacy and self-esteem are associated with maladap-
tive coping and negative outcomes across multiple 
domains (Bandura & Locke, 2003; Kadden & Litt, 2011; 
Leary et  al., 1995), including increased SUD use 

(Arsandaux et al., 2020) and reduced treatment engage-
ment (Ajzen, 1991; Ryan & Deci, 2000; Ryan et  al., 
2008). Self-efficacy, and especially the belief that one 
is capable of recovery, has been identified as a critical 
component of initiating treatment for mental illness or 
SUD, overcoming setbacks, persisting in treatment, and 
receiving effective treatment (Chavarria et  al., 2012; 
Pelletier et al., 2017; Schwarzer & Fuchs, 1996). In sum, 
the belief that one can achieve desired results through 
effort is associated with nearly every outcome that 
requires effort to succeed (Bandura & Locke, 2003), 
including SUD recovery.

Stigma also has negative implications for health 
(Major, Dovidio, & Link, 2018). According to one model, 
stigma negatively affects health on multiple fronts 
(Major, Dovidio, Link, & Calabrese, 2018). First, expe-
riencing and internalizing stigma create stress, which 
negatively affects health. At the same time, public and 
structural stigma reduce access to treatment, thus creat-
ing a vicious cycle for health and well-being. This bur-
den may be particularly pronounced for concealable 
stigmatized identities, such as mental illness or SUD, 
because the act of concealment can increase stress 
(Quinn, 2017).

Interpersonal relationships and social 
networks

The onset of SUD has far-reaching consequences for 
individuals’ social interactions and networks (Lipton 
et al., 1981). Studies of public stigma indicate that many 
Americans want to socially distance themselves from 
individuals with SUD and express concerns about liv-
ing, working, and socializing with these populations 
(Link et al., 1999; Martin et al., 2000; Perry et al., 2020; 
Pescosolido et al., 2021). Social rejection sentiments are 
particularly pronounced (i.e., endorsed by nearly three 
quarters of respondents) for having a person with SUD 
marry into one’s family or work closely in a job (Perry 
et  al., 2020). These patterns may reflect the role of 
perceptions of incompetence in social rejection, 
wherein a person being unable to fulfill responsibilities 
or being a burden become particularly salient (e.g., 
becoming a family member, being a coworker). Indeed, 
a recent study found that social rejection sentiments on 
these salient dimensions were particularly pronounced 
for individuals described as actively using an illicit sub-
stance (e.g., heroin, methamphetamine), although 
desire for social distance was slightly attenuated when 
the individual was described as being in active recovery 
(Krendl & Perry, 2022).

When asked directly, people with SUD report expe-
riencing social rejection or exclusion by friends, family 
members, romantic partners, neighbors, and employers 
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(Peterson et al., 2007; Perry, 2011; Todd et al., 2004; 
Wesselmann & Parris, 2021; Wright et  al., 2007). 
According to theoretical models of rejection sensitivity, 
the salience of this potential rejection could reduce 
individuals’ willingness to seek treatment for SUD or 
to engage with health-care providers by exacerbating 
their distrust (e.g., Mendoza-Denton et  al., 2002). 
Although disclosure can promote better health out-
comes (Bos et al., 2009), it runs the risk of straining 
social relationships (A. M. Jones, 2011). In a large quali-
tative interview study of people with mental illness, 
participants reported that friends stopped contacting 
them, neighbors no longer visited, and social invitations 
declined once their psychiatric disorder or mental 
health treatment was disclosed, contributing to feelings 
of social isolation and alienation (Wahl, 1999). 
Additionally, prospective community-based longitudinal 
studies suggest that mental illness and lower levels of 
baseline psychological well-being are associated with 
decreased social support and smaller networks up to a 
year later (Husaini & Von Frank, 1985). Finally, Link et 
al. (1989) provided evidence of the impact of self-
stigma on relationships, finding that people with mental 
illnesses endorse strategies to cope with stigma (e.g., 
secrecy and withdrawal). Moreover, they found that 
their support networks are compromised by these strat-
egies and by the fear of rejection more generally. 
Perhaps for these reasons, individuals with concealable 
stigmatized identities such as SUD will disclose their 
condition only when they feel that the benefits will 
substantially outweigh the costs (Chaudoir & Fisher, 
2010). Because SUD is highly stigmatized, the costs 
associated with disclosure (being socially rejected or 
ostracized) may make people with SUD less likely or 
less willing to disclose their condition.

The impact of stigma on people with SUD is also 
observed in their romantic and sexual relationships, 
which are critical for well-being and life satisfaction 
(Buckley et al., 1999; Carey et al., 2001; Kessler et al., 
1998; Rodriguez & Prestwood, 2019). A consistent find-
ing across dozens of studies is that the overall fre-
quency of sexual activity and presence of sexual 
relationships are lower among persons with mental 
illness and SUD compared with the general population 
(Buckley et al., 1999; Carey et al., 2001; K. McKinnon 
& Rosner, 2000). Although this topic has been less 
closely examined in people with SUD, research on 
people with serious mental illness suggests that only a 
small minority successfully find and maintain longer 
term sexual or romantic relationships, either through 
marriage or cohabitation (Buckley et al., 1999; Dickerson 
et al., 2004; Perry & Wright, 2006). Some work suggests 
that this is at least partly due to people with mental 
illness believing that they are not good enough for a 

partner or are not desirable (Rodriguez & Prestwood, 
2019; Wainberg et al., 2016; Wright et al., 2007).

Employment and housing

Despite laws intended to protect people with mental 
illness from discrimination in the workplace (Aoun & 
Appelbaum, 2019; Cummings et al., 2013), the second 
most common discrimination charge filed under the 
Americans With Disabilities Act has been for psychiatric 
disorders (Colker, 2001; Scheid, 1999, 2005). There is 
substantial evidence that stigma against people with 
mental illness and SUD results in reduced employment 
opportunities (Baldwin et  al., 2010; Henkel, 2011; 
National Academies of Sciences, Engineering, and 
Medicine, 2016; Sharac et al., 2010) and greater odds 
of termination (Baldwin et al., 2010; Manning & White, 
1995). These patterns, in turn, result in disproportionate 
poverty and low income among people with mental 
illness and SUD (Baldwin & Marcus, 2006; Link, 1982, 
1987). In a study of people with mental illness (Peterson 
et al., 2007), approximately one third experienced prob-
lems finding or keeping a job because of their condi-
tion. They reported being passed over for jobs and 
promotions after disclosing their mental illness, being 
the first to be fired or laid off, being mistreated by 
supervisors, and being avoided by coworkers (Goldberg 
et al., 2005; Russinova et al., 2011). Additionally, self-
stigma may play a substantial role in employment out-
comes among people with mental illness or SUD (Pinel, 
1999). Specifically, stigmatized individuals may avoid 
applying for a job because of low self-efficacy or self-
esteem (e.g., they may believe they are incompetent or 
unworthy). Alternatively, they may not apply for posi-
tions because they fear being discriminated against by 
potential employers.

These perceptions of potential or actual discrimina-
tion and prejudice are confirmed by experimental audit 
studies. For example, one group of researchers sent 
fictitious job applications in response to listed positions, 
signaling either a history of mental illness or a history 
of physical injury (Hipes et al., 2016). The candidates 
with a history of physical injury received nearly 50% 
more callbacks than those with a history of mental ill-
ness. In a similar study focusing on people with a his-
tory of SUD, participants were asked to evaluate fictitious 
job applications that varied only in their response to a 
question about legal history (Curran, 2017). Applicants 
who indicated “possession of a controlled substance” 
were evaluated significantly more negatively than those 
who reported “none” or “will discuss.”

Through similar mechanisms, people with mental 
illness or SUD also experience housing discrimination 
(P. Corrigan et al., 2003; National Academies of Sciences, 
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Engineering, and Medicine, 2016). A recent longitudinal 
study, for example, identified strong relationships over 
time among mental illness discrimination, stigma tra-
jectories, and housing outcomes, including homeless-
ness (National Academies of Sciences, Engineering, and 
Medicine, 2016). In other research, SUD and mental 
illness have been linked to eviction and difficulty 
obtaining long-term leases (Dineen & Pendo, 2020; 
Metraux, 2002). An audit study of landlords who had 
posted ads for rental units found that when the person 
inquiring mentioned that they would soon be released 
from a psychiatric institution, the response was 6 times 
more likely to be negative (e.g., stating the apartment 
was unavailable) compared with a control condition 
(Page, 1977). There is also significant evidence of com-
munity rejection of mental health and SUD treatment 
facilities, including group housing, across multiple 
studies—a phenomenon known as NIMBYism (NIMBY 
meaning “not in my backyard”; Callard et  al., 2012, 
Chapter 7; Horn et al., 2021; Piat, 2000).

Help-seeking and recovery

More than two decades of work have implicated stigma 
as a barrier to seeking mental health treatment (Clement 
et al., 2015; P. W. Corrigan et al., 2012, 2014; Gulliver 
et al., 2010; Komiya et al., 2000; Link et al., 2001; Phelan 
et  al., 2000; Sickel et  al., 2014), with recent work 
extending this to the domain of SUD (P. Corrigan et al., 
2017; Gourley & Krendl, 2023; Luoma, 2010; Luoma 
et al., 2014). For example, one study found that indi-
viduals with a lifetime diagnosis of an alcohol use dis-
order were less likely to use alcohol services if they 
perceived there to be high stigma in society toward 
individuals with alcohol use disorders (Keyes et  al., 
2010).

Additional work has found that although stigma is 
not the only barrier to seeking mental health treatment 
(Arnaez et al., 2020; Gulliver et al., 2010; Haugen et al., 
2017; Mojtabai et  al., 2011), it accounts for the most 
variance in predicting negative attitudes toward treat-
ment seeking (Komiya et al., 2000) and exacerbates the 
emphasis placed on other barriers (e.g., cost, time, per-
ceived need of treatment; Arnaez et  al., 2020; Sickel 
et al., 2014). Self-stigma, in particular, has a particularly 
pernicious influence on people’s attitudes toward men-
tal health treatment (Arnaez et al., 2020; Livingston & 
Boyd, 2010; Vogel et al., 2007). Studies on university 
campuses have found that self-stigma is negatively asso-
ciated with use of mental health services (Komiya et al., 
2000; Vogel et  al., 2007). Indeed, a large-scale study 
with nearly 6,000 students from 13 different universities 
found that self-stigma was negatively associated with 

use of mental health services as well as deficits in non-
clinical support (Eisenberg et al., 2009). These findings 
are supported by meta-analyses, which have also estab-
lished a strong negative relationship between self-
stigma and mental health treatment engagement (r = 
–.38; Livingston & Boyd, 2010).

Although less widely explored, structural stigma has 
also been identified as a barrier for seeking mental 
health treatment (Gulliver et al., 2010; Hatzenbuehler, 
2016, 2017). A recent study extended this work to SUD 
and found that among individuals who self-identified 
as having misused substances (e.g., alcohol, prescrip-
tion opioids, stimulants), the extent to which they 
endorsed structural stigma negatively predicted their 
willingness to seek treatment, even when the authors 
controlled for participants’ self- and public stigma 
(Gourley & Krendl, 2023). Structural stigma affects indi-
viduals with SUD in myriad ways, including through 
laws and policies that regulate substance use and limit 
access to health care (Hemeida & Goldberg, 2022).

In addition to affecting attitudes toward treatment 
and initiation of help-seeking, stigma also influences 
treatment outcomes among people with mental illness 
and SUD (Cernasev et  al., 2021; Crapanzano et  al., 
2019). For example, stigma jeopardizes the odds of 
persistence in treatment and eventual recovery and also 
increases the likelihood of relapse (Brener et al., 2010; 
Clement et al., 2015). One study of the iatrogenic effects 
of treatment programs found that a significant minority 
of individuals who enter treatment for SUD leave worse 
off than before and that perceived stigma was a strong 
predictor of this deterioration (Moos, 2005).

Perhaps the most illustrative example of the pro-
found ways that SUD stigma can disrupt treatment per-
tains to medication for opioid use disorder (MOUD). 
Although medication is the most effective treatment for 
opioid use disorder, it is highly stigmatized (Woods & 
Joseph, 2018). Because some forms of MOUD (e.g., 
methadone) require frequent visits to special clinics 
licensed to distribute the medication, prospective 
patients report fear of being seen there by members of 
their community, leading to poor adherence and relapse 
(Cernasev et al., 2021). Additionally, many people with 
SUD avoid MOUD because others, including health-care 
professionals, continue to perceive them as addicted to 
drugs and therefore not actually in recovery (Hewell 
et al., 2017). Finally, research demonstrates that many 
physicians will not treat clients using office-based 
MOUD, instead preferring abstinence (a less effective 
strategy), because of these very biases and because of 
fears that people with SUD coming to their practice will 
drive other patients away (Dickson-Gomez et al., 2022; 
Madden et al., 2021; Richter et al., 2019).
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Future directions

Together, the findings discussed in this section highlight 
the myriad negative repercussions of stigma for its tar-
gets. Stigma negatively affects individual’s self-esteem; 
limits the quality and quantity of their interpersonal 
relationships; reduces their access to employment, 
housing, and health care; and disrupts their willingness 
to seek and adhere to treatment. Stigma thus disrupts 
individuals’ well-being and chances for recovery on 
multiple levels, making it particularly challenging to 
overcome. However, we need future work that more 
clearly dissociates the impact of mental illness stigma 
from SUD stigma on its targets, as well as how, if at all, 
it differs across specific types of SUD.

Policies that specifically target stigmatizing laws will 
remove important barriers to treatment and equitable 
outcomes for individuals with SUD. Emerging work has 
begun to demonstrate the prevalence of laws that stig-
matize SUD in the United States. For example, a recent 
pilot study of 20 counties in California identified laws 
that promoted SUD stigma in every county (Hemeida 
& Goldberg, 2022). Employment law was the most com-
mon domain (occurring in nearly 86% of the counties). 
Stigmatizing laws can jeopardize treatment, both indi-
rectly (e.g., by denying access to employment) and 
directly (e.g., through “nuisance laws,” which can be 
used to ban sober living facilities or needle exchange 
sites). With respect to the latter, the pilot study in 
California found that nearly half of the laws stigmatizing 
SUD were nuisance laws (Hemeida & Goldberg, 2022). 
Thus, one area of future work would be to compare 
laws promoting stigma toward people with SUD and 
those with mental illness to determine which is more 
prevalent. Critically, future work should evaluate the 
consequences of those laws on stigma (e.g., by deter-
mining whether they are associated with higher nega-
tive beliefs and affective responses to individuals with 
SUD). Moreover, identifying the domains in which 
stigma is highest (e.g., employment) will be directly 
relevant for policymaking.

In the next two sections, we take an interdisciplinary 
approach to advance our understanding of the drivers 
of SUD stigma. This approach allows us to leverage the 
strengths of the different discipline-specific approaches 
and to identify potential gaps that have emerged 
between fields. Within the field of social psychology, 
for example, we leverage the broader theoretical frame-
works that have been developed to characterize the 
beliefs and affective responses that drive stigma 
(Crocker et  al., 1998). However, a limitation of this 
research is that it generally examines mental illness and 
SUD in the context of stigma more broadly (Fiske et al., 
2002, 2007; E. E. Jones et  al., 1984; Pachankis et  al., 

2018), again often collapsing mental illness and SUD 
together (Feldman & Crandall, 2007; but see Pachankis 
et al., 2018; Towler & Schneider, 2005). This approach 
may limit the field’s ability to relate broader theories to 
mental illness and SUD specifically.

Other fields, including sociology and public health, 
have focused more specifically on identifying the beliefs 
and behaviors elicited by mental illness and/or SUD 
stigma (Barry et  al., 2014; Kennedy-Hendricks et  al., 
2017; Link, 1987; Link et al., 1999; Pescosolido, 2013; 
Pescosolido et al., 2021). These studies have often been 
conducted with large, representative samples and, in 
some cases, provide longitudinal assessments of mental 
illness and SUD stigma, with a primary focus on public 
stigma. Although this approach has greater specificity 
than social psychological approaches, it does not pro-
vide the broader contextual framing for understanding 
how and why mental illness and SUD stigma are unique 
from other types of stigma, as well as from each other. 
Thus, these distinct approaches provide a complemen-
tary and broader conceptual framework for understand-
ing SUD stigma. We consider their specific contributions 
in the subsequent sections, focusing first on the beliefs 
that drive mental illness and SUD stigma.

Identifying Stigma-Related Beliefs  
and Attributions Associated  
With SUD and Mental Illness

In its earliest conceptualization, stigma was generally 
viewed as stemming from one of three categories: char-
acter flaws, physical disabilities, or group identity 
(Goffman, 1963). Here, mental illness and SUD were 
both considered to be character flaws, and individuals 
with either of them were thus considered to be part of 
the same stigmatized group. Although Goffman’s con-
ceptualization has been highly influential, subsequent 
work noted that these three categories did not capture 
all stigmatized groups (E. E. Jones et  al., 1984; King 
et al., 2005). Thus, social psychological research over 
the ensuing decades focused on developing a more 
comprehensive theoretical framework for categorizing 
stigmatized groups and identifying the beliefs that drive 
social stigma. Identifying those beliefs is important 
because they shape the subsequent affective responses 
and discriminatory behaviors that people have to stig-
matized individuals (Crocker et al., 1998; Dovidio et al., 
2000). In parallel, research in the fields of sociology, 
clinical psychology, and public health emerged to identify 
how specific stigma-related beliefs (e.g., perceptions 
of dangerousness) drive mental health and SUD stigma 
(Barry et al., 2014; P. Corrigan, 2004; Link et al., 1999; 
Pescosolido & Martin, 2015). In this cross-disciplinary 
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work, there has been an evolving discordance about 
whether the beliefs underlying mental illness and SUD 
should be considered similar or distinct. In this section, 
we review some of this work and highlight knowledge 
gaps.

An important caveat in understanding the beliefs that 
drive mental illness and SUD stigma is that they likely 
differ across specific conditions. For example, although 
the literature lacks a comprehensive assessment of how 
and why stigma differs across mental illness conditions, 
the general consensus is that psychotic disorders (e.g., 
schizophrenia) are more stigmatized than mood (e.g., 
depression) and anxiety (e.g., obsessive compulsive) 
disorders, which typically do not differ from each other 
(Anderson et al., 2015; Link et al., 1999; Pescosolido, 
2013; Robinson et al., 2019; Wood et al., 2014). This 
pattern generally persists across cultures (Krendl & 
Pescosolido, 2020; Pescosolido, 2013). The magnitude 
of SUD stigma, however, can be simplified along a key 
structural dimension—perceived legality of use. 
Specifically, substances that can be used legally in the 
United States (e.g., alcohol and, in some cases, mari-
juana) are generally less stigmatized than those that 
cannot (e.g., cocaine, heroin; Brown et  al., 2015; 
Goodyear et al., 2018; Krendl & Perry, 2022; Weeks & 
Stenstrom, 2020). Although there is limited work com-
paring stigma within legality status (Brown, 2015; 
Janulis et  al., 2013; Link et  al., 1999; McGinty et  al., 
2015; Perry et  al., 2020), a recent study found that 
stigma generally does not differ toward illicit substances 
(heroin, methamphetamine), but some legal substances 
(e.g., alcohol) may be less stigmatized than others (e.g., 
prescription opioids), albeit with some nuances (Krendl 
& Perry, 2022). Broadly speaking, SUD is typically more 
stigmatized than mental illness. However, when exam-
ining specific SUD and/or mental illness type, several 
studies have shown that schizophrenia is stigmatized 
to a similar extent as some SUD types (Link et al., 1999; 
Perry et  al., 2020; Pescosolido, 2013). Given these 
important differences, we consider mental illness and 
SUD by type, when possible, to better elucidate poten-
tial points of convergence and divergence.

Social psychological researchers have generally iden-
tified the beliefs that are key drivers of stigma as the 
extent to which the condition is perceived to be socially 
undesirable, dangerous, controllable (e.g., caused by 
the individual), changeable (e.g., recovery is perceived 
as possible), and/or visible (Deaux et al., 1995; Frable, 
1993; E. E. Jones et al., 1984; Towler & Schneider, 2005; 
Weiner et  al., 1988). When applying these beliefs to 
mental illness and SUD, however, some researchers 
have collapsed them into the same group (Feldman & 
Crandall, 2007), which obfuscates any potential differ-
ences between the two. Additional work has addressed 

this by both expanding these beliefs to also consider 
disruptiveness—the extent to which a condition strains 
social relationships—and examining mental illness and 
SUD separately (Pachankis et al., 2018). Here, different 
beliefs were shown to contribute to their respective 
stigmatization. Specifically, SUD was viewed as moder-
ately changeable and disruptive but highly controllable 
and threatening. Conversely, mental illness was gener-
ally viewed as less controllable, changeable, threaten-
ing, and disruptive than SUD.

The fact that threat, controllability, and disruptive-
ness were more strongly emphasized in SUD than men-
tal illness may shed light on why studies across 
numerous fields have generally shown that the former 
is more stigmatized than the latter (Barry et al., 2014; 
P. W. Corrigan et  al., 2009; Martin et  al., 2000; Perry 
et al., 2020; Rey et al., 2019; Schomerus et al., 2011). 
Simply put, these beliefs have been widely shown to 
predict greater stigma. Although speculative, this rela-
tionship may be exacerbated by the extent to which 
stigma-related beliefs are reinforced on structural levels. 
For example, some existing policies and practices rein-
force beliefs that individuals with SUD are dangerous 
to the general public (e.g., zoning laws that separate 
treatment facilities from neighborhoods). Similarly, 
imbalanced media portrayals that overwhelmingly 
depict individuals with SUD as dangerous or disruptive 
likely reinforce related beliefs about SUD (McGinty 
et  al., 2019). Although research suggests that some 
active SUDs can create interpersonal and family conflict 
and strain and are associated with higher risk for per-
petrating particular types of crime and violence (e.g., 
intimate-partner violence, property crimes; White, 2016; 
Zhong et  al., 2020), these relationships are complex 
and multifactorial. The link between SUD and violence, 
for example, is confounded and mediated by a wide 
range of social, psychological, and economic risk fac-
tors, including psychiatric comorbidity, adverse child-
hood experiences, poverty, violent victimization, and 
male sexuality (Mason & O’Rinn, 2014; White, 2016; 
Zhong et al., 2020). These confounding factors are often 
oversimplified or simply overlooked, thus inflating 
these beliefs.

Although research in the fields of sociology and pub-
lic health has demonstrated that both perceived threat 
and controllability drive SUD and mental illness stigma, 
a limitation of this work is that it has primarily focused 
on those beliefs exclusively (Brown et  al., 2015; 
Feldman & Crandall, 2007; Foster & O’Mealey, 2022; 
Janulis et  al., 2013; Krendl & Freeman, 2019; Perry 
et al., 2020; Pescosolido et al., 1999), largely overlook-
ing the potential role of other beliefs in mental illness 
and SUD stigma. For example, the role of disruptiveness 
on mental illness and SUD stigma is generally 
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understudied in these fields, despite being a key feature 
of social psychological theories of stigmatization (Fiske 
et al., 2002, 2007; E. E. Jones et al., 1984). This fact is 
surprising given that sociological research has demon-
strated that individuals with SUD are disproportionately 
identified as “causing problems” in personal social net-
works (Railey et  al., 2023), suggesting that they are 
viewed as highly disruptive. However, an important 
consideration in examining the impact of disruptiveness 
beliefs on SUD stigma is that different fields have opera-
tionalized disruptiveness in disparate ways (Krendl & 
Freeman, 2019; Link et  al., 1999; Perry et  al., 2020; 
Pescosolido et  al., 1999; Towler & Schneider, 2005). 
Thus, the nature and scope of its potential impact are 
difficult to discern.

In the next few sections, we explore the role of dif-
ferent stigma-related beliefs (e.g., dangerousness, con-
trollability) in mental illness and SUD stigma in more 
detail. Although perceived changeability (e.g., whether 
recovery is possible) is often confounded with control-
lability, we consider beliefs about changeability sepa-
rately, as they may play a particularly important role 
for SUD stigma. Each section considers two key ques-
tions: (a) How, if at all, do these beliefs differentially 
contribute to mental illness and SUD stigma? (b) What 
are the key gaps in research on these topics? Regarding 
the former, the nature and magnitude of stigma differ 
across disparate mental disorders and SUD types (e.g., 
depression, schizophrenia, alcohol dependence, 
cocaine dependence) and even across cultures (Fiske, 
2012; Krendl & Freeman, 2019; Krendl & Perry, 2022; 
Krendl & Pescosolido, 2020; Martin et  al., 2000; 
Schomerus et al., 2011; Wood et al., 2014). One possible 
reason for this is that different beliefs are attributed to 
different mental illnesses and SUD conditions (Ahern 
et  al., 2007; Feldman & Crandall, 2007; Fiske, 2012; 
Krendl & Freeman, 2019; Krendl & Perry, 2022; Wood 
et al., 2014). However, because the extant mental illness 
and SUD stigma research presents these conditions 
generically (e.g., “individuals with mental illness,” “drug 
addicts”) or focuses on a subset of specific conditions 
(e.g., depression, schizophrenia, alcohol dependence, 
prescription opioid dependence), the scope of these 
differences is not clearly understood. We highlight these 
differences as they pertain to SUD stigma in each 
section.

Beliefs about dangerousness

Perceived dangerousness has been a primary focus in 
a large portion of cross-disciplinary research on mental 
illness and SUD stigma (Brown et  al., 2015; Janulis 
et al., 2013; Perry et al., 2020; Pescosolido et al., 1999). 
An important benefit of this work is that it generally 

operationalizes dangerousness in a consistent manner, 
thereby allowing for more cohesive and comprehensive 
evaluations of the findings. The National Stigma Study 
(NSS) has been central to this work. The NSS is a 
nationally representative survey on mental illness and 
SUD stigma that was fielded in 1996, 2008, and 2018 as 
part of the General Social Survey. It uses a vignette 
approach to capture beliefs about and stigma toward 
depression, schizophrenia, alcohol use disorder, and 
drug dependence (specified as “opioid use disorder” in 
2018). Importantly, the NSS examines beliefs about spe-
cific SUD conditions (alcohol dependence and, most 
recently, prescription opioid dependence) and types of 
mental illness (depression, schizophrenia) and uses the 
same measures to capture beliefs across conditions. 
This approach allows for direct comparisons among the 
specific conditions.

Results from the NSS have shown that dangerousness 
beliefs drive SUD and mental illness stigma, but these 
beliefs are generally stronger for SUD than mental ill-
ness (P. W. Corrigan et al., 2009; McGinty et al., 2015; 
Perry et al., 2020; Pescosolido et al., 1999). This finding 
is consistent with work that has also found that indi-
viduals with SUD are more likely than those with men-
tal illness to be perceived as dangerous (P. W. Corrigan 
et  al., 2009; McGinty et  al., 2015; Schomerus et  al., 
2011). However, important nuances emerge across the 
different SUD and mental illness conditions. Specifically, 
the NSS has shown that individuals with alcohol or drug 
dependence and individuals with schizophrenia elicit 
the highest levels of stigma and are viewed as more 
dangerous than individuals with depression (Link et al., 
1999; Pescosolido et al., 1999).

One consistent finding in the SUD stigma literature 
is that perceptions of dangerousness differ across SUD 
types. For example, when SUD is operationalized as 
“alcohol dependence,” it is perceived as being as dan-
gerous as schizophrenia (Pescosolido et al., 2019). This 
finding is consistent with the results of a systematic 
review finding that, across cultures, individuals with 
alcohol dependence were perceived as being as dan-
gerous as individuals with schizophrenia (Schomerus 
et al., 2011). However, when SUD is labeled as “cocaine 
dependence,” perceptions of dangerousness shift such 
that it becomes more dangerous than schizophrenia 
(Link et al., 1999).

A possible conceptual framework that dissociates the 
magnitude of threat associated with different SUD types 
may be the perceived legality of the SUD. Indeed, one 
of the few studies that examined perceived danger 
within substance type found that individuals who are 
dependent on illicit substances, such as heroin, are 
viewed as more dangerous than those who are depen-
dent on alcohol ( Janulis et  al., 2013). Another study 
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found that individuals who abuse prescription opioids 
are perceived as less dangerous than individuals who 
abuse alcohol (Perry et  al., 2020). Individuals who 
abuse illicit substances are perceived as more danger-
ous than individuals who abuse prescription opioids or 
alcohol (Krendl & Perry, 2022).

An important implication of perceptions of danger-
ousness is that these beliefs persist over time. Using the 
1996 and 2018 iterations of the NSS, researchers found 
continuity in public beliefs that individuals with schizo-
phrenia and alcohol dependence are dangerous. For 
example, in 2018, nearly two thirds of respondents 
viewed individuals with alcohol dependence or schizo-
phrenia as dangerous (compared with 30% who viewed 
individuals with depression that way; Pescosolido et al., 
2019). The persistence of these beliefs may be why 
stigma toward these groups has not declined over the 
past several decades (Pescosolido, 2013; Phelan et al., 
2000) despite increases in the public’s mental health 
literacy (e.g., attributions about the biological etiology 
of mental illness; Pescosolido et al., 2010). This pattern 
is important for two reasons. First, it suggests that inter-
ventions that target literacy may not be effective if they 
do not directly target the beliefs that drive stigma. 
Second, because SUD is perceived to be more danger-
ous than most mental illnesses, SUD stigma may be 
particularly resistant to change. However, efforts that 
target other stigma-related beliefs, such as controllabil-
ity, may indirectly attenuate perceptions of dangerous-
ness. We explore this possibility next.

Beliefs about controllability

Controllability refers to the belief that individuals are 
responsible for the onset of their condition (Hegarty & 
Golden, 2008; Weiner et al., 1988). These beliefs con-
trast with changeability, which refers to the belief that 
a stigmatized condition can improve. Within the field 
of social psychology, controllability beliefs increase 
blame and have been widely shown to increase stigma 
(Crandall & Eshleman, 2003; Hegarty & Golden, 2008; 
Rodin et al., 1989; Sherman et al., 2005), particularly 
for mental illness (Feldman & Crandall, 2007; Foster & 
O’Mealey, 2022; Krendl & Freeman, 2019). For example, 
in an examination of 40 mental disorders, psychologists 
found that perceived controllability was the strongest 
predictor of stigma toward those disorders, followed 
by dangerousness (Feldman & Crandall, 2007). 
Importantly, other work has shown that controllability 
beliefs differ across mental illness conditions, with cer-
tain conditions (e.g., depression) being viewed as more 
controllable than others (e.g., schizophrenia; Krendl & 
Freeman, 2019). Although this work has not been 
extended to different SUD types, SUD is generally 

viewed as more controllable than mental illness (P. W. 
Corrigan et al., 2009; Link et al., 1999; McGinty et al., 
2015; Perry et al., 2020).

Manipulating controllability beliefs has demonstrated 
that portraying a stigmatized condition as uncontrollable 
elicits less stigma than portraying it as controllable 
(Crandall & Moriarty, 1995; Nutter et al., 2018; Schwarzer 
& Weiner, 1991; Weiner et al., 1988). For example, HIV 
could be described as either controllable (e.g., “he got 
HIV from sharing needles”) or uncontrollable (e.g., “he 
got HIV from a blood transfusion”). The “uncontrollable” 
description generally reduces stigma and increases peo-
ple’s willingness to interact with and help stigmatized 
individuals (Crandall & Martinez, 1996; Nutter et  al., 
2018; Schwarzer & Weiner, 1991; Weiner et al., 1988).

Although these findings could be interpreted as sup-
port for emphasizing the genetic or biological (e.g., 
uncontrollable) etiologies of mental illness and SUD, a 
consequence of this approach is that it may reduce 
perceptions that the condition can be changed. In other 
words, reducing one stigma-related belief (controllabil-
ity) may inadvertently reduce another (changeability). 
For example, one study described alcohol use disorder 
as either genetic or nongenetic (i.e., uncontrollable vs. 
controllable). Although the uncontrollable (genetic) 
explanations reduced blame, they also reduced percep-
tions that the condition would benefit from treatment 
(Lebowitz & Appelbaum, 2017). Hence, reducing per-
ceptions of controllability also seemed to reduce per-
ceptions of changeability. This cascading effect may be 
particularly deleterious for individuals with SUD or men-
tal illness given that perceiving that mental illness and 
SUD are treatable is important for reducing self- and 
public stigma and removing structural barriers to care. 
Consistent with this assertion, prior work has found that 
shifting beliefs about controllability for mental illness 
(e.g., by emphasizing its biological etiology) does not 
seem to meaningfully affect stigma (Hegarty & Golden, 
2008; Pescosolido, 2013; Pescosolido et al., 2021).

Maintaining synergy in how different disciplines con-
ceptualize controllability is also important for broaden-
ing our understanding of how it affects stigmatization. 
However, there is currently a discordance in how this 
belief is measured in cross-disciplinary research. In the 
NSS, for example, controllability beliefs are assessed by 
asking respondents to endorse the extent to which a 
mental illness or SUD is due to a person’s bad character, 
the way they were raised, stressful life circumstances, 
a chemical imbalance in their brain, or genetic causes 
(Perry et  al., 2020; Pescosolido et  al., 2019, 2021). 
Within social psychology, however, controllability is 
often captured by asking individuals the extent to 
which stigmatized individuals are responsible for their 
condition or could be blamed for the onset of their 
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condition (Schwarzer & Weiner, 1991; Weiner et  al., 
1988). These approaches are similar in that both attempt 
to dissociate conditions that individuals can control 
from those they cannot. However, an important dis-
similarity between the two is that some measures (e.g., 
biological explanations) may also inadvertently influ-
ence beliefs about the condition’s changeability. 
Conversely, measures that emphasize personal respon-
sibility may not have this spillover effect. This is a criti-
cal consideration given that the two beliefs are 
conceptually distinct and contribute uniquely to stigma 
(P. W. Corrigan et al., 2000), a point discussed above 
and that we will revisit in the next section.

Recent work has shown that the relationship between 
beliefs about controllability and mental illness stigma 
are mediated by beliefs that individuals are responsible 
for the onset of their mental illness (Foster & O’Mealey, 
2022). However, the role of perceived controllability in 
SUD stigma remains less clear. The limited studies 
examining the role of controllability on SUD stigma 
have yielded mixed results. For example, one study 
found that manipulating controllability by directly 
manipulating personal responsibility (e.g., voluntarily 
starting to use drugs vs. becoming addicted after sur-
gery) did not affect SUD stigma (Witte et  al., 2019), 
whereas a different study using a similar manipulation 
found that stigma was higher toward individuals with 
prescription opioid dependence when the onset of their 
dependence was depicted as relatively controllable 
(e.g., through recreational use) than as uncontrollable 
(e.g., through medical use, as prescribed by a doctor; 
Krendl & Perry, 2022). One possibility for these discrep-
ancies could be that they used different samples (under-
graduates in the former vs. a representative sample of 
U.S. residents in the latter) and thus may reflect differ-
ent belief systems between the two groups.

In summary, framing conditions as uncontrollable 
decreases stigma for some conditions (Vescio et  al., 
2003) but may have the unintended consequence for 
mental illness and SUD of also reducing perceptions 
that it is changeable. This finding may be particularly 
relevant for SUD given that it is generally viewed as 
more controllable than mental illness (P. W. Corrigan 
et al., 2009; Link et al., 1999; McGinty et al., 2015; Perry 
et al., 2020). In other words, it is possible that control-
lability beliefs may be more deeply rooted for SUD than 
for mental illness and thus more resistant to change. 
Future work could shed light on this possibility.

Beliefs about changeability

Perceived changeability is the belief that stigmatized 
individuals can overcome their condition. That is, if a 
condition is changeable, it is seen as a temporary state 

rather than a feature of the person’s essential character. 
Thus, a promising approach for offsetting the negative 
impact of beliefs about controllability on SUD stigma 
may be to emphasize that SUD is changeable (e.g., 
through treatment leading to recovery). This approach 
may be particularly beneficial for reducing SUD stigma 
given the high recovery rates associated with SUD. 
Generally, recovery rates for addiction (defined broadly, 
including long periods of no relapse) are expected for 
nearly three quarters of all people who seek treatment 
(Miller, 2023).

An important challenge to emphasizing changeability 
is that it is often conflated with controllability, as dis-
cussed in the previous section. Thus, dissociating the 
two concepts is important given that some research 
suggests that changeability may offset controllability 
concerns (Schwarzer & Weiner, 1991). Indeed, one 
study found that although perceptions of controllability 
were lower toward schizophrenia compared with anxi-
ety and depression, the higher levels of stigma toward 
schizophrenia were driven by strong pessimism regard-
ing the possibility of recovery (Wood et al., 2014).

Prior work has shown that emphasizing changeabil-
ity in mental illness and SUD may also reduce other 
stigma-related beliefs (Krendl & Perry, 2022; McGinty 
et al., 2015; Wood et al., 2014). For example, Pachankis 
and colleagues (2018) dissociated active SUD use from 
SUD in recovery. They found that SUD in recovery was 
viewed as less controllable and less threatening than 
active SUD. Moreover, SUD in recovery was viewed 
similarly to symptomatic mental illnesses (e.g., depres-
sion). Consistent with this finding, another study found 
that emphasizing changeability (e.g., active recovery) 
reduced stigma toward all four measured SUD types 
(alcohol, prescription opioid, heroin, and methamphet-
amine) but had the most pronounced impact on stigma 
toward the more vilified substances (heroin and meth-
amphetamine; Krendl & Perry, 2022). One reason for 
this might be that SUD is generally perceived as more 
changeable than mental illness (P. W. Corrigan et al., 
2006; Perry et al., 2020). It may therefore be possible 
to leverage beliefs about changeability to reduce SUD 
stigma. However, an important caveat to this approach 
is that emphasizing changeability may have the unin-
tended consequence of increasing perceptions that 
individuals with SUD are responsible for their addic-
tion, which could exacerbate public and structural 
stigma. Thus, this approach should be used with cau-
tion, potentially by using it to reduce self-stigma.

Together, the findings reviewed in this section sug-
gest that emphasizing changeability may be important 
for reducing stigma toward SUD and some mental ill-
nesses (e.g., Pachankis et al., 2018) but may be particu-
larly effective for SUD self-stigma. Specifically, 
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emphasizing the potential changeability of SUD may 
be an avenue for offsetting controllability beliefs, but 
this possibility should be investigated more closely.

Beliefs about disruptiveness

Beliefs about disruptiveness, the extent to which stigma 
interferes with smooth social interactions, have also 
been implicated as drivers of mental illness stigma (E. 
E. Jones et al., 1984). However, of the beliefs discussed 
thus far, disruptiveness is the least well defined. From 
a social psychological perspective, disruptiveness is 
sometimes assessed by asking individuals the extent to 
which they find members of that group to be socially 
undesirable and/or disruptive (Krendl & Freeman, 2019; 
Towler & Schneider, 2005). The NSS assesses disruptive-
ness through perceptions of competence, such as by 
asking the extent to which individuals with mental ill-
ness or SUD are perceived to be capable of managing 
their own finances or making decisions about their 
treatment (Link et al., 1999; Perry et al., 2020; Pescosolido 
et al., 1999). Other work has measured disruptiveness 
by asking perceivers the extent to which they think 
individuals with mental illness are “dependent on oth-
ers,” “needy,” or “helpless” (Angermeyer & Matschinger, 
2003b; Roehrig & McLean, 2010). We review some of 
the overall findings from this work below.

Perceptions of competence differ across mental ill-
ness types. Specifically, individuals with schizophrenia 
are perceived as more dependent on other people than 
are individuals with depression (Angermeyer & 
Matschinger, 2003a). In some of the few comparisons 
of competence between individuals with mental illness 
and SUD, the latter are generally viewed as less com-
petent than the former (Perry et al., 2020; Pescosolido 
et al., 1999). For example, results from the NSS demon-
strated that individuals with drug dependence were 
perceived as less capable of making autonomous deci-
sions about finances or treatment compared with indi-
viduals with schizophrenia or depression (Pescosolido 
et al., 1999). Similarly, individuals with prescription opi-
oid dependence or alcohol dependence were viewed 
as less competent than individuals with depression 
(Perry et al., 2020) but as having similarly low compe-
tence as individuals with SUD (Boysen et al., 2020, 2023; 
Fiske, 2012; Perry et al., 2020; Sadler et al., 2012).

Social psychologists have taken a few different 
approaches to characterizing disruptiveness. In studies 
specifically examining mental illness stigma, disruptive-
ness has been framed as social desirability (Krendl & 
Freeman, 2019; Towler & Schneider, 2005). However, 
theoretical models designed to capture stigma more 
broadly characterize stigma along two dimensions: 
warmth (the stigmatized individuals’ desire to cause 
harm) and competence (the stigmatized individuals’ 

ability to harm others; Fiske et al., 2002, 2007). Here, 
warmth captures some of the core constructs of disrup-
tiveness, whereas competence aligns more closely with 
beliefs about dangerousness. An important aspect of 
the warmth–competence framework is that it provides 
a theoretical model for understanding the consequences 
of stigma on its targets. For example, it predicts that 
stigmatized groups that have low perceived competence 
and low warmth are often dehumanized (Boysen et al., 
2020; Fiske, 2012, 2018; Fiske et al., 2002). Recent work 
has specifically included mental illness and SUD and 
found that these conditions generally fall in the dehu-
manized low-warmth, low-competence quadrant 
(Boysen et al., 2023; Fiske, 2012).

Given that close others with SUD are disproportion-
ately identified as more likely to cause problems in 
personal social networks (Railey et al., 2023), percep-
tions of disruptiveness likely play an important role in 
SUD stigma. However, this belief is the most in need 
of a more robust and consistent framework in cross-
disciplinary work. Future work on this topic should 
develop consistent and clear ways to operationalize this 
belief to demonstrate how it contributes to SUD stigma.

Future directions

This section highlighted several key points. First, indi-
viduals with SUD are generally stigmatized more than 
individuals with mental illness. Second, differences in 
the magnitude of stigma toward mental illness and SUD 
are likely due to disparate beliefs about these condi-
tions. Specifically, beliefs about dangerousness, control-
lability, changeability, and disruptiveness all underlie 
public stigma of both mental illness and SUD, although 
they may be emphasized differently across conditions. 
Indeed, variations in these beliefs within and across 
mental illnesses and SUD may explain observed differ-
ences in stigma.

An important caveat to these conclusions is that this 
section focused on the stigma-related beliefs that have 
been most widely studied in the context of SUD stigma. 
However, research should not necessarily be limited to 
these beliefs. For example, concealability has been 
widely implicated as playing an important role in stig-
matization (Camacho et al., 2020; Chaudoir & Fisher, 
2010; Quinn, 2006; Quinn & Earnshaw, 2013) and may 
be particularly relevant for understanding the impact 
of SUD self-stigma on psychological well-being 
(Pachankis, 2007; Quinn & Earnshaw, 2013) and sensi-
tivity to rejection (Mendoza-Denton et al., 2002). Future 
research should continue to explore underlying beliefs 
that have received less attention.

The findings reviewed in this section provide insight 
into cultural and structural factors that may exacerbate 
negative public beliefs about SUD stigma in ways that 
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undermine recovery and public support for treatment 
and harm reduction. Cultural and structural conditions 
such as imbalanced media portrayals and policies seg-
regating people with SUD send strong messages about 
dangerousness that are depersonalizing, devoid of con-
text, and create inflated perceptions of risk to public 
safety. The research reviewed here suggests that these 
beliefs in turn impact public and self-stigma in ways 
that increase the likelihood of substance-use-related 
problems and reduce the odds of recovery. Deliberately 
changing negative depictions to be more positive may 
be an important step toward counteracting the negative 
stigma-related beliefs that drive SUD stigma. Similarly, 
removing laws that promote beliefs that individuals 
with SUD are dangerous (e.g., zoning laws that separate 
treatment facilities from neighborhoods) may also atten-
uate some of these stigma-related beliefs.

This section also highlighted gaps in how mental 
illness and SUD stigma have been studied and charac-
terized across different disciplines. Specifically, we 
noted key gaps where approaches and conceptualiza-
tions diverge and/or lack cohesion, notably in how 
controllability and disruptiveness have been character-
ized. In the next section, we build on our understanding 
of the beliefs that underlie mental illness and SUD 
stigma by reviewing how those beliefs elicit the nega-
tive emotional responses that drive stigma. We approach 
this section through a similar lens, highlighting differ-
ences and similarities across mental illness and SUD 
types and identifying gaps in the literature.

Disentangling the Affective Responses 
Elicited by the Stigma-Related Beliefs 
Attributed to Various SUDs and Other 
Mental Illnesses

In the previous section, we considered the profile of 
beliefs (e.g., about dangerousness, controllability, 
changeability, and disruptiveness) that are associated 
with SUD stigma. These beliefs are important to identify 
because the affective responses toward stigmatized 
individuals (e.g., pity, disgust, anger) are related to 
beliefs (Pryor et al., 2004; Weiner, 1980; Weiner et al., 
1988). Although some experimental work suggests a 
causal relationship between beliefs and affective 
responses (Caprariello et al., 2009), other work suggests 
that they may be intertwined (Dovidio et  al., 2000). 
Either way, perceivers’ affective responses toward stig-
matized groups ultimately contribute to discriminatory 
actions, including avoidance, social rejection, and/or 
dehumanization (Angermeyer et al., 2004; Angermeyer 
& Matschinger, 2003a; P. W. Corrigan, 2002; Pryor et al., 
2004; Weiner, 1980; Weiner et al., 1988). Dehumanization 

has particularly pernicious implications, given its role 
in increasing discrimination (Pereira et al., 2009), exac-
erbating intergroup conflict (Haslam, 2006; Haslam & 
Loughnan, 2014), and minimizing treatment outcomes 
(Haque & Waytz, 2012) for stigmatized individuals.

Relatively little work examining mental illness and 
SUD stigma has focused on affective responses. Nationally 
representative measures of mental health and SUD 
stigma (including the NSS) do not typically assess them 
(Barry et al., 2014; Krendl & Perry, 2022; Link et al., 1999; 
Link & Phelan, 2001; Perry et al., 2020; Pescosolido et al., 
1999). Moreover, the work that has examined the affec-
tive responses associated with mental illness and SUD 
stigma has three important limitations. First, the studies 
generally rest on the assumption that beliefs predict 
affective responses, whereas the two may be intertwined 
(Dovidio et al., 2000). Second, although social psycholo-
gists have developed comprehensive models for charac-
terizing the nature of the affective responses to stigma 
(Boysen et al., 2023; Fiske, 2012), these models have 
examined a wide range of stigmatized conditions, thus 
restricting their specific application to SUD. Finally, other 
disciplines have primarily focused on two distinct emo-
tions—fear and anger (P. W. Corrigan, 2000; P. W. 
Corrigan et al., 2002; Janulis et al., 2013; Rüsch et al., 
2005; Sattler et al., 2017)—largely overlooking emotions 
such as disgust (but see Boysen et al., 2023; Fiske, 2012; 
Nieweglowski et al., 2019; Sadler et al., 2015). This omis-
sion is important because recent work has associated 
mental illness and SUD with feelings of disgust and con-
tempt (Boysen et al., 2023; Fiske, 2012; Nieweglowski 
et al., 2019; Sadler et al., 2015). Because distinct affective 
responses elicit disparate discriminatory behaviors, char-
acterizing these responses should provide insight into 
the specific types of discriminatory behaviors that are 
likely to affect individuals with those stigmatized condi-
tions. Importantly, this insight could provide potential 
pathways for developing interventions that target those 
responses.

A challenge to identifying the affective responses 
associated with mental illness and SUD stigma is that 
individuals are often unaware of or unwilling to identify 
those responses. This limitation is addressed, at least 
partially, in emerging neuroimaging research, which is 
discussed at the end of this section. However, we first 
consider what is known about the affective responses 
that are uniquely activated by SUD. We focus primarily 
on fear and anger because these are the most com-
monly studied affective responses associated with men-
tal illness and SUD (Boysen et al., 2020; P. W. Corrigan, 
2000; P. W. Corrigan et al., 2002; Janulis et al., 2013; 
Sattler et al., 2017). We then consider other affective 
responses, including disgust and contempt, and explore 
how they might contribute to SUD stigma.
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Fear and anger are common affective 
responses to mental illness and SUD

Prior work attempting to characterize the affective 
responses to stigma has primarily focused on fear and 
anger (Boysen et al., 2020; P. W. Corrigan, 2000; P. W. 
Corrigan et al., 2002; Janulis et al., 2013; Sattler et al., 
2017). A key finding in this work is that stigmatized 
conditions that are perceived as dangerous generally 
elicit fear (P. W. Corrigan, 2000, 2002; Perry et al., 2007), 
whereas those that are perceived to be controllable 
elicit anger (Angermeyer et al., 2004; P. W. Corrigan, 
2000). There are distinct consequences for the two 
affective responses. Specifically, conditions that elicit 
anger are more likely to result in perceivers’ engaging 
in active harm (e.g., attacking, aggressing) toward indi-
viduals with those conditions, whereas conditions that 
elicit fear are more likely to lead to passive harm (e.g., 
avoiding, distancing; Sadler et al., 2015).

However, the beliefs and affective responses associ-
ated with stigma may be intertwined, and a different 
emphasis may be placed on each depending on the 
stigmatized condition (Dovidio et al., 2000). For exam-
ple, strong attributions or beliefs about a condition 
(e.g., whether the condition is perceived as controlla-
ble) drive the subsequent affective response to indi-
viduals with that condition. However, highly stigmatized 
conditions might activate beliefs and affect concur-
rently. Because it is challenging to shift people’s affec-
tive responses (Puhl & Brownell, 2003), disentangling 
these possibilities could further elucidate whether SUD 
stigma is relatively resistant to change.

In general, the limited research on the affective 
responses associated with SUD stigma has relied on the 
assumption that specific beliefs elicit disparate affective 
responses. Because SUD is generally viewed as more 
dangerous than mental illness (P. W. Corrigan et  al., 
2009; McGinty et al., 2015; Perry et al., 2020; Pescosolido 
et al., 1999), research on the affective responses associ-
ated with SUD stigma has focused specifically on fear. 
One study focused on stigma toward individuals with 
alcohol, marijuana, or heroin dependence, finding that 
perceptions that the condition was dangerous increased 
fear toward those individuals, which subsequently 
increased discriminatory behavior (desire for social dis-
tance; Janulis et al., 2013). Interestingly, the study also 
found that having greater personal experience with an 
individual with SUD reduced perceptions of dangerous-
ness and, subsequently, fear. A review of studies focus-
ing on stigma toward individuals with alcohol 
dependence found that these individuals elicit more 
fear and less empathy than individuals with depression 
or schizophrenia (Schomerus et al., 2011). In addition 
to its narrow focus on fear, the extant research on the 

affective responses associated with SUD stigma is lim-
ited by the fact that it typically does not dissociate 
among SUD types. Beliefs underlying SUD stigma differ 
across SUD types, making this an important direction 
for future exploration.

Some work on SUD stigma has also examined anger, 
given its relationship to beliefs about controllability 
(Angermeyer et al., 2004; P. W. Corrigan, 2000). In one 
study, participants completed a survey that explored 
multiple affective responses toward SUD, including 
anger, fear, and disgust (Nieweglowski et  al., 2019). 
They found that SUD was most strongly associated with 
affective responses related to fear, followed by affective 
responses associated with anger. An important caveat 
to this finding is that SUD was defined generically 
(“people who abuse substance like drugs or alcohol”), 
thus obfuscating potentially key differences among sub-
stance types. However, the fact that there was a strong 
association between SUD and fear could shed light on 
the higher levels of stigma generally expressed toward 
SUD. Specifically, although both fear and anger 
responses exacerbate discriminatory behaviors (e.g., 
avoidance), fear has been implicated as the largest con-
tributor of the two (Angermeyer et al., 2004; Angermeyer 
& Matschinger, 2003a; P. W. Corrigan, 2002).

Although direct comparisons of the affective 
responses to SUD and mental illness are scarce, an 
important consideration is that, as discussed in the pre-
vious section, individuals with SUD and some mental 
illnesses (e.g., schizophrenia) are considered to be dan-
gerous (Brown et al., 2015; Janulis et al., 2013; McGinty 
et al., 2015; Perry et al., 2020; Pescosolido et al., 1999), 
although individuals with SUD are disproportionately 
more likely to be perceived as dangerous than those 
with mental illness (P. W. Corrigan et al., 2009; McGinty 
et al., 2015). Importantly, SUD is generally also viewed 
as more controllable than mental illness (P. W. Corrigan 
et al., 2009; Link et al., 1999; McGinty et al., 2015; Perry 
et al., 2020), suggesting that SUD may elicit feelings of 
both fear and anger, which could contribute to its 
increased stigmatization. Given the relative paucity of 
work comparing the affective responses between SUD 
and mental illness, as well by SUD types, future work 
should clarify the affective responses associated with 
distinct SUD conditions and how those contribute to 
their stigmatization.

Other affective responses to mental 
illness and SUD

In addition to fear and anger, a small body of social 
psychological research has examined other affective 
responses, notably disgust and contempt, associated 
with SUD stigma (Boysen et  al., 2023; Fiske, 2012; 
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Nieweglowski et  al., 2019; Sadler et  al., 2015). This 
work has primarily examined SUD stigma through the 
lens of the stereotype content model (Boysen et  al., 
2020, 2023; Fiske, 2012; Görzig & Ryan, 2022; Sadler 
et al., 2012). This model characterizes SUD as among 
the most highly stigmatized conditions, similar to being 
homeless or poor (Sadler et  al., 2012), and demon-
strated that such conditions generally elicit disgust 
(Fiske, 2012; Fiske et  al., 2002). However, there are 
important limitations to this approach. Specifically, 
these models either focus specifically on mental illness 
(Fiske, 2012) or include SUD only in generic terms (e.g., 
“addictions”; Sadler et al., 2012). They therefore lack a 
comprehensive and sufficiently specific framework for 
understanding SUD stigma.

Indeed, other work has shown that SUD activates 
stronger feelings of resentment and contempt but 
weaker feelings of pity (Nieweglowski et  al., 2019). 
However, other than fear and anger, one of the most 
studied affective responses to SUD has been disgust. A 
key finding here is that individuals with SUD (generally 
defined in this work as “addiction”) elicit disgust, 
whereas individuals with depression, anxiety, and eat-
ing disorders are more likely to elicit pity (Boysen et al., 
2023; Fiske, 2012; Sadler et al., 2012). Thus, SUD may 
result in greater rejection, whereas mental illness (e.g., 
depression) may be more tolerated (Fiske, 2012).

One reason for the relatively limited work on affective 
responses associated with SUD stigma might be that 
perceivers are unwilling or unable to identify, label, and/
or distinguish their affective responses toward individu-
als with specific conditions. Indeed, accurately capturing 
the underlying cause of individuals’ behavior is difficult 
from self-report (Nisbett & Wilson, 1977). Because gain-
ing accurate insight into individuals’ affective responses 
is particularly challenging, social psychologists often rely 
on measures of people’s implicit (unconscious) attitudes. 
Indeed, this work has shown that an individual’s explicit 
(conscious) and implicit attitudes toward stigmatized 
groups generally do not agree (Charlesworth & Banaji, 
2019; Dovidio et  al., 1997), and such groups include 
individuals with mental illness (Peris et  al., 2008). 
Specifically, implicit attitudes tend to reflect more nega-
tive bias than explicit attitudes (Charlesworth & Banaji, 
2019) Indeed, some work has shown that implicit and 
explicit attitudes have disparate predictions for progno-
ses and diagnoses of mental illness (Peris et al., 2008), 
suggesting that there are important implications for cor-
rectly characterizing people’s affective attitudes toward 
individuals with mental illness and SUD.

In addition to challenges associated with correctly 
identifying their affective beliefs toward individuals 
with mental illness or SUD, it may be difficult for per-
ceivers to quantify the relative strength of their affective 

responses across conditions (e.g., “I am more afraid of 
X condition than Y”), making it difficult to examine 
whether there are differences between the magnitude 
of negative affective responses to individuals with men-
tal illness and SUD. Moreover, research attempting to 
characterize the affective attitudes that drive mental 
illness or SUD stigma are generally constrained by 
which attitudes are measured (e.g., fear, anger). Thus, 
affective responses that are not measured (e.g., disgust) 
are not characterized because behavioral approaches 
lack the sensitivity to detect them.

Neuroimaging research is well suited to address 
these challenges because the brain regions associated 
with distinct affective responses (e.g., fear, anger, dis-
gust) to stigma have been well characterized (Amodio, 
2014; Amodio & Cikara, 2021). Moreover, these brain 
regions are engaged when participants passively view 
images of stigmatized individuals (Cassidy & Krendl, 
2018; Krendl & Cassidy, 2017; Krendl et  al., 2006), 
which reduces potential constraints associated with 
relying on participants’ self-reports or anticipating the 
affective responses that should be measured. Several 
neuroimaging studies have addressed mental illness and 
SUD stigma (Cassidy & Krendl, 2018; L. T. Harris & 
Fiske, 2006; Krendl et al., 2006, 2009, 2017), providing 
additional insight into the unique affective responses 
that may dissociate mental illness from SUD stigma.

Neuroimaging evidence on affective 
responses is associated with mental 
illness and SUD stigma

Over the past two decades, researchers in the field of 
social neuroscience have identified a set of brain 
regions that underlie stigma, including those underlying 
perceivers’ affective responses (Amodio, 2014; Amodio 
& Cikara, 2021). A key finding across this work is that 
the nature of affective responses differs across stigma-
tized conditions and contexts but generally includes 
emotions such as fear (reflected in heightened activa-
tion in the amygdala) and disgust (reflected in height-
ened activation in the insula; Amodio, 2014; Krendl 
et al., 2006). Affective responses may occur in conjunc-
tion with or separately from controlled processes (e.g., 
mentalizing). Control processes are generally viewed 
as playing an important role in attenuating affective 
responses (Amodio & Cikara, 2021; Denny et al., 2012; 
Van Overwalle, 2009). It is important to note that 
despite some critiques that neuroimaging interpreta-
tions are susceptible to reverse inference, shifts in the 
methodological and analytical approaches in the field 
over the past decade have improved its predictive abil-
ity and rigor, thereby largely mitigating these concerns 
(Poldrack, 2011).
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Dissociating between affective and controlled pro-
cesses is important for two reasons. First, it can reveal 
whether the two processes are separable or concurrent 
(e.g., Dovidio et al., 2000). Second, it can identify the 
specific mechanism underlying SUD stigma. For exam-
ple, if SUD elicits a strong negative affective response 
without an associated cognitive response, interventions 
should target that specific affective response rather than 
try to engage a cognitive response (e.g., regulation, 
perspective-taking). However, if SUD elicits an increased 
cognitive response (e.g., mentalizing), then interven-
tions that promote that response (e.g., perspective-
taking) might be more effective at reducing stigma than 
interventions that target people’s affective responses. 
These interventions typically ask participants to spend 
a few minutes writing about a stigmatized target (e.g., 
describing an average day) from their own perspective 
(e.g., Gloor & Puhl, 2016; Tompkins et al., 2015). For 
example, in one study, participants either (a) watched 
an interview with an expert on children with “gender 
identity disorder” and wrote down what they remem-
bered (control condition) or (b) watched a video about 
a child who was transgender and then wrote a letter 
from the child’s perspective to their parents to disclose 
that they were transgender (perspective-taking; 
Tompkins et al., 2015). In this study, the perspective-
taking condition, relative to the control condition, 
reduced prejudice and decreased desired social 
distance.

Although the preponderance of social neuroscience 
research on stigma has focused on race (Amodio, 2014; 
Amodio & Cikara, 2021), a few studies have examined 
the domain of mental illness (Cassidy & Krendl, 2018; 
Krendl & Cassidy, 2017; Shin et al., 2020) and/or SUD 
(L. T. Harris & Fiske, 2006; Krendl et al., 2009, 2012). 
Because studies that include both mental illness and 
SUD generally group the conditions together, no studies 
have directly compared mental illness with SUD. A gen-
eral finding from neuroimaging work is that passively 
evaluating images of individuals with SUD is associated 
with increased activation in brain regions related to fear 
(Krendl et al., 2009) and disgust (L. T. Harris & Fiske, 
2006; Krendl et al., 2006). Moreover, SUD is detected 
relatively quickly (within one third of a second) and 
elicits a heightened and prolonged negative affective 
response (Krendl et al., 2017). However, there are two 
important caveats to these studies. First, SUD is broadly 
defined in these studies (e.g., alcohol dependence, 
illicit drug use), which may conflate the brain response 
across SUD types. Second, SUD is often grouped 
together with other highly negative stigmatized groups 
(e.g., homeless individuals; L. T. Harris & Fiske, 2006; 
Krendl et al., 2012, 2017), thus potentially biasing the 
neural response.

Prior work examining the neural responses underly-
ing mental illness been yielded mixed findings when 
dissociating different conditions (Cassidy & Krendl, 
2018; Shin et al., 2020). For example, one study found 
increased activation in neural regions associated with 
negative affect (insula) and cognitive control (dorsal 
anterior cingulate) when perceivers evaluated images 
of individuals with mental illness (broadly defined as 
someone with schizophrenia, depression, paranoid dis-
order, or obsessive compulsive disorder; Shin et  al., 
2020). However, another study focused specifically on 
perceivers’ neural response to viewing images of indi-
viduals who were ostensibly depressed and found that 
these images elicited heighted activation in brain 
regions associated with mentalizing (dorsal medial pre-
frontal cortex) but not negative affect (Cassidy & 
Krendl, 2018; Krendl & Cassidy, 2017). One potential 
explanation for these discrepant findings is that some 
studies collapsed data across mental illness conditions 
(Shin et al., 2020), whereas the other studies focused 
specifically on depression (Cassidy & Krendl, 2018; 
Krendl & Cassidy, 2017). This is important because if 
one condition (e.g., schizophrenia) elicits a relatively 
strong neural response but another condition elicits a 
relatively weak response from the same brain region 
(e.g., depression), these would average into a moderate 
negative response. If this is the case, similar discrepan-
cies will likely emerge in SUD research, highlighting 
the need to dissociate by SUD type in future research.

It is also important to note that there is a key meth-
odological difference in the extant neuroimaging 
research on mental illness and that on SUD. Specifically, 
SUD is typically depicted using images of people 
engaged in actions such as consuming alcohol or using 
illicit drugs (Krendl et al., 2009), whereas mental illness 
is typically depicted through labeling (e.g., presenting 
an image of someone with an explicit label about their 
condition). A limitation to this approach is that labels 
(e.g., “schizophrenia,” “depression”) activate negative 
beliefs and attitudes about the condition, which can 
influence the nature and magnitude of stigma (Link 
et al., 1989; Pescosolido & Martin, 2015). For this rea-
son, national surveys examining mental illness and SUD 
stigma often avoid labels (Krendl & Perry, 2022; Perry 
et al., 2020; Pescosolido et al., 1999), relying instead 
on vignette approaches to provide more direct mea-
sures of stigma. In a striking example of the power of 
labels on brain activity, one neuroimaging study arbi-
trarily labeled individuals as suffering from depression 
or migraines by placing images of faces on differently 
colored backgrounds that had ostensible diagnostic 
meaning (Cassidy & Krendl, 2018). Although this pair-
ing was arbitrary, the labels altered people’s basic men-
tal representations of depression. Thus, these differences 
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may also play an important role in accurately character-
izing the neural response underlying mental illness and 
SUD stigma.

Future directions

Together, the neuroimaging studies on mental illness and 
SUD stigma suggest that there is a powerful affective 
response to mental illness and SUD, which may be par-
ticularly pronounced for SUD. However, future work 
should examine different SUD conditions separately to 
disentangle the magnitude and mechanism of this response. 
Moreover, concurrent behavioral work that extends beyond 
focusing specifically on anger and fear may shed additional 
light on the affective responses associated with SUD. 
However, it will be important for this and related work to 
discriminate between SUD conditions.

Reducing negative attitudes toward stigmatized 
groups is challenging, but some emerging work sug-
gests that targeting structural stigma may be an impor-
tant step toward shifting those attitudes. For example, 
several studies have shown that legalizing same-sex 
marriage was associated with widespread reductions in 
explicit and implicit antigay bias (Flores & Barclay, 
2016; Ofosu et al., 2019). U.S. Supreme Court decisions 
regarding racial desegregation, interracial marriage, 
rights to birth control, and same-sex marriage have also 
been associated with subsequent shifts in public opin-
ion supporting these previously controversial rights 
(Marshall, 1987; Ofosu et  al., 2019). Although the 
Supreme Court is one mechanism through which struc-
tural shifts can occur, it is important to note that public 
opinion does not always align with the Supreme Court’s 
decisions (Adamczyk et  al., 2020; Marshall, 1987). 
Alternatively, other structural factors, such as the media 
and policy changes (e.g., legalizing marijuana use or 
same-sex marriage), can also positively influence public 
attitudes (Ofosu et al., 2019; Stringer & Maggard, 2016).

An important takeaway from this section is that 
because mental illness and SUD elicit distinct affective 
responses, their respective stigma-reduction efforts 
should be distinct and separable. In other words, efforts 
to classify SUD as a mental illness (e.g., through 
Diagnostic and Statistical Manual of Mental Disorders 
criteria or education) may backfire by increasing stigma 
toward non-SUD mental illnesses or by reducing the 
credibility of the messaging. These findings also suggest 
that efforts to shift these affective responses should 
leverage approaches that are effective for changing 
people’s attitudes. Borrowing from the social psycho-
logical research, persuasion can be effective in shifting 
attitudes and changing behavior, particularly when 
framed in a personally relevant manner (Petty & 
Cacioppo, 1986; Petty et al., 1981).

Developing models of the affective responses that 
mediate the relationship between beliefs and SUD 
stigma is an important avenue for classifying and attenu-
ating discriminatory responses toward these individuals. 
In service of this goal, in the next section, we consider 
interventions that may target the beliefs and affective 
responses that drive mental illness and SUD stigma.

Developing Interventions That Are 
Effective in Reducing Stigma Toward 
Mental Illness and SUD

The extensive cross-disciplinary research examining 
interventions that reduce mental illness and SUD stigma 
have yielded mixed findings (Alexander & Link, 2003; 
Chiesa & Serretti, 2014; P. Corrigan et al., 2017; P. W. 
Corrigan et  al., 2012; Couture & Penn, 2003; Donker 
et al., 2009; Griffiths et al., 2014; Livingston et al., 2012; 
Maunder & White, 2019; Morgan et al., 2018; Thornicroft 
et al., 2016; Yanos et al., 2015). Although these studies 
have identified strategies that may be effective in reduc-
ing stigma, notably psychoeducation (Donker et  al., 
2009) and intergroup contact (Alexander & Link, 2003; 
P. W. Corrigan et al., 2012; Maunder & White, 2019), 
they have had limited success (Krendl & Perry, 2022; 
Maunder & White, 2019; McGinty et  al., 2015, 2018; 
Morgan et al., 2018; Paluck et al., 2019). Possible rea-
sons include relatively small sample sizes, unnaturalistic 
manipulations, and inconsistencies in terminology (e.g., 
contact with an individual “with mental illness” versus 
contact with an individual with depression; Mehta et al., 
2015; Perry et  al., 2022; Thornicroft et  al., 2016). 
However, weak intervention results may also suggest 
that we need to design more effective methods for 
reducing stigma for all mental illness and SUD types.

An additional limitation in this work is that it has gener-
ally focused on stigma reduction as the primary outcome, 
largely overlooking the mechanisms by which stigma is 
reduced (Thornicroft et al., 2016). This focus may explain, 
at least in part, why stigma reductions are observed in the 
short term but are less evident in the long term (Morgan 
et al., 2018; Thornicroft et al., 2016). Relatedly, these stud-
ies generally focus on reducing public stigma (P. W. 
Corrigan et al., 2012; Couture & Penn, 2003; Morgan et al., 
2018; Parcesepe & Cabassa, 2013) and, to a lesser extent, 
self-stigma (Birtel et al., 2017; Yanos et al., 2015), but they 
focus only to a limited extent on structural stigma (Haugen 
et al., 2017; Lien et al., 2021).

Using psychoeducation to reduce 
mental illness stigma

Psychoeducational interventions involve providing fac-
tual information about mental illness or SUD to 
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contradict prevalent but inaccurate beliefs about the 
conditions. Such interventions range from emphasizing 
the negative impact that stigma has on the lives of 
people with SUD or mental illness to providing infor-
mation about how to interact with or support individu-
als with mental illness or SUD (Bielenberg et al., 2021; 
P. W. Corrigan et al., 2012; Morgan et al., 2018). One of 
the most common approaches in psychoeducation 
interventions is to educate individuals about the bio-
logical causes of stigmatized disorders (P. W. Corrigan 
et al., 2017; Kvaale et al., 2013). In these cases, psycho-
education can reduce perceptions of controllability by 
reframing mental illness or SUD as diseases rather than 
as a temporary emotional state or a lapse in control. 
Here, psychoeducation may be optimal when applied 
to illnesses that are stigmatized for their controllability 
but not for other reasons (e.g., their perceived danger-
ousness). Indeed, psychoeducation has been consis-
tently shown to improve mental health literacy (Mehta 
et al., 2015; Phelan et al., 2000), suggesting that it meets 
its narrow goal of increasing knowledge of biomedical 
causes of mental illness and SUD. However, an impor-
tant caveat to reducing perceptions of controllability is 
that this can also inadvertently reduce perceptions of 
changeability, as discussed in the second section 
(Lebowitz & Appelbaum, 2017). We will revisit this 
point shortly.

On the whole, results are mixed with respective to 
the effectiveness of psychoeducation in reducing men-
tal illness stigma (P. W. Corrigan et al., 2012; Donker 
et al., 2009; Henderson et al., 2014; Kvaale et al., 2013), 
and relatively little work has examined its effect on SUD 
stigma (Bielenberg et al., 2021; P. W. Corrigan et al., 
2017; Livingston et al., 2012). For example, one study 
found that psychoeducation was effective only in reduc-
ing mental health stigma among health-care profession-
als if they had minimal or no mental health training 
(Henderson et al., 2014). Health-care professionals may 
already have higher mental health literacy than the 
general population and thus may not benefit from addi-
tional education. In fact, a recent national survey found 
that health-care professionals are more likely to attri-
bute SUD to biological factors (e.g., genetics)—suggest-
ing better literacy—but have similar levels of SUD 
stigma as the general population (Hamilton et al., 2023). 
Meta-analyses have found that psychoeducation is 
effective in reducing mental illness stigma for adoles-
cents but is less effective for adults (P. W. Corrigan 
et al., 2012). Moreover, when these interventions are 
effective for adults, their medium- to long-term stigma-
reduction effects persist primarily for family members 
of individuals with mental illness (Morgan et al., 2018). 
Another meta-analysis found that psychoeducation did 
not reduce mental health stigma (Kvaale et al., 2013) 

and, in some cases, receiving this intervention was 
associated with higher stigma (Kvaale et  al., 2013; 
Larkings & Brown, 2018). With respect to SUD stigma, 
one meta-analysis found that psychoeducation was 
more effective in reducing SUD stigma when paired 
with other (e.g., contact-based) interventions (Livingston 
et al., 2012), whereas a more recent meta-analysis found 
that contact-based, but not psychoeducation, interven-
tions were effective in reducing SUD stigma (Bielenberg 
et al., 2021). Regardless, a key takeaway is that psycho-
education interventions alone are likely not effective 
in reducing SUD stigma. If they are used, they should 
be paired with other interventions, such as contact-
based interventions.

One possibility for these nuanced and conflicting 
results may be that psychoeducation targets only some 
of the mechanisms underlying public stigma. Specifically, 
although psychoeducation may reduce beliefs about 
controllability underlying mental illness or SUD stigma, 
it may not address other stigma-related beliefs. For 
example, some work has shown that psychoeducation 
can reduce the blame that targets place on individuals 
with mental illness, thereby reducing beliefs about the 
perceived controllability of their illness (Kvaale et al., 
2013). If that is the case, it may be effective in reducing 
stigma only when it is driven by controllability but not 
when other beliefs (e.g., beliefs about dangerousness 
or disruptiveness) influence perceptions. Moreover, 
shifting beliefs about controllability can reduce percep-
tions that the condition is changeable, which can limit 
support for treatment and increase stigma (Lebowitz & 
Appelbaum, 2017). Because SUD is generally perceived 
as more changeable than mental illness (P. W. Corrigan 
et al., 2006; Perry et al., 2020), psychoeducation inter-
ventions that threaten its perceived changeability could 
potentially backfire and should be used with caution.

The impact of psychoeducation on reducing self-
stigma has been less widely studied. However, social 
psychological research posits that framing these inter-
ventions in a way that maximizes their personal rele-
vance would be critical to their success (Petty & 
Cacioppo, 1986; Petty et al., 1981). There are several 
ways to do this, including by pairing psychoeducation 
with biographies or testimonials from other individuals 
(e.g., famous people) who have undergone treatment. 
Prior studies employing this strategy have had varying 
degrees of success in reducing stigma (Alvidrez et al., 
2009; Griffiths et al., 2004). One reason is that including 
testimonials from individuals with whom participants 
cannot easily identify (e.g., celebrities) may minimize 
the effectiveness of the messaging (Terry & Hogg, 1996; 
White et al., 2009). One study found that Black men 
were more receptive to psychoeducation when it was 
paired with biographies of Black men who had sought 
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mental health treatment that when it was paired with 
an information-only control text, although some 
nuances emerged in this work (Alvidrez et  al., 2009; 
Griffiths et al., 2004). Another study found that male-
targeted brochures improved men’s attitudes toward 
help-seeking and reduced stigma to the greatest extent, 
likely because this framing was the most accessible 
(Hammer & Vogel, 2010).

Together, these studies suggest that psychoeducation 
can be beneficial but should be used with caution, espe-
cially for SUD, given its mixed and sometimes detrimen-
tal effects on stigma. In general, interventions that target 
a broad array of negative beliefs and emotions surround-
ing stigmatized disorders are likely to be maximally 
effective. Moreover, psychoeducation may be more effec-
tive in reducing SUD stigma when paired with other 
(e.g., contact-based) interventions (Livingston et  al., 
2012), although additional work is needed to evaluate 
whether psychoeducation is effective on the basis of the 
specific condition type. This kind of foundational work 
is critical for informing stigma-reduction education that 
avoids unintended negative consequences.

Using intergroup contact to reduce 
mental illness and SUD stigma

One of the most widely studied strategies for reducing 
mental illness and SUD stigma is intergroup contact 
(Bielenberg et  al., 2021; P. W. Corrigan et  al., 2012; 
Couture & Penn, 2003; Mehta et al., 2015). The premise 
of intergroup contact is that nonstigmatized individuals 
will experience reduced stigma after they have a posi-
tive interaction with a member of a stigmatized group 
(Pettigrew et  al., 2011). Intergroup contact has been 
widely shown to reduce stigma across multiple domains, 
including race, age, and sexual orientation (Allport, 
1954; Pettigrew & Tropp, 2006; Sherif, 1966), although 
more recent work raises questions about the magnitude 
of its effects (Paluck et al., 2019). Intergroup contact 
increases knowledge about the stigmatized group, 
reduces anxiety, and increases empathy toward mem-
bers of the stigmatized group (Pettigrew & Tropp, 
2008). It also normalizes the stigmatized condition, 
which may make it more socially acceptable (Ata et al., 
2009; Cameron et al., 2011; Turner et al., 2008). Although 
not directly examined, intergroup contact may also be 
effective in reducing stigma because it reduces con-
cerns about dangerousness and/or disruptiveness.

The impact of intergroup contact on mental illness 
stigma has been examined both as a basic research 
question (e.g., through laboratory studies) and as a 
potential intervention tool (e.g., through randomized 
controlled trials; Bielenberg et al., 2021; P. W. Corrigan 
et al., 2012, 2017; Couture & Penn, 2003; Maunder & 

White, 2019; Mehta et al., 2015). With respect to mental 
illness, laboratory research introduces contact in two 
key ways: through experimental manipulations (e.g., 
using in-person interactions or videos) or through self-
reports of previous contact (for reviews, see P. W. 
Corrigan et al., 2012; Couture & Penn, 2003). Overall, 
these studies suggest that contact reduces mental illness 
stigma, but the magnitude of these effects is highly 
variable and important nuances emerge across studies. 
For example, one review found that in-person contact 
is more effective in reducing mental illness stigma than 
video-based contact (P. W. Corrigan et  al., 2012). 
However, another review found that in-person and 
video-based contact have similar effects on reducing 
mental illness stigma, although it is unclear whether 
these effects persist over time (Maunder & White, 2019). 
Some experimental work has found that in-person con-
tact reduces stigma for individuals with relatively high 
mental health concerns (Desforges et  al., 1991), but 
other studies have found that contact reduced mental 
illness stigma only when individuals liked the person 
with whom they interacted (Stelzmann et  al., 2021). 
One of the few studies on SUD stigma (specifically, 
cocaine addiction) found that contact did not shift 
stigma (P. W. Corrigan et al., 2001).

Observational studies have found that negative 
beliefs about mental illness (e.g., perceived dangerous-
ness) are lower among individuals who self-report hav-
ing previously interacted with an individual with mental 
illness (Couture & Penn, 2003), although these studies 
do not dissociate between the frequency and quality of 
contact, which could have dissociable effects on stigma. 
The few studies examining the effect of contact on SUD 
stigma have similarly measured contact via self-report, 
although results have been mixed. A recent national 
study found that previous contact reduced SUD stigma, 
the most pronounced effects being for health-care pro-
viders (Hamilton et al., 2023). Another study found that 
stigma toward opioid use disorder was lower among 
individuals who had previously been in contact with 
an individual with opioid use disorder (Gourley & 
Krendl, 2023). However, another study found that prior 
contact was associated with greater SUD stigma 
(Kennedy-Hendricks et al., 2017). One potential expla-
nation for these discrepancies is that observational 
approaches discount everyday experiences that might 
exacerbate or attenuate stigma, such as the quality and 
strength of an individual’s relationship with individuals 
with SUD (Perry et al., 2022).

Empirical work on interventions leveraging inter-
group contact have incorporated mental illness and SUD 
stigma but again yielded mixed findings. A randomized 
controlled trial with college students found that higher 
levels of direct contact (e.g., having a discussion or 
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engaging in a cooperative task) yielded greater reduc-
tions in mental illness stigma than video-based contact 
(Gao & Ng, 2021). Larger scale interventions, such as 
Time to Change in England, found that antistigma events 
promoted contact and reduced negative behavioral 
intentions but did not increase individuals’ willingness 
to disclose their own mental health concerns (Evans-
Lacko, London, et al., 2012). Contact interventions have 
been less widely studied for SUD, although the few that 
have emerged have focused primarily on health-care 
providers (Bielenberg et al., 2021; Gourley & Krendl, 
2023; Kennedy-Hendricks et al., 2017). A recent review 
of these interventions found that contact was effective 
in reducing SUD stigma among health-care providers 
(Bielenberg et al., 2021). Future work should expand 
this work to the general population.

In everyday life, the duration and quality of the con-
tact in one’s personal network cannot be experimentally 
controlled. This is important because a central tenet of 
intergroup contact is that it must be prolonged, positive, 
and with someone who is of equal status (Allport, 
1954). For individuals interacting with family members 
who suffer from SUD, contact may result in negative or 
burdensome experiences that reduce its effectiveness. 
Indeed, as mentioned earlier, a recent study found that 
individuals with SUD are disproportionately identified 
as more likely to cause problems in personal social 
networks (Railey et al., 2023), suggesting that everyday 
experiences may overshadow the impact of a contact 
intervention. Similarly, health-care workers whose con-
tact is limited to clinical settings may see someone with 
SUD at their worst (resulting in a negative interaction). 
This disparity could explain, at least in part, why some 
studies have found that contact is effective only in 
reducing health-care providers’ stigma when it is with 
friends or family members with mental illness (Henderson 
et al., 2014).

An important logistical barrier of implementing con-
tact-based interventions outside of the laboratory is that 
may not be feasible at a large scale because they are 
resource intensive to implement (but see Pescosolido 
et al., 2020). Efforts to circumvent this barrier include 
using imagined (vs. actual) contact (Dovidio et  al., 
2011), which has, in some cases, been associated with 
lower mental illness stigma (Brown et al., 2010; Maunder 
& White, 2019). However, imagined contact has not 
been shown to be effective for all groups (Vinson et al., 
2016), raising questions about its generalizability and 
potential impact, particularly for SUD.

Another limitation to implementing intergroup con-
tact interventions in real-world settings is that individu-
als who are most likely to engage in contact are those 
whose level of stigma is already relatively low (Vogel 
et al., 2007). A recent study presented an interesting 

approach to this problem. The study was a campus-
wide intervention implemented over a 2-year period 
and designed to reduce stigma by promoting mental 
health awareness (Pescosolido et al., 2020). Using pre-
test–posttest measures of stigma, the researchers found 
that the intervention was associated with an 11% to 14% 
decrease across multiple domains of stigma. Moreover, 
mere passive exposure to the intervention (e.g., aware-
ness of but not necessarily engagement with the cam-
paign) predicted reductions in stigma. Interestingly, 
stigma reduction was associated with more intergroup 
contact. Critically, having more positive perceptions of 
the campus culture mediated the relationship between 
contact and stigma reduction (Manago & Krendl, 2023).

Finally, a unique challenge to reducing SUD stigma 
via intergroup contact is that SUD stigma is generally 
viewed as relatively socially acceptable in society (P. 
Corrigan, 2004), which may make it more resistant to 
change. In contrast, much of what we know about the 
strong, positive impact of intergroup contact in general 
comes from research on interactions between racial 
groups, where stigma and discrimination is largely non-
normative. Shifting beliefs about what is considered 
normative behavior may therefore be an important strat-
egy for increasing the public’s willingness to engage in 
meaningful and prolonged social contact with individu-
als with mental illness or SUD. In the next section, we 
consider shifting social norms as a potential alternative 
intervention strategy for reducing stigma.

Using a social-norms approach to 
promote contact with individuals with 
mental illness and SUD

Social norms refer to the implicit and explicit rules a 
group has about acceptable values, behaviors, and 
beliefs of its members. In essence, social norms are the 
unwritten rules that tell us how to behave in certain 
situations. Classic research in the field of social psychol-
ogy has shown that people tend to conform to social 
norms (Asch, 1956; Cialdini & Goldstein, 2004; Milgram 
et al., 1969; Sherif, 1936) because doing so promotes 
social acceptance (Chartrand & Bargh, 1999; Cialdini & 
Goldstein, 2004). Several decades of social psychologi-
cal research have shown that changing social norms is 
a highly effective way to alter behavior (Agostinelli 
et  al., 1995; Larimer et  al., 2004; Reno et  al., 1993; 
Schultz et al., 2008; Steffian, 1999), including reducing 
stigma (Blanchard et al., 1994; Stangor et al., 2001; Zitek 
& Hebl, 2007).

A broad literature has used a social-norms approach 
to change health behaviors, such as reducing binge 
drinking on college campuses. Here, a social-norms 
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approach would involve changing students’ perceptions 
about normative drinking behavior, or what is consid-
ered acceptable amounts of alcohol to consume 
(Agostinelli et al., 1995; Borsari & Carey, 2003; Larimer 
et  al., 2004; Steffian, 1999). For example, Agostinelli 
and colleagues (1995) randomly assigned heavy drink-
ers on college campuses to receive (or not to receive) 
personal feedback about their own alcohol consump-
tion relative to the average number of drinks consumed 
by other students on campus. The feedback condition 
was designed to shift students’ perceived social norms 
about what constituted acceptable drinking behavior 
among their peers and resulted in their consuming less 
alcohol relative to individuals in the no-feedback 
condition.

Other studies have used a social-norms approach to 
reduce stigma (Blanchard et al., 1994; Stangor et  al., 
2001; Zitek & Hebl, 2007). This work leverages the 
theory that people’s beliefs and behaviors are strongly 
linked to the perceived beliefs and behaviors of others 
(Berkowitz, 2003). Individuals who perceive that others 
hold negative beliefs about people with mental illness 
or SUD (i.e., that stigmatization is normative) are them-
selves more likely to reject and devalue those groups. 
Thus, some interventions attempt to portray stigmatiza-
tion as nonnormative using exposure to people express-
ing positive views or having positive experiences of 
people with stigmatized conditions (Botha et al., 2017). 
For example, Stangor and colleagues (2001) found that 
when people were told that their use of stereotypes 
about Black individuals was higher than the norm, they 
stereotyped them less. However, an important caveat 
to this finding is that people also increased their use 
of stereotypes when they were told that their reliance 
on stereotypes was lower than the norm. This work has 
also been applied to reducing mental illness stigma by 
using videos that depict friends and family members of 
people with mental illness describing their positive 
experiences with loved ones (Botha et al., 2017; Hackler 
et  al., 2016). An important benefit of a social-norms 
approach is that it has been shown to have a long-
lasting impact on stigma reduction (Stangor et al., 2001; 
Zitek & Hebl, 2007), so this may be an important area 
for future work.

Shifting social norms may explain why self-stigma is 
reduced when people in recovery interact with peers 
who have also experienced a mental illness or SUD 
(Yanos et al., 2015). For example, there is a small but 
growing line of research examining the work of peer 
educators or specialists, whose aim is to increase treat-
ment engagement and reduce self-stigma by normal-
izing mental illness experiences. Peer specialists are 
individuals who have themselves experienced mental 
illness, and their role is to support and educate 

individuals in treatment for mental illness for the first 
time or who are experiencing acute periods of distress 
(Repper & Carter, 2011). Peer specialists are trained to 
take a holistic and patient-centered view of mental ill-
ness that normalizes human suffering, locating its 
causes outside the individual (e.g., in experiences of 
trauma), rather than emphasizing a biomedical perspec-
tive that treats it as abnormal (Barlott et  al., 2020; 
Davidson & Roe, 2007). Many of these programs have 
been found to reduce internalized stigma among par-
ticipants, although research is not conclusive (Burke 
et al., 2019; S. A. McKinnon et al., 2019). It is likely that 
peer programs reduce stigma (a) by reframing mental 
distress to normalize it and locate responsibility in 
external social environments and (b) by reducing 
stigma-related beliefs about people with mental illness 
through meaningful social contact with individuals with 
the same or a similar diagnosis. Although the question 
of whether peer educators could improve treatment-
seeking for individuals with SUD has been largely unex-
plored, future work should consider this possibility. An 
important caveat to peer educator approaches is that 
they are resource intensive. A more scalable alternative 
may be using peer-led groups to reduce stigma—an 
approach that has been found to be effective in a hand-
ful of studies (Bulanda et al., 2014).

Perhaps the most systematic and scalable approach 
to changing social norms might be through a social 
network intervention, although this approach has not 
been leveraged to reduce stigma. Network interventions 
are defined as “purposeful efforts to use social networks 
or social network data to generate social influence, 
accelerate behavior change, improve performance, and/
or achieve desirable outcomes among individuals, com-
munities, organizations, or populations” (Valente, 2012, 
p. 49). Typically, network interventions have one of two 
novel features. On one hand, they may use social net-
work analysis to identify the key players or community 
opinion leaders who are in the best structural position 
to maximize dissemination of new social norms and 
behavior change and then make them change agents. 
On the other hand, they may enlist dyads or groups to 
engage in behavioral or normative change together to 
exert social regulation and produce social rewards 
(Latkin & Knowlton, 2015; Valente, 2012). In both cases, 
these individuals model behavior, provide social sup-
port, and engage in verbal persuasion regarding norma-
tive attitudes, beliefs, and behaviors. Some existing 
effective interventions employ strategic disclosure of 
one’s condition to reduce public stigma and to empower 
people with mental illness and SUD (P. W. Corrigan & 
Rao, 2012; Kundert & Corrigan, 2021; Modelli et  al., 
2021). These interventions could be scaled up, multiply-
ing their impact, by integrating a network intervention 
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approach that incorporates allies as change agents to 
alter the normative social context. By saturating their 
personal social networks with information and modify-
ing social norms, change agents could reinforce the 
positive potential of their own social environment to 
support sustained perceptual and behavioral change 
toward loved ones experiencing mental illness or SUD.

There are several key takeaways from the literature 
reviewed in this section. First, shifting social norms is 
at least one mechanism by which intergroup contact 
reduces stigma. Second, although contact is highly 
effective in reducing stigma, there are several practical 
and logistical barriers that make it difficult to implement 
on a large scale. Third, interventions that focus on shift-
ing social norms (with the goal of promoting contact) 
may be effective workarounds to these barriers, espe-
cially if employed in the context of a network interven-
tion that leverages people’s natural social connections 
to disseminate normative change.

Emphasizing recovery to reduce 
mental illness and SUD stigma

Given our earlier discussions about the role of change-
ability in SUD stigma, another intriguing intervention 
strategy for reducing SUD stigma is to emphasize recov-
ery. As previously discussed, some work suggests that 
SUD is viewed as a changeable condition (P. W. Corrigan 
et al., 2006; Pachankis et al., 2018; Perry et al., 2020), 
and these beliefs may be reinforced by media depic-
tions of people with untreated and active SUD that 
transmit the message that addiction is permanent and 
untreatable (McGinty et  al., 2019). These ingrained 
beliefs seem to be relatively impervious to manipula-
tions that try to reduce blame (e.g., through psycho-
education). Rather than directly challenging 
controllability beliefs to reduce blame, an alternative 
approach is to accept the belief and emphasize recov-
ery (changeability) instead.

Prior work suggests that no longer having a condi-
tion reduces negative attitudes toward people in for-
merly stigmatized categories (Black et al., 2014; Hoyt 
et al., 2019). Additionally, survey experiments compar-
ing public attitudes toward a vignette character who 
either is an active substance user or is being success-
fully treated for addiction found significantly higher 
levels of stigma toward the former group (Krendl & 
Perry, 2022; McGinty et al., 2015; Phillips & Shaw, 2013). 
A recent study used a vignette-based approach to char-
acterize the nature and magnitude of stigma toward 
four different SUD types among a nationally representa-
tive group of U.S. adults, some of whom were depicted 
as active users, others as being in active recovery 
(Krendl & Perry, 2022). The results showed that stigma 

was consistently lower when individuals were described 
as in recovery compared with when they were described 
as actively using drugs.

Recovery also had a stronger effect in reducing 
stigma toward illicit substances (e.g., methamphet-
amine) than legal substances (e.g., alcohol). Moreover, 
recovery had particularly pronounced effects on 
respondents’ willingness to interact with the target indi-
vidual in the workplace or willingness to have them 
marry into the family—both key domains in which SUD 
stigma has been shown to be particularly pronounced 
(Krendl & Perry, 2022; Perry et al., 2020). Specifically, 
more than two thirds of respondents indicated that they 
would be unwilling to work with someone who has an 
active dependence, but only a quarter of respondents 
indicated that same unwillingness if the individual were 
in recovery. Together, these results suggest that empha-
sizing recovery may be an effective strategy for reduc-
ing SUD stigma.

An important caveat to emphasizing recovery is that 
it could have the unintended consequence of exacerbat-
ing stigma by increasing perceptions that individuals 
with SUD are responsible for their addiction. Thus, this 
framing may be more effective in reducing self-stigma 
(by improving individuals’ self-efficacy) but could exac-
erbate public and structural stigma (by exacerbating 
controllability beliefs). Future work should examine 
these possibilities and identify the costs and benefits 
of messaging that emphasizes recovery from SUD.

Leveraging social and health policy to 
reduce mental illness and SUD stigma

An alternative to individual-focused interventions and 
approaches to reducing the stigma associated with men-
tal illness and SUD is to eliminate the social, organiza-
tional, and policy conditions that create and reinforce 
stigma at the macro level. For example, a recent meta-
analysis found that psychotherapies with Black youth 
were less effective in states with higher levels of struc-
tural racism, suggesting that structural racism disrupts 
the efficacy of interventions (Price et al., 2022). Thus, 
intervening with people who express stigmatizing 
views (i.e., public stigma) and attempting to prevent 
stigmatizing attitudes and discriminatory practices by 
targeting health and social policy change (i.e., structural 
stigma) are both critical for successfully reducing men-
tal illness and SUD stigma. Simply put, these two levers 
of stigma reduction are not independent—public and 
structural stigma are mutually reinforcing (McGinty & 
White, 2022).

Promoting policies that eliminate structural barriers 
to treatment and support harm-reduction initiatives is 
a promising direction for reducing public stigma 
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(McGinty et al., 2018). Indeed, a study of 14 European 
countries found that mental illness stigma was lower 
among individuals who lived in countries that had 
lower public stigma and greater access to information 
about mental health (Evans-Lacko, Brohan, et al., 2012). 
However, an important caveat to this work is that a 
preponderance of the cross-cultural studies on mental 
illness stigma have been conducted in relatively high-
income countries (Guzmán et al., 2019). Structural bar-
riers may be even more pronounced in lower income 
countries that have fewer resources to support mental 
health treatment. Regardless, reducing structural stigma 
likely contributes to stigma reduction and should be 
considered in future work. Major funding initiatives are 
needed to address persistent barriers experienced by 
people with mental illness and SUD, including inade-
quate insurance coverage, health provider shortages, 
and lack of access to evidence-based treatments (e.g., 
office-based MOUD) and support programs ( Judge 
David L. Bazelon Center for Mental Health Law, 2011; 
Mental Health America, 2016; National Alliance on 
Mental Illness, 2015). At the same time, harm-reduction 
strategies can be implemented to reduce the negative 
consequences of drug use (Marlatt et al., 2011). Effective 
harm-reduction strategies include syringe exchange 
programs, safe injection sites, and widespread naloxone 
distribution. These policies have been shown to increase 
engagement with treatment, promote recovery and 
community integration, reduce HIV and hepatitis trans-
mission, and save lives (Abdul-Quader et  al., 2013; 
Potier et al., 2014; Ritter & Cameron, 2006).

Research on policy feedback suggests that the enact-
ment of public policies has a significant influence on 
public stigma (Pierson, 1993). Policies that mandate 
equity (e.g., insurance coverage parity for physical and 
mental health services) or promote harm-reduction ini-
tiatives send strong messages to the public about the 
worthiness of the targeted population. This effect has 
been shown in myriad work, including recent studies 
showing that the legalization of same-sex marriage was 
associated with widespread reductions in antigay bias 
(Flores & Barclay, 2016; Ofosu et al., 2019). The limited 
work on the effects of policy on attitudes toward SUD 
has focused on marijuana use, finding that its legalization 
has been associated with shifts toward more positive 
attitudes, but primarily for medical (not recreational) use 
(Tanco et al., 2019). Together, these studies suggest that 
public policies and programs may shift social norms, 
conveying that people with mental illness or SUD 
deserve equal access to resources and that their lives are 
valuable (Livingston, 2020). Likewise, policies that 
reduce barriers to treatment highlight structural factors 
that contribute to negative outcomes, including those 
that inhibit recovery, that must be addressed at the macro 

level. This kind of policy shifts blame for treatment 
delays, relapses, and other adverse consequences (e.g., 
unemployment, homelessness) to the treatment system 
or to broader gaps in the health and social safety net 
(Cheetham et al., 2022; McGinty et al., 2017).

Another critical policy shift that is needed to reduce 
SUD stigma, especially among health-care workers, per-
tains to laws regulating MOUDs (Cheetham et al., 2022). 
Methadone is administered daily under the supervision 
of a pharmacist or clinician on site at a clinic. Takeaway 
doses are typically not permitted or, in some countries, 
allowed only after a significant period of treatment 
stability. Methadone treatment has been labeled “liquid 
handcuffs” because of its impact on patients’ daily lives 
(e.g., constraints on employment, travel) and is associ-
ated with high levels of stigma (Smith, 2011). The strict 
regulations associated with such programs frame 
patients with SUD as inherently untrustworthy, untreat-
able, and likely to engage in criminal diversion (Anstice 
et  al., 2009; Fraser & Valentine, 2008; J. Harris & 
McElrath, 2012). Moreover, segregating SUD treatment 
in special clinics outside the normal treatment system 
may lead to patients’ being identified by community 
members (e.g., in clinic parking lots or in line for 
MOUD). Instead, providing treatment in primary care 
and other general health-care settings is preferred 
because it reduces the stigmatizing belief that SUD is 
a moral failing and fundamentally distinct from other 
chronic health conditions (Adams & Volkow, 2020).

In sum, policy approaches are especially promising 
because they have the potential to prevent stigma 
among future generations. That is, attitudes, values, 
beliefs, and behaviors are to a great extent shaped by 
macro-level social structures that send implicit mes-
sages about which groups do and do not have social 
worth. These strategies are also powerful because they 
target policy implementation that theoretically affects 
millions of people simultaneously, including those with 
SUD (i.e., self-stigma) and without (i.e., public stigma). 
In contrast, other approaches described above require 
intervention with individuals and are thus costly and 
difficult to scale up for widespread social change. 
Future research should more rigorously empirically 
examine (e.g., using causal modeling) the impact of 
state and local policy change on self- and public stigma 
to identify which kinds of policies have the greatest 
impact and through which mechanisms.

Despite the promise of policy changes around SUD 
and mental illness, however, a major challenge is that 
the will and ability to make such changes is influenced 
by public opinion. Research consistently finds that indi-
viduals with higher levels of public stigma have lower 
support for enacting and implementing a wide variety 
of laws and programs that benefit people with mental 
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illness and SUD, including parity in insurance coverage, 
harm-reduction programs, MOUD expansion, and gov-
ernment spending on health and social services for 
these populations (Barry et al., 2014; Cheetham et al., 
2022; McGinty et  al., 2018; McGinty & White, 2022; 
Sumnall et al., 2023). Stigma also strongly shapes sup-
port for punitive criminal-justice-focused approaches 
to the problem of SUD over public health strategies to 
address addiction (Kennedy-Hendricks et  al., 2017). 
Hence, policy change strategies present an uphill battle 
in which advocacy groups, lawmakers, and other public 
officials at the national, state, and local levels will need 
to push for new approaches without widespread public 
support, at least initially.

Future directions

In this section, we reviewed the main types of interven-
tions that have been implemented in efforts to reduce 
SUD and mental illness stigma. We have also briefly 
considered potential mechanisms by which these inter-
ventions might be effective (e.g., shifting social norms), 
as well as additional strategies that may be beneficial 
in reducing SUD stigma (e.g., emphasizing recovery).

Given these findings, focusing solely on psychoeduca-
tion or intergroup contact to reduce SUD stigma may be 
ineffective. Campaigns or narratives that emphasize 
recovery and/or leverage social connections to change 
behavior or perceptions may be best suited to reducing 
SUD stigma (e.g., Walsh et al., 2023). One potential tool 
could be public service announcements, which, on their 
own, have been the focus of much debate in the mental 
health and SUD stigma literature (P. Corrigan & Gelb, 
2006; P. W. Corrigan, 2012; Iles et al., 2017; McGinty et al., 
2018). Public messaging around SUD and mental illness 
is critical for both reducing stigma and promoting treat-
ment seeking, but the framing of the messaging is critical 
(McGinty & Barry, 2020; McGinty et al., 2018). For exam-
ple, messages that emphasize recovery could reduce self-
stigma (by improving individuals’ self-efficacy) but 
exacerbate public and structural stigma (by exacerbating 
controllability beliefs). If so, messaging should be directed 
to individuals with SUD and not incorporated in broad 
national campaigns. Future work should identify the costs 
and benefits of messaging that emphasizes recovery from 
SUD. An additional consideration in this work should be 
whether messaging ought to vary across SUD types.

SUD public stigma may need to be addressed through 
a multipronged approach that simultaneously focuses 
on beliefs about its controllability, changeability, treat-
ability, and dangerousness. For example, introducing 
contact through social networks (e.g., by targeting 
change agents or microinfluencers in smaller communi-
ties) may have the combined benefit of shifting social 

norms and reducing perceptions of dangerousness 
about an individual with SUD. Cultivating communities 
of support for stigma reduction across multiple contexts 
will require a coordinated combination of workplace 
and school-based programs (e.g., U Bring Change to 
Mind), social-contact-based individual and network 
interventions deployed by advocacy groups or treat-
ment programs, and public information dissemination. 
No one approach is likely to be effective given the 
complex and multifactorial cognitive and affective 
underpinnings of stigma. Future work should also con-
sider the desired target audience for stigma-reduction 
efforts given that interventions may vary in effective-
ness for different populations, including health-care 
professionals, friends and family members of people 
with SUD, adolescents, and adults.

Although not widely explored in the SUD stigma 
literature, using person-first language may be another 
way to reduce stigma (McGinty & Barry, 2020). Person-
first language, which places the individual before their 
condition, has been widely adopted by journals focus-
ing on SUD (Broyles et al., 2014). However, some schol-
ars have argued that person-first language may 
inadvertently accentuate stigma because it is used only 
for individuals with stigmatized conditions (Gernsbacher, 
2017). Nonetheless, the limited empirical work on this 
topic is promising. Specifically, describing someone as 
“having a substance use disorder” or “a person with 
addiction” rather than a “substance abuser” or an 
“addict,” respectively, has been shown to reduce stigma 
(Baker et al., 2022; Kelly & Westerhoff, 2010). It remains 
to be seen whether person-first language in policies or 
laws could shift support for SUD, but this is an impor-
tant area for future work.

Throughout this review, we have treated SUD and 
mental illness stigma as discrete conditions, but SUD 
and mental illness often co-occur (Parker et al., 2021). 
For example, a national survey from 2021 found that 
13.5% of young adults between the ages of 18 and 25 
had both a mental illness and SUD in the year prior to 
the survey (SAMHSA, 2023), and 7.6% of adults (19.4 
million people) experienced co-occurring mental illness 
and SUD in 2021 (National Alliance on Mental Illness, 
2021). These dual stigmatized identities introduce com-
plexity for interventions that must reconcile whether to 
address a single identity or the intersecting identities. 
Intersectionality (Cole, 2009; Crenshaw, 2017) has not 
been widely explored in the context of mental illness 
and SUD (but see Jackson-Best & Edwards, 2018; 
Newman & Crowell, 2023). However, some research 
suggests that having multiple concealable stigmatized 
identities is associated with worse quality of life and 
health outcomes (Reinka et al., 2020). In general, the 
nature and magnitude of stigma toward individuals with 
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multiple stigmatized identities has been difficult to 
characterize (Kang & Bodenhausen, 2015) and will be 
an important area of future work for both mental illness 
and SUD (Oexle & Corrigan, 2018).

Successfully reducing SUD stigma probably requires 
interventions at the micro (individual) and macro (pol-
icy) levels. In addition to shifting individual attitudes, 
it is essential that structural shifts also occur to promote 
opportunities for treatment and recovery for individuals 
with SUD. Creating policies that normalize SUD treat-
ment and removing policies that create barriers and 
punishment for SUD are critical for shifting social norms 
about SUD. Ultimately, such top-down initiatives are 
essential for creating a culture of change.

Conclusions and Future Directions

Our goal in this review was to provide an overview of 
the current state of SUD stigma research. To do this, 
we leveraged existing work on SUD stigma and the 
large body of work on non-SUD mental illness stigma 
to highlight places of convergence and divergence 
between the two. Our hope is that this approach would 
elucidate the potential mechanisms underlying mental 
illness and SUD stigma.

Several key points emerged from this review. In the 
first section, we identified several core stigma-related 
beliefs that are drivers of stigma, including perceptions 
of dangerousness, controllability, changeability, and dis-
ruptiveness. Two important findings emerged. First, 
although there is overlap in these beliefs toward indi-
viduals with mental illness and SUD, individuals with 
SUD are generally viewed as more dangerous than indi-
viduals with mental illness, and their condition is also 
perceived to be more controllable and changeable. 
Second, different mental illness and SUD conditions elicit 
distinct stigma-related beliefs. Although some initial pat-
terns have emerged (e.g., illicit substance use activates 
more negative beliefs than legal substance use), future 
work should explore SUD stigma by condition to char-
acterize the unique underlying drivers of stigma.

In the second section, we identified some of the 
affective responses elicited by SUD and mental illness. 
Key limitations in this work include the fact that per-
ceivers’ emotional responses to mental illness and SUD 
have been relatively underexplored and that the types 
of emotional responses studied had been primarily lim-
ited to fear and anger. However, emerging work lever-
aging other frameworks has also identified the potential 
roles of disgust, pity, and contempt in mental illness 
and SUD stigma. Given the inherent challenges of mea-
suring perceivers’ affective responses (e.g., they may 
be unable or unwilling to report their emotional reac-
tions), neuroimaging has presented a promising avenue 
for better characterizing them. However, as in 

behavioral work, the neuroimaging literature has not 
sufficiently dissociated between distinct mental illness 
and SUD types, raising questions about the generaliz-
ability of these results.

The third section of this review explored stigma’s 
negative impact in several key domains, including self-
perception, interpersonal relationships, employment and 
housing, health and health care, and help-seeking. This 
section identified numerous downstream consequences 
of stigma for social stratification, well-being, and help-
seeking and recovery. Addressing each of these implica-
tions is essential for developing policies and programs 
targeted at alleviating institutional discrimination.

The final section of our review explored potential 
intervention targets for future work by providing a road 
map for future research and translational activities. 
Although we considered existing interventions (e.g., 
psychoeducation, contact), we suggest that interven-
tions that address SUD stigma should take a multi-
pronged approach that includes shifting existing social 
norms, including through social network interventions, 
and promoting a focus on recovery. These interventions 
should be specific to the SUD type and should consider 
the sociodemographic factors of their targets.

Our focus on public and self-stigma in this review 
allowed us to synthesize a large and complex literature. 
However, this focus was not intended to diminish the 
importance of structural stigma. Indeed, examining the 
extent to which existing laws and policies promote 
structural stigma toward SUD may be a particularly 
important direction for future work. Recent preliminary 
work has already identified prominent forms of SUD 
stigma in existing laws, particularly with respect to 
housing and treatment (Hemeida & Goldberg, 2022). 
Future work should more clearly characterize the nature 
and magnitude of SUD stigma in legal domains and 
determine how, if at all, it differs from mental illness 
stigma in the same domains. This work should consider 
the effects of SUD-related structural stigma on public 
stigma, beliefs about SUD, affective responses to SUD, 
and consequences for people coping with SUD.

Given the increasing prevalence of SUD in the United 
States, particularly following the COVID-19 pandemic, 
reducing barriers to treatment and improving outcomes 
for individuals suffering from SUD is an urgent health 
and ethical problem. Given the prominent role of 
stigma in creating barriers for treatment and recovery, 
reducing it should be a key priority in these efforts.

Transparency

Editor: Nora S. Newcombe
Declaration of Conflicting Interests

The author(s) declared that there were no conflicts of 
interest with respect to the authorship or the publication 
of this article.



Psychological Science in the Public Interest 24(2) 	 115

References

Abdul-Quader, A. S., Feelemyer, J., Modi, S., Stein, E. S., 
Briceno, A., Semaan, S., Horvath, T., Kennedy, G. E., & 
Des Jarlais, D. C. (2013). Effectiveness of structural-level 
needle/syringe programs to reduce HCV and HIV infec-
tion among people who inject drugs: A systematic review. 
AIDS and Behavior, 17, 2878–2892.

Adamczyk, A., Kim, C., & Dillon, L. (2020). Examining pub-
lic opinion about abortion: A mixed-methods systematic 
review of research over the last 15 years. Sociological 
Inquiry, 90(4), 920–954.

Adams, V. J. M., & Volkow, N. D. (2020). Ethical imperatives 
to overcome stigma against people with substance use 
disorders. AMA Journal of Ethics, 22(8), 702–708.

Agostinelli, G., Brown, J. M., & Miller, W. R. (1995). Effects of 
normative feedback on consumption among heavy drink-
ing college-students. Journal of Drug Education, 25(1), 
31–40. https://doi.org/10.2190/Xd56-D6wr-7195-Eal3

Ahern, J., Stuber, J., & Galea, S. (2007). Stigma, discrimina-
tion and the health of illicit drug users. Drug and Alcohol 
Dependence, 88(2–3), 188–196.

Ajzen, I. (1991). The theory of planned behavior. 
Organizational Behavior and Human Decision Processes, 
50(2), 179–211.

Alexander, L., & Link, B. (2003). The impact of contact on 
stigmatizing attitudes toward people with mental illness. 
Journal of Mental Health, 12(3), 271–289.

Ali, S., Tahir, B., Jabeen, S., & Malik, M. (2017). Methadone 
treatment of opiate addiction: A systematic review of com-
parative studies. Innovations in Clinical Neuroscience, 
14(7–8), 8–19.

Allport, G. W. (1954). The nature of prejudice. Addison-Wesley.
Alvidrez, J., Snowden, L. R., Rao, S. M., & Boccellari, A. 

(2009). Psychoeducation to address stigma in Black adults 
referred for mental health treatment: A randomized pilot 
study. Community Mental Health Journal, 45(2), 127–136. 
https://doi.org/10.1007/s10597-008-9169-0

Amodio, D. M. (2014). The neuroscience of prejudice and ste-
reotyping. Nature Reviews Neuroscience, 15(10), 670–682.

Amodio, D. M., & Cikara, M. (2021). The social neurosci-
ence of prejudice. Annual Review of Psychology, 72(1), 
439–469.

Anderson, K. N., Jeon, A. B., Blenner, J. A., Wiener, R. L., 
& Hope, D. A. (2015). How people evaluate others with 
social anxiety disorder: A comparison to depression 
and general mental illness stigma. American Journal of 
Orthopsychiatry, 85(2), 131–138. https://doi.org/10.1037/
ort0000046

Angermeyer, M. C., Buyantugs, L., Kenzine, D. V., & 
Matschinger, H. (2004). Effects of labelling on public 
attitudes towards people with schizophrenia: Are there 
cultural differences? Acta Psychiatrica Scandinavica, 
109(6), 420–425.

Angermeyer, M. C., & Matschinger, H. (2003a). Public beliefs 
about schizophrenia and depression: Similarities and dif-
ferences. Social Psychiatry and Psychiatric Epidemiology, 
38(9), 526–534.

Angermeyer, M. C., & Matschinger, H. (2003b). The stigma 
of mental illness: Effects of labelling on public attitudes 
towards people with mental disorder. Acta Psychiatrica 
Scandinavica, 108(4), 304–309.

Anstice, S., Strike, C. J., & Brands, B. (2009). Supervised meth-
adone consumption: Client issues and stigma. Substance 
Use & Misuse, 44(6), 794–808.

Aoun, E. G., & Appelbaum, P. S. (2019). Ten years after the 
ADA Amendment Act (2008): The relationship between 
ADA employment discrimination and substance use dis-
orders. Psychiatric Services, 70(7), 596–603.

Arnaez, J. M., Krendl, A. C., McCormick, B. P., Chen, Z., & 
Chomistek, A. K. (2020). The association of depression 
stigma with barriers to seeking mental health care: A 
cross-sectional analysis. Journal of Mental Health, 29(2), 
182–190. https://doi.org/10.1080/09638237.2019.1644494

Arsandaux, J., Montagni, I., Macalli, M., Bouteloup, V., 
Tzourio, C., & Galera, C. (2020). Health risk behaviors 
and self-esteem among college students: Systematic 
review of quantitative studies. International Journal of 
Behavioral Medicine, 27(2), 142–159.

Asch, S. E. (1956). Studies of independence and confor-
mity. 1. A minority of one against a unanimous majority. 
Psychological Monographs, 70(9), 1–70. https://doi.org/ 
10.1037/h0093718

Ata, A., Bastian, B., & Lusher, D. (2009). Intergroup con-
tact in context: The mediating role of social norms and 
group-based perceptions on the contact-prejudice link. 
International Journal of Intercultural Relations, 33(6), 
498–506. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ijintrel.2009.05.001

Baker, E. A., Hamilton, M., Culpepper, D., McCune, G., & 
Silone, G. (2022). The effect of person-first language 
on attitudes toward people with addiction. Journal of 
Addictions & Offender Counseling, 43(1), 38–49.

Baldwin, M. L., & Marcus, S. C. (2006). Perceived and mea-
sured stigma among workers with serious mental illness. 
Psychiatric Services, 57(3), 388–392.

Baldwin, M. L., Marcus, S. C., & De Simone, J. (2010). Job 
loss discrimination and former substance use disorders. 
Drug and Alcohol Dependence, 110(1–2), 1–7.

Bandura, A., & Locke, E. A. (2003). Negative self-efficacy 
and goal effects revisited. Journal of Applied Psychology, 
88(1), 87–99.

Barlott, T., Shevellar, L., Turpin, M., & Setchell, J. (2020). 
Destabilising social inclusion and recovery, and pursuing 
‘lines of flight’ in the mental health sector. Sociology of 
Health & Illness, 42(6), 1328–1343.

Barry, C. L., McGinty, E. E., Pescosolido, B. A., & Goldman, 
H. H. (2014). Stigma, discrimination, treatment effective-
ness, and policy: Public views about drug addiction and 
mental illness. Psychiatric Services, 65(10), 1269–1272. 
https://doi.org/10.1176/appi.ps.201400140

Berkowitz, A. D. (2003). Applications of social norms theory 
to other health and social justice issues. In H. W. Perkins 
(Ed.), The social norms approach to preventing school and 
college age substance abuse: A handbook for educators, 
counselors, and clinicians (pp. 259–279). Jossey-Bass/
Wiley.

https://doi.org/10.2190/Xd56-D6wr-7195-Eal3
https://doi.org/10.1007/s10597-008-9169-0
https://doi.org/10.1037/ort0000046
https://doi.org/10.1037/ort0000046
https://doi.org/10.1080/09638237.2019.1644494
https://doi.org/10.1037/h0093718
https://doi.org/10.1037/h0093718
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ijintrel.2009.05.001
https://doi.org/10.1176/appi.ps.201400140


116	 Krendl, Perry

Bielenberg, J., Swisher, G., Lembke, A., & Haug, N. A. (2021). 
A systematic review of stigma interventions for providers 
who treat patients with substance use disorders. Journal 
of Substance Abuse Treatment, 131, Article 108486. 
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jsat.2021.108486

Birtel, M. D., Wood, L., & Kempa, N. J. (2017). Stigma and 
social support in substance abuse: Implications for men-
tal health and well-being. Psychiatry Research, 252, 1–8.

Black, M. J., Sokol, N., & Vartanian, L. R. (2014). The effect of 
effort and weight controllability on perceptions of obese 
individuals. The Journal of Social Psychology, 154(6), 
515–526.

Blanchard, F. A., Crandall, C. S., Brigham, J. C., & Vaughn, L. 
A. (1994). Condemning and condoning racism: A social-
context approach to interracial settings. Journal of Applied 
Psychology, 79(6), 993–997. https://doi.org/10.1037/0021-
9010.79.6.993

Blanco, C., Iza, M., Rodriguez-Fernandez, J. M., Baca-Garcia, 
E., Wang, S., & Olfson, M. (2015). Probability and pre-
dictors of treatment-seeking for substance use disorders 
in the U.S. Drug and Alcohol Dependence, 149, 136–144. 
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.drugalcdep.2015.01.031

Borsari, B., & Carey, K. B. (2003). Descriptive and injunctive 
norms in college drinking: A meta-analytic integration. 
Journal of Studies on Alcohol, 64(3), 331–341.

Bos, A. E., Kanner, D., Muris, P., Janssen, B., & Mayer, B. 
(2009). Mental illness stigma and disclosure: Consequences 
of coming out of the closet. Issues in Mental Health 
Nursing, 30(8), 509–513.

Botha, F. B., Shamblaw, A. L., & Dozois, D. J. (2017). Reducing 
the stigma of depression among Asian students: A social 
norm approach. Journal of Cross-Cultural Psychology, 
48(1), 113–131.

Boysen, G. A., Chicosky, R. L., & Delmore, E. E. (2023). 
Dehumanization of mental illness and the stereotype con-
tent model. Stigma and Health, 8(2), 150–158.

Boysen, G. A., Isaacs, R. A., Tretter, L., & Markowski, S. 
(2020). Evidence for blatant dehumanization of mental 
illness and its relation to stigma. The Journal of Social 
Psychology, 160(3), 346–356.

Brener, L., von Hippel, W., von Hippel, C., Resnick, I., & 
Treloar, C. (2010). Perceptions of discriminatory treat-
ment by staff as predictors of drug treatment completion: 
Utility of a mixed methods approach. Drug and Alcohol 
Review, 29(5), 491–497.

Brown, S. A. (2015). Stigma towards marijuana users and her-
oin users. Journal of Psychoactive Drugs, 47(3), 213–220.

Brown, S. A., Evans, Y., Espenschade, K., & O’Connor, M. 
(2010). An examination of two brief stigma reduction 
strategies: Filmed personal contact and hallucination 
simulations. Community Mental Health Journal, 46(5), 
494–499.

Brown, S. A., Kramer, K., Lewno, B., Dumas, L., Sacchetti, 
G., & Powell, E. (2015). Correlates of self-stigma among 
individuals with substance use problems. International 
Journal of Mental Health and Addiction, 13(6), 687–698.

Broyles, L. M., Binswanger, I. A., Jenkins, J. A., Finnell, D. 
S., Faseru, B., Cavaiola, A., Pugatch, M., & Gordon, A. 

J. (2014). Confronting inadvertent stigma and pejorative 
language in addiction scholarship: A recognition and 
response. Substance Abuse, 35(3), 217–221.

Buckley, P. F., Robben, T., Friedman, L., & Hyde, J. (1999). 
Sexual behavior in persons with serious mental illness: 
Patterns and clinical correlates. In P. F. Buckley (Ed.), 
Sexuality and serious mental illness (pp. 1–20). Routledge.

Bulanda, J. J., Bruhn, C., Byro-Johnson, T., & Zentmyer, M. 
(2014). Addressing mental health stigma among young 
adolescents: Evaluation of a youth-led approach. Health 
& Social Work, 39(2), 73–80. https://doi.org/10.1093/hsw/
hlu008

Burke, E., Pyle, M., Machin, K., Varese, F., & Morrison, A. 
P. (2019). The effects of peer support on empowerment, 
self-efficacy, and internalized stigma: A narrative synthe-
sis and meta-analysis. Stigma and Health, 4(3), 337–356.

Callard, F., Sartorius, N., Arboleda-Flórez, J., Bartlett, P., 
Helmchen, H., Stuart, H., Taborda, J., & Thornicroft, 
G. (2012). Mental illness, discrimination and the law: 
Fighting for social justice. John Wiley & Sons.

Camacho, G., Reinka, M. A., & Quinn, D. M. (2020). 
Disclosure and concealment of stigmatized identities. 
Current Opinion in Psychology, 31, 28–32. https://doi 
.org/10.1016/j.copsyc.2019.07.031

Cameron, L., Rutland, A., Hossain, R., & Petley, R. (2011). 
When and why does extended contact work? The role of 
high quality direct contact and group norms in the devel-
opment of positive ethnic intergroup attitudes amongst 
children. Group Processes & Intergroup Relations, 14(2), 
193–206. https://doi.org/10.1177/1368430210390535

Campbell, C., & Deacon, H. (2006). Unravelling the contexts 
of stigma: From internalisation to resistance to change. 
Journal of Community & Applied Social Psychology, 16(6), 
411–417.

Caprariello, P. A., Cuddy, A. J., & Fiske, S. T. (2009). Social 
structure shapes cultural stereotypes and emotions: 
A causal test of the stereotype content model. Group 
Processes & Intergroup Relations, 12(2), 147–155.

Carey, M. P., Carey, K. B., Maisto, S. A., Gordon, C. M., 
& Vanable, P. A. (2001). Prevalence and correlates of 
sexual activity and HIV-related risk behavior among psy-
chiatric outpatients. Journal of Consulting and Clinical 
Psychology, 69(5), 846–850.

Cassidy, B. S., & Krendl, A. C. (2018). Believing is seeing: 
Arbitrary stigma labels affect the visual representation of 
faces. Social Cognition, 36(4), 381–410.

CDC WONDER. (2023, January 11). National Center for Health 
Statistics mortality data on CDC WONDER. Centers for 
Disease Control and Prevention. https://wonder.cdc.gov/
mcd.html

Centers for Disease Control and Prevention. (2023, February 
15). Products - Vital statistics rapid release - Provisional 
drug overdose death counts. https://www.cdc.gov/nchs/
nvss/vsrr/drug-overdose-data.htm

Cernasev, A., Hohmeier, K. C., Frederick, K., Jasmin, H., 
& Gatwood, J. (2021). A systematic literature review of 
patient perspectives of barriers and facilitators to access, 
adherence, stigma, and persistence to treatment for  

https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jsat.2021.108486
https://doi.org/10.1037/0021-9010.79.6.993
https://doi.org/10.1037/0021-9010.79.6.993
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.drugalcdep.2015.01.031
https://doi.org/10.1093/hsw/hlu008
https://doi.org/10.1093/hsw/hlu008
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.copsyc.2019.07.031
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.copsyc.2019.07.031
https://doi.org/10.1177/1368430210390535
https://wonder.cdc.gov/mcd.html
https://wonder.cdc.gov/mcd.html
https://www.cdc.gov/nchs/nvss/vsrr/drug-overdose-data.htm
https://www.cdc.gov/nchs/nvss/vsrr/drug-overdose-data.htm


Psychological Science in the Public Interest 24(2) 	 117

substance use disorder. Exploratory Research in Clinical 
and Social Pharmacy, 2, Article 100029. https://doi.org/ 
10.1016/j.rcsop.2021.100029

Charlesworth, T. E. S., & Banaji, M. R. (2019). Patterns of 
implicit and explicit attitudes: I. Long-term change and 
stability from 2007 to 2016. Psychological Science, 30(2), 
174–192.

Chartrand, T. L., & Bargh, J. A. (1999). The chameleon 
effect: The perception–behavior link and social interac-
tion. Journal of Personality and Social Psychology, 76(6), 
893–910. https://doi.org/10.1037/0022-3514.76.6.893

Chaudoir, S. R., & Fisher, J. D. (2010). The disclosure pro-
cesses model: Understanding disclosure decision making 
and postdisclosure outcomes among people living with a 
concealable stigmatized identity. Psychological Bulletin, 
136(2), 236–256.

Chavarria, J., Stevens, E. B., Jason, L. A., & Ferrari, J. R. (2012). 
The effects of self-regulation and self-efficacy on sub-
stance use abstinence. Alcoholism Treatment Quarterly, 
30(4), 422–432.

Cheetham, A., Picco, L., Barnett, A., Lubman, D. I., & Nielsen, 
S. (2022). The impact of stigma on people with opioid use 
disorder, opioid treatment, and policy. Substance Abuse 
and Rehabilitation, 13, 1–12.

Chiesa, A., & Serretti, A. (2014). Are mindfulness-based inter-
ventions effective for substance use disorders? A sys-
tematic review of the evidence. Substance Use & Misuse, 
49(5), 492–512. https://doi.org/10.3109/10826084.2013 
.770027

Cialdini, R. B., & Goldstein, N. J. (2004). Social influ-
ence: Compliance and conformity. Annual Review of 
Psychology, 55, 591–621. https://doi.org/10.1146/annurev 
.psych.55.090902.142015

Clement, S., Schauman, O., Graham, T., Maggioni, F., Evans-
Lacko, S., Bezborodovs, N., Morgan, C., Rusch, N., Brown, 
J. S., & Thornicroft, G. (2015). What is the impact of 
mental health-related stigma on help-seeking? A sys-
tematic review of quantitative and qualitative studies. 
Psychological Medicine, 45(1), 11–27. https://doi.org/ 
10.1017/S0033291714000129

Cole, E. R. (2009). Intersectionality and research in psychol-
ogy. American Psychologist, 64(3), 170–180.

Colker, R. (2001). Winning and losing under the Americans 
With Disabilities Act. Ohio State Law Journal, 62, 239–283.

Corrigan, P. (2004). How stigma interferes with mental health 
care. American Psychologist, 59(7), 614–625. https://doi 
.org/10.1037/0003-066x.59.7.614

Corrigan, P., & Gelb, B. (2006). Three programs that use mass 
approaches to challenge the stigma of mental illness. 
Psychiatric Services, 57(3), 393–398.

Corrigan, P., Schomerus, G., Shuman, V., Kraus, D., Perlick, 
D., Harnish, A., Kulesza, M., Kane-Willis, K., Qin, S., & 
Smelson, D. (2017). Developing a research agenda for 
understanding the stigma of addictions Part I: Lessons 
from the mental health stigma literature. American Journal 
on Addictions, 26(1), 59–66. https://doi.org/10.1111/
ajad.12458

Corrigan, P., Thompson, V., Lambert, D., Sangster, Y., Noel, 
J. G., & Campbell, J. (2003). Perceptions of discrimination 
among persons with serious mental illness. Psychiatric 
Services, 54(8), 1105–1110.

Corrigan, P. W. (2000). Mental health stigma as social attri-
bution: Implications for research methods and attitude 
change. Clinical Psychology: Science and Practice, 7(1), 
48–67.

Corrigan, P. W. (2002). Testing social cognitive models of 
mental illness stigma: The Prairie State Stigma Studies. 
Psychiatric Rehabilitation Skills, 6(2), 232–254.

Corrigan, P. W. (2012). Where is the evidence supporting 
public service announcements to eliminate mental illness 
stigma? Psychiatric Services, 63(1), 79–82.

Corrigan, P. W., Druss, B. G., & Perlick, D. A. (2014). The 
impact of mental illness stigma on seeking and par-
ticipating in mental health care. Psychological Science 
in the Public Interest, 15(2), 37–70. https://doi.org/ 
10.1177/1529100614531398

Corrigan, P. W., Kuwabara, S. A., & O’Shaughnessy, J. (2009). 
The public stigma of mental illness and drug addiction: 
Findings from a stratified random sample. Journal of 
Social Work, 9(2), 139–147.

Corrigan, P. W., Markowitz, F. E., & Watson, A. C. (2004). 
Structural levels of mental illness stigma and discrimina-
tion. Schizophrenia Bulletin, 30(3), 481–491. https://doi 
.org/10.1093/oxfordjournals.schbul.a007096

Corrigan, P. W., Morris, S. B., Michaels, P. J., Rafacz, J. D., & 
Rusch, N. (2012). Challenging the public stigma of mental 
illness: A meta-analysis of outcome studies. Psychiatric 
Services, 63(10), 963–973. https://doi.org/10.1176/appi 
.ps.201100529

Corrigan, P. W., & Rao, D. (2012). On the self-stigma of men-
tal illness: Stages, disclosure, and strategies for change. 
The Canadian Journal of Psychiatry, 57(8), 464–469.

Corrigan, P. W., River, L. P., Lundin, R. K., Penn, D. L., 
Uphoff-Wasowski, K., Campion, J., Mathisen, J., Gagnon, 
C., Bergman, M., Goldstein, H., & Kubiak, M. A. (2001). 
Three strategies for changing attributions about severe 
mental illness. Schizophrenia Bulletin, 27(2), 187–195.

Corrigan, P. W., River, L. P., Lundin, R. K., Wasowski, K. 
U., Campion, J., Mathisen, J., Goldstein, H., Bergman, 
M., Gagnon, C., & Kubiak, M. A. (2000). Stigmatizing 
attributions about mental illness. Journal of Community 
Psychology, 28(1), 91–102.

Corrigan, P. W., Rowan, D., Green, A., Lundin, R., River, 
P., Uphoff-Wasowski, K., White, K., & Kubiak, M. A. 
(2002). Challenging two mental illness stigmas: Personal 
responsibility and dangerousness. Schizophrenia Bulletin, 
28(2), 293–309.

Corrigan, P. W., Schomerus, G., Shuman, V., Kraus, D., Perlick, 
D., Harnish, A., Kulesza, M., Kane-Willis, K., Qin, S., & 
Smelson, D. (2017). Developing a research agenda for 
reducing the stigma of addictions, Part II: Lessons from 
the mental health stigma literature. American Journal 
on Addictions, 26(1), 67–74. https://doi.org/10.1111/
ajad.12436

https://doi.org/10.1016/j.rcsop.2021.100029
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.rcsop.2021.100029
https://doi.org/10.1037/0022-3514.76.6.893
https://doi.org/10.3109/10826084.2013.770027
https://doi.org/10.3109/10826084.2013.770027
https://doi.org/10.1146/annurev.psych.55.090902.142015
https://doi.org/10.1146/annurev.psych.55.090902.142015
https://doi.org/10.1017/S0033291714000129
https://doi.org/10.1017/S0033291714000129
https://doi.org/10.1037/0003-066x.59.7.614
https://doi.org/10.1037/0003-066x.59.7.614
https://doi.org/10.1111/ajad.12458
https://doi.org/10.1111/ajad.12458
https://doi.org/10.1177/1529100614531398
https://doi.org/10.1177/1529100614531398
https://doi.org/10.1093/oxfordjournals.schbul.a007096
https://doi.org/10.1093/oxfordjournals.schbul.a007096
https://doi.org/10.1176/appi.ps.201100529
https://doi.org/10.1176/appi.ps.201100529
https://doi.org/10.1111/ajad.12436
https://doi.org/10.1111/ajad.12436


118	 Krendl, Perry

Corrigan, P. W., & Wassel, A. (2008). Understanding and 
influencing the stigma of mental illness. Journal of 
Psychosocial Nursing and Mental Health Services, 46(1), 
42–48. https://doi.org/10.3928/02793695-20080101-04

Corrigan, P. W., Watson, A. C., & Miller, F. E. (2006). Blame, 
shame, and contamination: The impact of mental illness 
and drug dependence stigma on family members. Journal 
of Family Psychology, 20(2), 239–246.

Couture, S., & Penn, D. (2003). Interpersonal contact and 
the stigma of mental illness: A review of the literature. 
Journal of Mental Health, 12(3), 291–305.

Crandall, C. S., & Eshleman, A. (2003). A justification-suppres-
sion model of the expression and experience of prejudice. 
Psychological Bulletin, 129(3), 414–446.

Crandall, C. S., & Martinez, R. (1996). Culture, ideology, 
and antifat attitudes. Personality and Social Psychology 
Bulletin, 22(11), 1165–1176.

Crandall, C. S., & Moriarty, D. (1995). Physical illness stigma 
and social rejection. British Journal of Social Psychology, 
34(1), 67–83.

Crapanzano, K. A., Hammarlund, R., Ahmad, B., Hunsinger, 
N., & Kullar, R. (2019). The association between per-
ceived stigma and substance use disorder treatment out-
comes: A review. Substance Abuse and Rehabilitation, 10, 
1–12. https://doi.org/10.2147/SAR.S183252

Crenshaw, K. W. (2017). On intersectionality: Essential writ-
ings. The New Press.

Crocker, J., Major, B., & Steele, C. (1998). Social stigma (4th 
ed., Vol. 2). McGraw-Hill.

Cummings, J. R., Lucas, S. M., & Druss, B. G. (2013). 
Addressing public stigma and disparities among persons 
with mental illness: The role of federal policy. American 
Journal of Public Health, 103(5), 781–785.

Curran, T. W. (2017). Reducing substance abuse stigma in 
employment application (Publication No. 1539) [Doctoral 
dissertation, Georgia Southern University]. Electronic 
Theses & Dissertations.

Davidson, L., & Roe, D. (2007). Recovery from versus recov-
ery in serious mental illness: One strategy for lessening 
confusion plaguing recovery. Journal of Mental Health, 
16(4), 459–470.

Deaux, K., Reid, A., Mizrahi, K., & Ethier, K. A. (1995). 
Parameters of social identity. Journal of Personality and 
Social Psychology, 68(2), 280–291.

Denny, B. T., Kober, H., Wager, T. D., & Ochsner, K. N. 
(2012). A meta-analysis of functional neuroimaging stud-
ies of self- and other judgments reveals a spatial gradient 
for mentalizing in medial prefrontal cortex. Journal of 
Cognitive Neuroscience, 24(8), 1742–1752.

Desforges, D. M., Lord, C. G., Ramsey, S. L., Mason, J. A., 
Van Leeuwen, M. D., West, S. C., & Lepper, M. R. (1991). 
Effects of structured cooperative contact on changing 
negative attitudes toward stigmatized social groups. 
Journal of Personality and Social Psychology, 60(4), 531–
544. https://doi.org/10.1037//0022-3514.60.4.531

Dickerson, F. B., Brown, C. H., Kreyenbuhl, J., Goldberg, R. 
W., Fang, L. J., & Dixon, L. B. (2004). Sexual and repro-
ductive behaviors among persons with mental illness. 
Psychiatric Services, 55(11), 1299–1301.

Dickson-Gomez, J., Spector, A., Weeks, M., Galletly, C., 
McDonald, M., & Green Montaque, H. D. (2022). “You’re 
not supposed to be on it forever”: Medications to treat 
opioid use disorder (MOUD) related stigma among 
drug treatment providers and people who use opioids. 
Substance Abuse: Research and Treatment, 16. https://
doi.org/10.1177/11782218221103859

Dineen, K. K., & Pendo, E. (2020). Substance use disorder 
discrimination and the CARES Act: Using disability law 
to inform Part 2 rulemaking. Arizona State Law Journal, 
52, 1143–1165.

Donker, T., Griffiths, K. M., Cuijpers, P., & Christensen, H. 
(2009). Psychoeducation for depression, anxiety and psy-
chological distress: A meta-analysis. BMC Medicine, 7, 
Article 79. https://doi.org/10.1186/1741-7015-7-79

Dovidio, J. F., Eller, A., & Hewstone, M. (2011). Improving 
intergroup relations through direct, extended and 
other forms of indirect contact. Group Processes & 
Intergroup Relations, 14(2), 147–160. https://doi.org/ 
10.1177/1368430210390555

Dovidio, J. F., Kawakami, K., Johnson, C., Johnson, B., & 
Howard, A. (1997). On the nature of prejudice: Automatic 
and controlled processes. Journal of Experimental Social 
Psychology, 33(5), 510–540.

Dovidio, J. F., Major, B., & Crocker, J. (2000). Stigma: 
Introduction and overview. In T. F. Heatherton, R. E. 
Kleck, M. R. Hebl, & J. G. Hull (Eds.), The social psychol-
ogy of stigma (pp. 1–28). Guilford Press.

Eisenberg, D., Downs, M. F., Golberstein, E., & Zivin, K. 
(2009). Stigma and help seeking for mental health among 
college students. Medical Care Research and Review, 
66(5), 522–541.

Evans-Lacko, S., Brohan, E., Mojtabai, R., & Thornicroft, G. 
(2012). Association between public views of mental ill-
ness and self-stigma among individuals with mental ill-
ness in 14 European countries. Psychological Medicine, 
42(8), 1741–1752.

Evans-Lacko, S., London, J., Japhet, S., Rüsch, N., Flach, 
C., Corker, E., Henderson, C., & Thornicroft, G. (2012). 
Mass social contact interventions and their effect on men-
tal health related stigma and intended discrimination. 
BMC Public Health, 12(1), Article 489. https://doi.org/ 
10.1186/1471-2458-12-489

Feldman, D. B., & Crandall, C. S. (2007). Dimensions of men-
tal illness stigma: What about mental illness causes social 
rejection? Journal of Social and Clinical Psychology, 26(2), 
137–154. https://doi.org/10.1521/jscp.2007.26.2.137

Fiske, S. T. (2012). Warmth and competence: Stereotype 
content issues for clinicians and researchers. Canadian 
Psychology/Psychologie Canadienne, 53(1), 14–20.

Fiske, S. T. (2018). Stereotype content: Warmth and compe-
tence endure. Current Directions in Psychological Science, 
27(2), 67–73.

Fiske, S. T., Cuddy, A. J. C., & Glick, P. (2007). Universal 
dimensions of social cognition: Warmth and competence. 
Trends in Cognitive Sciences, 11(2), 77–83.

Fiske, S. T., Cuddy, A. J. C., Glick, P., & Xu, J. (2002). A 
model of (often mixed) stereotype content: Competence 
and warmth respectively follow from perceived status 

https://doi.org/10.3928/02793695-20080101-04
https://doi.org/10.2147/SAR.S183252
https://doi.org/10.1037//0022-3514.60.4.531
https://doi.org/10.1177/11782218221103859
https://doi.org/10.1177/11782218221103859
https://doi.org/10.1186/1741-7015-7-79
https://doi.org/10.1177/1368430210390555
https://doi.org/10.1177/1368430210390555
https://doi.org/10.1186/1471-2458-12-489
https://doi.org/10.1186/1471-2458-12-489
https://doi.org/10.1521/jscp.2007.26.2.137


Psychological Science in the Public Interest 24(2) 	 119

and competition. Journal of Personality and Social 
Psychology, 82(6), 878–902. https://doi.org/10.1037/0022-
3514.82.6.878

Flores, A. R., & Barclay, S. (2016). Backlash, consensus, legiti-
macy, or polarization: The effect of same-sex marriage 
policy on mass attitudes. Political Research Quarterly, 
69(1), 43–56.

Fogler, S. (2020, December 8). As a physician and a patient, 
I’ve seen the damage caused by the stigma of addiction. It 
must end. STAT. https://www.statnews.com/2020/12/08/
stigma-weaponized-helps-fuel-addiction-crisis/

Foster, S., & O’Mealey, M. (2022). Socioeconomic status and 
mental illness stigma: The impact of mental illness con-
trollability attributions and personal responsibility judg-
ments. Journal of Mental Health, 31(1), 58–65.

Frable, D. E. (1993). Dimensions of marginality: Distinctions 
among those who are different. Personality and Social 
Psychology Bulletin, 19(4), 370–380.

Fraser, S., & Valentine, K. (2008). Substance and substitution: 
Methadone subjects in liberal societies. Springer.

Frost, D. M. (2011). Social stigma and its consequences for 
the socially stigmatized. Social and Personality Psychology 
Compass, 5(11), 824–839.

Gao, S., & Ng, S.-M. (2021). Reducing stigma among college 
students toward people with schizophrenia: A random-
ized controlled trial grounded on intergroup contact the-
ory. Schizophrenia Bulletin Open, 2(1), Article sgab008. 
https://doi.org/10.1093/schizbullopen/sgab008

Gernsbacher, M. A. (2017). Editorial perspective: The use of 
person-first language in scholarly writing may accentu-
ate stigma. Journal of Child Psychology and Psychiatry, 
58(7), 859–861.

Gloor, J. L., & Puhl, R. M. (2016). Empathy and perspec-
tive-taking: Examination and comparison of strategies to 
reduce weight stigma. Stigma and Health, 1(4), 269–279.

Goffman, E. (1963). Stigma: Notes on the management of 
spoiled identity. Touchstone.

Goldberg, S. G., Killeen, M. B., & O’Day, B. (2005). The 
disclosure conundrum: How people with psychiatric dis-
abilities navigate employment. Psychology, Public Policy, 
and Law, 11, 463–500.

Goodyear, K., Haass-Koffler, C. L., & Chavanne, D. (2018). 
Opioid use and stigma: The role of gender, language 
and precipitating events. Drug and Alcohol Dependence, 
185, 339–346.

Görzig, A., & Ryan, L. N. (2022). The different faces of mental 
illness stigma: Systematic variation of stereotypes, preju-
dice and discrimination by type of illness. Scandinavian 
Journal of Psychology, 63(5), 545–554. https://doi.org/ 
10.1111/sjop.12833

Gourley, A. N., & Krendl, A. C. (2023). Endorsement of struc-
tural stigma negatively predicts treatment receipt among 
individuals with substance dependence. Manuscript sub-
mitted for publication.

Griffiths, K. M., Carron-Arthur, B., Parsons, A., & Reid, R. 
(2014). Effectiveness of programs for reducing the stigma 
associated with mental disorders. A meta-analysis of 
randomized controlled trials. World Psychiatry, 13(2), 
161–175.

Griffiths, K. M., Christensen, H., Jorm, A. F., Evans, K., & 
Groves, C. (2004). Effect of Web-based depression literacy 
and cognitive-behavioural therapy interventions on stig-
matising attitudes to depression: Randomised controlled 
trial. British Journal of Psychiatry, 185, 342–349. https://
doi.org/10.1192/bjp.185.4.342

Gulliver, A., Griffiths, K. M., & Christensen, H. (2010). 
Perceived barriers and facilitators to mental health help-
seeking in young people: A systematic review. BMC 
Psychiatry, 10, Article 113. https://doi.org/10.1186/1471-
244X-10-113

Guzmán, E. M., Cha, C. B., Ribeiro, J. D., & Franklin, J. C. 
(2019). Suicide risk around the world: A meta-analysis 
of longitudinal studies. Social Psychiatry and Psychiatric 
Epidemiology, 54, 1459–1470.

Hackler, A. H., Cornish, M. A., & Vogel, D. L. (2016). Reducing 
mental illness stigma: Effectiveness of hearing about the 
normative experiences of others. Stigma and Health, 1(3), 
201–205.

Hamilton, L. J., Coleman, M., & Krendl, A. C. (2023). 
Predicting substance use stigma from causal attributions 
and personal contact in a sample of U.S. healthcare work-
ers and the general population. Manuscript submitted for 
publication.

Hammarlund, R., Crapanzano, K. A., Luce, L., Mulligan, L., & 
Ward, K. M. (2018). Review of the effects of self-stigma 
and perceived social stigma on the treatment-seeking 
decisions of individuals with drug- and alcohol-use dis-
orders. Substance Abuse and Rehabilitation, 9, 115–136. 
https://doi.org/10.2147/SAR.S183256

Hammer, J. H., & Vogel, D. L. (2010). Men’s help seeking 
for depression: The efficacy of a male-sensitive brochure 
about counseling. Counseling Psychologist, 38(2), 296–
313. https://doi.org/10.1177/0011000009351937

Haque, O. S., & Waytz, A. (2012). Dehumanization in medi-
cine: Causes, solutions, and functions. Perspectives on 
Psychological Science, 7(2), 176–186.

Harris, J., & McElrath, K. (2012). Methadone as social control: 
Institutionalized stigma and the prospect of recovery. 
Qualitative Health Research, 22(6), 810–824.

Harris, L. T., & Fiske, S. T. (2006). Dehumanizing the lowest of 
the low: Neuroimaging responses to extreme out-groups. 
Psychological Science, 17(10), 847–853.

Haslam, N. (2006). Dehumanization: An integrative review. 
Personality and Social Psychology Review, 10(3), 252–
264.

Haslam, N., & Loughnan, S. (2014). Dehumanization and 
infrahumanization. Annual Review of Psychology, 65, 
399–423.

Hatzenbuehler, M. L. (2016). Structural stigma: Research 
evidence and implications for psychological science. 
American Psychologist, 71(8), 742–751.

Hatzenbuehler, M. L. (2017). Structural stigma and health. In 
B. Major, J. F. Dovidio, & B. G. Link (Eds.), The Oxford 
handbook of stigma, discrimination, and health (pp. 
105–122). Oxford University Press.

Haugen, P. T., McCrillis, A. M., Smid, G. E., & Nijdam, M. 
J. (2017). Mental health stigma and barriers to mental 
health care for first responders: A systematic review and  

https://doi.org/10.1037/0022-3514.82.6.878
https://doi.org/10.1037/0022-3514.82.6.878
https://www.statnews.com/2020/12/08/stigma-weaponized-helps-fuel-addiction-crisis/
https://www.statnews.com/2020/12/08/stigma-weaponized-helps-fuel-addiction-crisis/
https://doi.org/10.1093/schizbullopen/sgab008
https://doi.org/10.1111/sjop.12833
https://doi.org/10.1111/sjop.12833
https://doi.org/10.1192/bjp.185.4.342
https://doi.org/10.1192/bjp.185.4.342
https://doi.org/10.1186/1471-244X-10-113
https://doi.org/10.1186/1471-244X-10-113
https://doi.org/10.2147/SAR.S183256
https://doi.org/10.1177/0011000009351937


120	 Krendl, Perry

meta-analysis. Journal of Psychiatric Research, 94, 218–
229. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jpsychires.2017.08.001

Hegarty, P., & Golden, A. M. (2008). Attributional beliefs 
about the controllability of stigmatized traits: Antecedents 
or justifications of prejudice? Journal of Applied Social 
Psychology, 38(4), 1023–1044.

Hemeida, S., & Goldberg, D. (2022). Dismantling structural 
addiction stigma in law: Policies for systematic change. 
Families, Systems, & Health, 40(2), 288–290.

Henderson, C., Noblett, J., Parke, H., Clement, S., Caffrey, 
A., Gale-Grant, O., Schulze, B., Druss, B., & Thornicroft, 
G. (2014). Mental health-related stigma in health care 
and mental health-care settings. The Lancet Psychiatry, 
1(6), 467–482.

Henkel, D. (2011). Unemployment and substance use: A 
review of the literature (1990-2010). Current Drug Abuse 
Reviews, 4(1), 4–27.

Hewell, V. M., Vasquez, A. R., & Rivkin, I. D. (2017). Systemic 
and individual factors in the buprenorphine treatment-
seeking process: A qualitative study. Substance Abuse 
Treatment, Prevention, and Policy, 12(1), Article 3. 
https://doi.org/10.1186/s13011-016-0085-y

Hinshaw, S. P., & Stier, A. (2008). Stigma as related to men-
tal disorders. Annual Review of Clinical Psychology, 4, 
367–393.

Hipes, C., Lucas, J., Phelan, J. C., & White, R. C. (2016). The 
stigma of mental illness in the labor market. Social Science 
Research, 56, 16–25.

Horn, B. P., Joshi, A., & Maclean, J. C. (2021). Substance use 
disorder treatment centers and residential property values. 
American Journal of Health Economics, 7(2), 185–221.

Hoyt, C. L., Burnette, J. L., Thomas, F. N., & Orvidas, K. 
(2019). Public health messages and weight-related 
beliefs: Implications for well-being and stigma. Frontiers 
in Psychology, 10, Article 2806. https://doi.org/10.3389/
fpsyg.2019.02806

Husaini, B. A., & Von Frank, A. (1985). Life events, coping 
resources, and depression: A longitudinal study of direct, 
buffering, and reciprocal effects. Research in Community 
& Mental Health, 5, 111–136.

Iles, I. A., Atwell Seate, A., & Waks, L. (2017). Stigmatizing the 
other: An exploratory study of unintended consequences 
of eating disorder public service announcements. Journal 
of Health Psychology, 22(1), 120–131.

Jackson-Best, F., & Edwards, N. (2018). Stigma and intersec-
tionality: A systematic review of systematic reviews across 
HIV/AIDS, mental illness, and physical disability. BMC 
Public Health, 18(1), Article 919. https://doi.org/10.1186/
s12889-018-5861-3

Janulis, P., Ferrari, J. R., & Fowler, P. (2013). Understanding 
public stigma toward substance dependence. Journal of 
Applied Social Psychology, 43(5), 1065–1072.

Jones, A. M. (2011). Disclosure of mental illness in the work-
place: A literature review. American Journal of Psychiatric 
Rehabilitation, 14(3), 212–229.

Jones, E. E., Farina, A., Hastorf, A. H., Markus, H., Miller, D. 
T., & Scott, R. A. (1984). Social psychology: The psychology 
of marked relationships. W. H. Freeman.

Jost, J. T., & Banaji, M. R. (1994). The role of stereotyping in 
system-justification and the production of false conscious-
ness. British Journal of Social Psychology, 33(1), 1–27.

Judge David L. Bazelon Center for Mental Health Law. (2011). 
Asking why: Reasserting the role of community mental 
health. https://www.alleghenycountyanalytics.us/wp-
content/uploads/2016/05/Asking-Why-Reasserting-the-
Role-of-Community-Mental-Health.pdf

Kadden, R. M., & Litt, M. D. (2011). The role of self-efficacy 
in the treatment of substance use disorders. Addictive 
Behaviors, 36(12), 1120–1126.

Kang, S. K., & Bodenhausen, G. V. (2015). Multiple identi-
ties in social perception and interaction: Challenges and 
opportunities. Annual Review of Psychology, 66, 547–574.

Kelly, J. F., & Westerhoff, C. M. (2010). Does it matter how 
we refer to individuals with substance-related condi-
tions? A randomized study of two commonly used terms. 
International Journal of Drug Policy, 21(3), 202–207.

Kennedy-Hendricks, A., Barry, C. L., Gollust, S. E., Ensminger, 
M. E., Chisolm, M. S., & McGinty, E. E. (2017). Social 
stigma toward persons with prescription opioid use dis-
order: Associations with public support for punitive and 
public health-oriented policies. Psychiatric Services, 68(5), 
462–469. https://doi.org/10.1176/appi.ps.201600056

Kessler, R. C., Aguilar-Gaxiola, S., Berglund, P. A., Caraveo-
Anduaga, J. J., DeWit, D. J., Greenfield, S. F., Kolody, B., 
Olfson, M., & Vega, W. A. (2001). Patterns and predictors 
of treatment seeking after onset of a substance use dis-
order. Archives of General Psychiatry, 58(11), 1065–1071. 
https://doi.org/10.1001/archpsyc.58.11.1065

Kessler, R. C., Walters, E. E., & Forthofer, M. S. (1998). 
The social consequences of psychiatric disorders, III: 
Probability of marital stability. American Journal of 
Psychiatry, 155(8), 1092–1096.

Keyes, K. M., Hatzenbuehler, M. L., McLaughlin, K. A., 
Link, B., Olfson, M., Grant, B. F., & Hasin, D. (2010). 
Stigma and treatment for alcohol disorders in the 
United States. American Journal of Epidemiology, 
172(12), 1364–1372.

King, E. B., Hebl, M. R., & Heatherton, T. F. (2005). Theories 
of stigma: Limitations and needed directions. In K. D. 
Brownell, R. M. Puhl, M. B. Schwartz, & L. Rudd (Eds.), 
Weight bias: Nature, consequences, and remedies (pp. 
109–120). Guilford Press.

Komiya, N., Good, G. E., & Sherrod, N. B. (2000). Emotional 
openness as a predictor of college students’ attitudes 
toward seeking psychological help. Journal of Counseling 
Psychology, 41(1), 138–143.

Krendl, A. C., & Cassidy, B. S. (2017). Neural response to eval-
uating depression predicts perceivers’ mental health treat-
ment recommendations. Cognitive, Affective, & Behavioral 
Neuroscience, 17(6), 1084–1097.

Krendl, A. C., & Freeman, J. B. (2019). Are mental illnesses 
stigmatized for the same reasons? Identifying the stigma-
related beliefs underlying common mental illnesses. 
Journal of Mental Health, 28(3), 267–275.

Krendl, A. C., Heatherton, T. F., & Kensinger, E. A. (2009). 
Aging minds and twisting attitudes: An fMRI investigation 

https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jpsychires.2017.08.001
https://doi.org/10.1186/s13011-016-0085-y
https://doi.org/10.3389/fpsyg.2019.02806
https://doi.org/10.3389/fpsyg.2019.02806
https://doi.org/10.1186/s12889-018-5861-3
https://doi.org/10.1186/s12889-018-5861-3
https://www.alleghenycountyanalytics.us/wp-content/uploads/2016/05/Asking-Why-Reasserting-the-Role-of-Community-Mental-Health.pdf
https://www.alleghenycountyanalytics.us/wp-content/uploads/2016/05/Asking-Why-Reasserting-the-Role-of-Community-Mental-Health.pdf
https://www.alleghenycountyanalytics.us/wp-content/uploads/2016/05/Asking-Why-Reasserting-the-Role-of-Community-Mental-Health.pdf
https://doi.org/10.1176/appi.ps.201600056
https://doi.org/10.1001/archpsyc.58.11.1065


Psychological Science in the Public Interest 24(2) 	 121

of age differences in inhibiting prejudice. Psychology and 
Aging, 24(3), 530–541.

Krendl, A. C., Kensinger, E. A., & Ambady, N. (2012). How 
does the brain regulate negative bias to stigma? Social 
Cognitive and Affective Neuroscience, 7(6), 715–726.

Krendl, A. C., Macrae, C. N., Kelley, W. M., Fugelsang, J. A., 
& Heatherton, T. F. (2006). The good, the bad, and the 
ugly: An fMRI investigation of the functional anatomic 
correlates of stigma. Social Neuroscience, 1(1), 5–15.

Krendl, A. C., & Perry, B. L. (2022). Addiction onset and off-
set characteristics and public stigma toward people with 
common substance dependencies: A large national survey 
experiment. Drug and Alcohol Dependence, 237, Article 
109503. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.drugalcdep.2022.109503

Krendl, A. C., & Pescosolido, B. A. (2020). Countries and 
cultural differences in the stigma of mental illness: The 
East–West divide. Journal of Cross-Cultural Psychology, 
51(2), 149–167.

Krendl, A. C., Zucker, H. R., & Kensinger, E. A. (2017). 
Examining the effects of emotion regulation on the 
ERP response to highly negative social stigmas. Social 
Neuroscience, 12(3), 349–360.

Kundert, C., & Corrigan, P. W. (2021). Honest, Open, Proud 
(HOP): A program to combat the stigma of mental illness 
with strategic disclosure. Routledge.

Kvaale, E. P., Haslam, N., & Gottdiener, W. H. (2013). The 
‘side effects’ of medicalization: A meta-analytic review 
of how biogenetic explanations affect stigma. Clinical 
Psychology Review, 33(6), 782–794. https://doi.org/ 
10.1016/j.cpr.2013.06.002

Larimer, M. E., Turner, A. P., Mallett, K. A., & Geisner, I. 
M. (2004). Predicting drinking behavior and alcohol-
related problems among fraternity and sorority mem-
bers: Examining the role of descriptive and injunctive 
norms. Psychology of Addictive Behaviors, 18(3), 203–212. 
https://doi.org/10.1037/0893-164x.18.3.203

Larkings, J. S., & Brown, P. M. (2018). Do biogenetic causal 
beliefs reduce mental illness stigma in people with mental 
illness and in mental health professionals? A systematic 
review. International Journal of Mental Health Nursing, 
27(3), 928–941.

Latkin, C. A., & Knowlton, A. R. (2015). Social network assess-
ments and interventions for health behavior change: A 
critical review. Behavioral Medicine, 41(3), 90–97.

Leary, M. R., Schreindorfer, L. S., & Haupt, A. L. (1995). The 
role of low self-esteem in emotional and behavioral prob-
lems: Why is low self-esteem dysfunctional? Journal of 
Social and Clinical Psychology, 14(3), 297–314.

Lebowitz, M. S., & Appelbaum, P. S. (2017). Beneficial and 
detrimental effects of genetic explanations for addiction. 
International Journal of Social Psychiatry, 63(8), 717–723.

Lien, Y. Y., Lin, H. S., Lien, Y. J., Tsai, C. H., Wu, T. T., Li, 
H., & Tu, Y. K. (2021). Challenging mental illness stigma 
in healthcare professionals and students: A systematic 
review and network meta-analysis. Psychology & Health, 
36(6), 669–684.

Link, B. G. (1982). Mental patient status, work, and income: 
An examination of the effects of a psychiatric label. 
American Sociological Review, 47, 202–215.

Link, B. G. (1987). Understanding labeling effects in the 
area of mental disorders: An assessment of the effects of 
expectations of rejection. American Sociological Review, 
52, 96–112.

Link, B. G., Cullen, F. T., Struening, E., Shrout, P. E., & 
Dohrenwend, B. P. (1989). A modified labeling theory 
approach to mental disorders: An empirical assessment. 
American Sociological Review, 54, 400–423.

Link, B. G., & Phelan, J. C. (2001). Conceptualizing stigma. 
Annual Review of Sociology, 27(1), 363–385.

Link, B. G., Phelan, J. C., Bresnahan, M., Stueve, A., & 
Pescosolido, B. A. (1999). Public conceptions of mental 
illness: Labels, causes, dangerousness, and social distance. 
American Journal of Public Health, 89(9), 1328–1333.

Link, B. G., Struening, E. L., Neese-Todd, S., Asmussen, S., 
& Phelan, J. C. (2001). Stigma as a barrier to recovery: 
The consequences of stigma for the self-esteem of peo-
ple with mental illnesses. Psychiatric Services, 52(12), 
1621–1626.

Lipton, F. R., Cohen, C. I., Fischer, E., & Katz, S. E. (1981). 
Schizophrenia: A network crisis. Schizophrenia Bulletin, 
7(1), 144–151.

Livingston, J. D. (2020). Structural stigma in health-care 
contexts for people with mental health and substance use 
issues. Mental Health Commission of Canada.

Livingston, J. D., & Boyd, J. E. (2010). Correlates and con-
sequences of internalized stigma for people living with 
mental illness: A systematic review and meta-analysis. 
Social Science & Medicine, 71(12), 2150–2161.

Livingston, J. D., Milne, T., Fang, M. L., & Amari, E. (2012). 
The effectiveness of interventions for reducing stigma 
related to substance use disorders: A systematic review. 
Addiction, 107(2), 39–50.

Luoma, J. B. (2010). Substance use stigma as a barrier to treat-
ment and recovery. Springer.

Luoma, J. B., Kulesza, M., Hayes, S. C., Kohlenberg, B., & 
Larimer, M. (2014). Stigma predicts residential treatment 
length for substance use disorder. The American Journal 
of Drug and Alcohol Abuse, 40(3), 206–212.

Madden, E. F., Prevedel, S., Light, T., & Sulzer, S. H. (2021). 
Intervention stigma toward medications for opioid use 
disorder: A systematic review. Substance Use & Misuse, 
56(14), 2181–2201.

Major, B., Dovidio, J. F., & Link, B. G. (Eds.). (2018). The 
Oxford handbook of stigma, discrimination, and health. 
Oxford University Press.

Major, B., Dovidio, J. F., Link, B. G., & Calabrese, S. K. (2018). 
Stigma and its implications for health: Introduction and 
overview. In B. Major, J. F. Dovidio, & B. G. Link (Eds.), 
The Oxford handbook of stigma, discrimination, and 
health (pp. 3–28). Oxford University Press.

Major, B., & O’Brien, L. T. (2005). The social psychology 
of stigma. Annual Review of Psychology, 56(1), 393–421.

Manago, B., & Krendl, A. C. (2023). Cultivating contact: How 
social norms can reduce mental illness stigma in college 
population. Stigma and Health, 8(1), 61–71. https://doi 
.org/10.1037/sah0000363

Manning, C., & White, P. D. (1995). Attitudes of employers to 
the mentally ill. Psychiatric Bulletin, 19, 541–543.

https://doi.org/10.1016/j.drugalcdep.2022.109503
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.cpr.2013.06.002
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.cpr.2013.06.002
https://doi.org/10.1037/0893-164x.18.3.203
https://doi.org/10.1037/sah0000363
https://doi.org/10.1037/sah0000363


122	 Krendl, Perry

Marlatt, G. A., Larimer, M. E., & Witkiewitz, K. (2011). Harm 
reduction: Pragmatic strategies for managing high-risk 
behaviors. Guilford Press.

Marshall, T. R. (1987). The Supreme Court as an opinion 
leader: Court decisions and the mass public. American 
Politics Quarterly, 15(1), 147–168.

Martin, J. K., Pescosolido, B. A., & Tuch, S. A. (2000). Of fear 
and loathing: The role of “disturbing behavior,” labels, 
and causal attributions in shaping public attitudes toward 
people with mental illness. Journal of Health and Social 
Behavior, 41, 208–223.

Mason, R., & O’Rinn, S. E. (2014). Co-occurring intimate part-
ner violence, mental health, and substance use problems: 
A scoping review. Global Health Action, 7(1), Article 
24815. https://doi.org/10.3402/gha.v7.24815

Maunder, R. D., & White, F. A. (2019). Intergroup contact and 
mental health stigma: A comparative effectiveness meta-
analysis. Clinical Psychology Review, 72, Article 101749. 
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.cpr.2019.101749

McGinty, E., Pescosolido, B., Kennedy-Hendricks, A., & Barry, 
C. L. (2018). Communication strategies to counter stigma 
and improve mental illness and substance use disorder 
policy. Psychiatric Services, 69(2), 136–146. https://doi 
.org/10.1176/appi.ps.201700076

McGinty, E. E., & Barry, C. L. (2020). Stigma reduction to com-
bat the addiction crisis—Developing an evidence base. 
New England Journal of Medicine, 382(14), 1291–1292.

McGinty, E. E., Goldman, H. H., Pescosolido, B., & Barry, C. 
L. (2015). Portraying mental illness and drug addiction 
as treatable health conditions: Effects of a randomized 
experiment on stigma and discrimination. Social Science 
& Medicine, 126, 73–85. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.socs 
cimed.2014.12.010

McGinty, E. E., Kennedy-Hendricks, A., & Barry, C. L. (2019). 
Stigma of addiction in the media. Springer.

McGinty, E. E., Niederdeppe, J., Heley, K., & Barry, C. L. 
(2017). Public perceptions of arguments supporting and 
opposing recreational marijuana legalization. Preventive 
Medicine, 99, 80–86.

McGinty, E. E., & White, S. A. (2022). Substance use stigma 
and policy. In G. Schomerus & P. W. Corrigan (Eds.), The 
stigma of substance use disorders (p. 23–45). Cambridge 
University Press.

McKinnon, K., & Rosner, J. (2000). Severe mental illness and 
HIV-AIDS. New Directions for Mental Health Services, 
2000(87), 69–76.

McKinnon, S. A., Conner, K. O., Roker, R., Ward, C. J., & 
Brown, C. (2019). The reduction of public and internal-
ized stigma in late-life depression: A pilot study. Journal 
of Applied Gerontology, 38(3), 424–433. https://doi.org/ 
10.1177/0733464816687079

Mehta, N., Clement, S., Marcus, E., Stona, A.-C., Bezborodovs, 
N., Evans-Lacko, S., Palacios, J., Docherty, M., Barley, E., 
Rose, D., Koschorke, M., Shidhaye, R., Henderson, C., & 
Thornicroft, G. (2015). Evidence for effective interven-
tions to reduce mental health-related stigma and discrimi-
nation in the medium and long term: Systematic review. 
The British Journal of Psychiatry, 207(5), 377–384.

Mendoza-Denton, R., Downey, G., Purdie, V. J., Davis, A., 
& Pietrzak, J. (2002). Sensitivity to status-based rejec-
tion: Implications for African American students’ college 

experience. Journal of Personality and Social Psychology, 
83(4), 896–918.

Mental Health America. (2016). Position Statement 11: In sup-
port of recovery-based systems transformation. https://
www.mhanational.org/issues/position-statement-11-sup 
port-recovery-based-systems-transformation

Metraux, S. (2002). Taking different ways home: The intersec-
tion of mental illness, homelessness and housing in New 
York City. University of Pennsylvania.

Milgram, S., Bickman, L., & Berkowitz, L. (1969). Note on 
the drawing power of crowds of different size. Journal of 
Personality and Social Psychology, 13(2), 79–82.

Miller, J. (2023, June 6). Addiction recovery statistics. https://
www.addictionhelp.com/recovery/statistics/

Modelli, A., Candal Setti, V. P., Van de Bilt, M. T., Gattaz, W. 
F., Loch, A. A., & Rössler, W. (2021). Addressing mood 
disorder diagnosis’ stigma with an Honest, Open, Proud 
(HOP)-based intervention: A randomized controlled trial. 
Frontiers in Psychiatry, 11, Article 582180. https://doi 
.org/10.3389/fpsyt.2020.582180

Mojtabai, R., Olfson, M., Sampson, N. A., Jin, R., Druss, B., 
Wang, P. S., Wells, K. B., Pincus, H. A., & Kessler, R. 
C. (2011). Barriers to mental health treatment: Results 
from the National Comorbidity Survey Replication. 
Psychological Medicine, 41(8), 1751–1761. https://doi 
.org/10.1017/S0033291710002291

Moos, R. H. (2005). Iatrogenic effects of psychosocial inter-
ventions for substance use disorders: Prevalence, predic-
tors, prevention. Addiction, 100(5), 595–604.

Morgan, A. J., Reavley, N. J., Ross, A., San Too, L., & Jorm, A. 
F. (2018). Interventions to reduce stigma towards people 
with severe mental illness: Systematic review and meta-
analysis. Journal of Psychiatric Research, 103, 120–133.

National Academies of Sciences, Engineering, and Medicine. 
(2016). Ending discrimination against people with men-
tal and substance use disorders: The evidence for stigma 
change. National Academies Press.

National Alliance on Mental Illness. (2015). Mental health 
care: NAMI report finds insurance discrimination, lack of 
transparency under parity laws. https://nami.org/Press-
Media/Press-Releases/2015/Mental-Health-Care-NAMI-
Report-Finds-Insurance-Di

National Alliance on Mental Illness. (2021). Mental health by 
the numbers. https://nami.org/mhstats

National Institute on Drug Abuse. (2023, June 30). Drug 
overdose death rates. https://www.drugabuse.gov/drug-
topics/trends-statistics/overdose-death-rates

Newman, B. N., & Crowell, K. A. (2023). The intersectionality 
of criminality and substance use self-stigmas. Stigma and 
Health, 8(2), 212–222.https://doi.org/10.1037/sah0000293

Nieweglowski, K., Dubke, R., Mulfinger, N., Sheehan, L., & 
Corrigan, P. W. (2019). Understanding the factor structure 
of the public stigma of substance use disorder. Addiction 
Research & Theory, 27(2), 156–161.

Nisbett, R. E., & Wilson, T. D. (1977). Telling more than 
we can know: Verbal reports on mental processes. 
Psychological Review, 84(3), 231–259.

Nutter, S., Alberga, A. S., MacInnis, C., Ellard, J. H., & Russell-
Mayhew, S. (2018). Framing obesity a disease: Indirect 
effects of affect and controllability beliefs on weight bias. 
International Journal of Obesity, 42(10), 1804–1811.

https://doi.org/10.3402/gha.v7.24815
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.cpr.2019.101749
https://doi.org/10.1176/appi.ps.201700076
https://doi.org/10.1176/appi.ps.201700076
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.socscimed.2014.12.010
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.socscimed.2014.12.010
https://doi.org/10.1177/0733464816687079
https://doi.org/10.1177/0733464816687079
https://www.mhanational.org/issues/position-statement-11-support-recovery-based-systems-transformation
https://www.mhanational.org/issues/position-statement-11-support-recovery-based-systems-transformation
https://www.mhanational.org/issues/position-statement-11-support-recovery-based-systems-transformation
https://www.addictionhelp.com/recovery/statistics/
https://www.addictionhelp.com/recovery/statistics/
https://doi.org/10.3389/fpsyt.2020.582180
https://doi.org/10.3389/fpsyt.2020.582180
https://doi.org/10.1017/S0033291710002291
https://doi.org/10.1017/S0033291710002291
https://nami.org/Press-Media/Press-Releases/2015/Mental-Health-Care-NAMI-Report-Finds-Insurance-Di
https://nami.org/Press-Media/Press-Releases/2015/Mental-Health-Care-NAMI-Report-Finds-Insurance-Di
https://nami.org/Press-Media/Press-Releases/2015/Mental-Health-Care-NAMI-Report-Finds-Insurance-Di
https://nami.org/mhstats
https://www.drugabuse.gov/drug-topics/trends-statistics/overdose-death-rates
https://www.drugabuse.gov/drug-topics/trends-statistics/overdose-death-rates
https://doi.org/10.1037/sah0000293


Psychological Science in the Public Interest 24(2) 	 123

Oexle, N., & Corrigan, P. W. (2018). Understanding men-
tal illness stigma toward persons with multiple stigma-
tized conditions: Implications of intersectionality theory. 
Psychiatric Services, 69(5), 587–589.

Ofosu, E. K., Chambers, M. K., Chen, J. M., & Hehman, E. 
(2019). Same-sex marriage legalization associated with 
reduced implicit and explicit antigay bias. Proceedings of 
the National Academy of Sciences, USA, 116(18), 8846–8851.

Pachankis, J. E. (2007). The psychological implications of con-
cealing a stigma: A cognitive-affective-behavioral model. 
Psychological Bulletin, 133(2), 328–345.

Pachankis, J. E., Hatzenbuehler, M. L., Wang, K., Burton, C. 
L., Crawford, F. W., Phelan, J. C., & Link, B. G. (2018). 
The burden of stigma on health and well-being: A tax-
onomy of concealment, course, disruptiveness, aesthetics, 
origin, and peril across 93 stigmas. Personality and Social 
Psychology Bulletin, 44(4), 451–474.

Page, S. (1977). Effects of the mental illness label in 
attempts to obtain accommodation. Canadian Journal of 
Behavioural Science/Revue Canadienne des Sciences du 
Comportement, 9(2), 85–90.

Paluck, E. L., Green, S. A., & Green, D. P. (2019). The con-
tact hypothesis re-evaluated. Behavioural Public Policy, 
3(2), 129–158.

Parcesepe, A. M., & Cabassa, L. J. (2013). Public stigma of 
mental illness in the United States: A systematic literature 
review. Administration and Policy in Mental Health and 
Mental Health Services Research, 40(5), 384–399.

Parker, M. A., Cordoba-Grueso, W. S., Streck, J. M., Goodwin, 
R. D., & Weinberger, A. H. (2021). Intersectionality of 
serious psychological distress, cigarette smoking, and 
substance use disorders in the United States: 2008–2018. 
Drug and Alcohol Dependence, 228, Article 109095. 
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.drugalcdep.2021.109095

Pelletier, L. G., Guertin, C., & Rocchi, M. (2017). The distinc-
tive roles of perceptions of health risks and benefits, 
self-efficacy, and motivation in the awareness, initiation, 
and maintenance of healthy behaviors. In F. Guay, H. 
W. Marsh, D. M. McInerney, & R. G. Craven (Eds.), Self: 
Driving positive psychology and well-being (pp. 135–165). 
IAP Information Age Publishing.

Pereira, C., Vala, J., & Leyens, J. (2009). From infra-humaniza-
tion to discrimination: The mediation of symbolic threat 
needs egalitarian norms. Journal of Experimental Social 
Psychology, 45, 336–344.

Peris, T. S., Teachman, B. A., & Nosek, B. A. (2008). Implicit and 
explicit stigma of mental illness: Links to clinical care. The 
Journal of Nervous and Mental Disease, 190(10), 752–760.

Perry, B. L. (2011). The labeling paradox: Stigma, the sick 
role, and social networks in mental illness. Journal of 
Health and Social Behavior, 52(4), 460–477.

Perry, B. L., Felix, E., Bolton, M., Pullen, E. L., & Pescosolido, 
B. A. (2022). Public stigma and personal networks: 
Confronting the limitations of unidimensional measures 
of social contact. Journal of Health and Social Behavior, 
63(3), 428–445.

Perry, B. L., Pescosolido, B. A., & Krendl, A. C. (2020). The 
unique nature of public stigma toward non-medical pre-
scription opioid use and dependence: A national study. 

Addiction, 115(12), 2317–2326. https://doi.org/10.1111/
add.15069

Perry, B. L., Pescosolido, B. A., Martin, J. K., McLeod, J. D., 
& Jensen, P. S. (2007). Comparison of public attribu-
tions, attitudes, and stigma in regard to depression among 
children and adults. Psychiatric Services, 58(5), 632–635. 
https://doi.org/10.1176/appi.ps.58.5.632

Perry, B. L., & Wright, E. R. (2006). The sexual partnerships 
of people with serious mental illness. Journal of Sex 
Research, 43, 174–181.

Pescosolido, B. A. (2013). The public stigma of mental ill-
ness: What do we think; what do we know; what can we 
prove? Journal of Health and Social Behavior, 54(1), 1–21.

Pescosolido, B. A., Halpern-Manners, A., Luo, L., & Perry, B. 
(2021). Trends in public stigma of mental illness in the US, 
1996-2018. JAMA Network Open, 4(12), Article e2140202. 
https://doi.org/10.1001/jamanetworkopen.2021.40202

Pescosolido, B. A., Manago, B., & Monahan, J. (2019). Evolving 
public views on the likelihood of violence from people 
with mental illness: Stigma and its consequences. Health 
Affairs, 38(10), 1735–1743. https://doi.org/ 10.1377/
hlthaff.2019.00702

Pescosolido, B. A., & Martin, J. K. (2015). The stigma complex. 
Annual Review of Sociology, 41, 87–116.

Pescosolido, B. A., Martin, J. K., Long, J. S., Medina, T. R., 
Phelan, J. C., & Link, B. G. (2010). “A disease like any 
other”? A decade of change in public reactions to schizo-
phrenia, depression, and alcohol dependence. American 
Journal of Psychiatry, 167(11), 1321–1330. https://doi 
.org/10.1176/appi.ajp.2010.09121743

Pescosolido, B. A., Monahan, J., Link, B. G., Stueve, A., & 
Kikuzawa, S. (1999). The public’s view of the compe-
tence, dangerousness, and need for legal coercion of per-
sons with mental health problems. American Journal of 
Public Health, 89(9), 1339–1345. https://doi.org/10.2105/
Ajph.89.9.1339

Pescosolido, B. A., Perry, B. L., & Krendl, A. C. (2020). 
Empowering the next generation to end stigma by starting 
the conversation: Bring Change to Mind and the College 
Toolbox Project. Journal of the American Academy of 
Child & Adolescent Psychiatry, 59(4), 519–530. https://
doi.org/10.1016/j.jaac.2019.06.016

Peterson, D., Pere, L., Sheehan, N., & Surgenor, G. (2007). 
Experiences of mental health discrimination in New 
Zealand. Health and Social Care in the Community, 15, 
18–25.

Pettigrew, T. F., & Tropp, L. R. (2006). A meta-analytic test 
of intergroup contact theory. Journal of Personality 
and Social Psychology, 90(5), 751–783. https://doi.org/ 
10.1037/0022-3514.90.5.751

Pettigrew, T. F., & Tropp, L. R. (2008). How does intergroup 
contact reduce prejudice? Meta-analytic tests of three 
mediators. European Journal of Social Psychology, 38(6), 
922–934. https://doi.org/10.1002/ejsp.504

Pettigrew, T. F., Tropp, L. R., Wagner, U., & Christ, O. (2011). 
Recent advances in intergroup contact theory. International 
Journal of Intercultural Relations, 35(4), 271–280.

Petty, R. E., & Cacioppo, J. T. (1986). The elaboration like-
lihood model of persuasion. In L. Berkowitz (Ed.), 

https://doi.org/10.1016/j.drugalcdep.2021.109095
https://doi.org/10.1111/add.15069
https://doi.org/10.1111/add.15069
https://doi.org/10.1176/appi.ps.58.5.632
https://doi.org/10.1001/jamanetworkopen.2021.40202
https://doi.org/10.1377/hlthaff.2019.00702
https://doi.org/10.1377/hlthaff.2019.00702
https://doi.org/10.1176/appi.ajp.2010.09121743
https://doi.org/10.1176/appi.ajp.2010.09121743
https://doi.org/10.2105/Ajph.89.9.1339
https://doi.org/10.2105/Ajph.89.9.1339
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jaac.2019.06.016
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jaac.2019.06.016
https://doi.org/10.1037/0022-3514.90.5.751
https://doi.org/10.1037/0022-3514.90.5.751
https://doi.org/10.1002/ejsp.504


124	 Krendl, Perry

Advances in experimental social psychology (Vol. 19, pp. 
123–205). Academic Press.

Petty, R. E., Goldman, R., & Cacioppo, J. T. (1981). Personal 
involvement as a determinant of argument-based persua-
sion. Journal of Personality and Social Psychology, 41(5), 
847–855. https://doi.org/10.1037/0022-3514.41.5.847

Phelan, J. C., Link, B. G., & Dovidio, J. F. (2008). Stigma and 
prejudice: One animal or two? Social Science & Medicine, 
67(3), 358–367.

Phelan, J. C., Link, B. G., Stueve, A., & Pescosolido, B. A. 
(2000). Public conceptions of mental illness in 1950 and 
1996: What is mental illness and is it to be feared? Journal 
of Health and Social Behavior, 41(2), 188–207. https://
doi.org/10.2307/2676305

Phillips, L. A., & Shaw, A. (2013). Substance use more stig-
matized than smoking and obesity. Journal of Substance 
Use, 18(4), 247–253.

Piat, M. (2000). The NIMBY phenomenon: Community resi-
dents’ concerns about housing for deinstitutionalized 
people. Health & Social Work, 25(2), 127–138.

Pierson, P. (1993). When effect becomes cause: Policy feed-
back and political change. World Politics, 45(4), 595–628.

Pinedo, M. (2020). Help seeking behaviors of Latinos with 
substance use disorders who perceive a need for treat-
ment: Substance abuse versus mental health treatment 
services. Journal of Substance Abuse Treatment, 109, 
41–45. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jsat.2019.11.006

Pinel, E. C. (1999). Stigma consciousness: The psychological 
legacy of social stereotypes. Journal of Personality and 
Social Psychology, 76(1), 114–128.

Poldrack, R. A. (2011). Inferring mental states from neuroim-
aging data: From reverse inference to large-scale decod-
ing. Neuron, 72(5), 629–697.

Potier, C., Laprévote, V., Dubois-Arber, F., Cottencin, O., & 
Rolland, B. (2014). Supervised injection services: What 
has been demonstrated? A systematic literature review. 
Drug and Alcohol Dependence, 145, 48–68.

Price, M. A., Weisz, J. R., McKetta, S., Hollinsaid, N. L., 
Lattanner, M. R., Reid, A. E., & Hatzenbuehler, M. L. 
(2022). Meta-analysis: Are psychotherapies less effective 
for Black youth in communities with higher levels of anti-
Black racism? Journal of the American Academy of Child 
& Adolescent Psychiatry, 61(6), 754–763.

Pryor, J. B., Reeder, G. D., Yeadon, C., & Hesson-McInnis, M. 
(2004). A dual-process model of reactions to perceived 
stigma. Journal of Personality and Social Psychology, 
87(4), 436–452.

Puhl, R. M., & Brownell, K. D. (2003). Psychosocial origins 
of obesity stigma: Toward changing a powerful and per-
vasive bias. Obesity Reviews, 4(4), 213–227.

Quinn, D. M. (2006). Concealable versus conspicuous stigma-
tized identities. Psychology Press.

Quinn, D. M. (2017). When stigma is concealable: The costs 
and benefits for health. In B. Major, J. F. Dovidio, & B. 
G. Link (Eds.), The Oxford handbook of stigma, discrimi-
nation, and health (pp. 287–299). Oxford University 
Press.

Quinn, D. M., & Earnshaw, V. A. (2013). Concealable stigma-
tized identities and psychological well-being. Social and 

Personality Psychology Compass, 7(1), 40–51. https://doi 
.org/10.1111/spc3.12005

Railey, A. F., Roth, A. R., Krendl, A. C., & Perry, B. L. (2023). 
Intergroup relationships with people who use drugs: A 
personal network approach. Social Science & Medicine, 
317, Article 115612. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.socs 
cimed.2022.115612

Reinka, M. A., Pan-Weisz, B., Lawner, E. K., & Quinn, D. M. 
(2020). Cumulative consequences of stigma: Possessing 
multiple concealable stigmatized identities is associ-
ated with worse quality of life. Journal of Applied Social 
Psychology, 50(4), 253–261.

Reno, R. R., Cialdini, R. B., & Kallgren, C. A. (1993). The 
transsituational influence of social norms. Journal of 
Personality and Social Psychology, 64(1), 104–112. https://
doi.org/10.1037/0022-3514.64.1.104

Repper, J., & Carter, T. (2011). A review of the literature on 
peer support in mental health services. Journal of Mental 
Health, 20(4), 392–411. https://doi.org/10.3109/0963823
7.2011.583947

Rey, C. N., Kurti, A. N., Badger, G. J., Cohen, A. H., & Heil, S. 
H. (2019). Stigma, discrimination, treatment effectiveness, 
and policy support: Comparing behavior analysts’ views 
on drug addiction and mental illness. Behavior Analysis in 
Practice, 12(4), 758–766. https://doi.org/10.1007/s40617-
019-00345-6

Richter, L., Vuolo, L., & Salmassi, M. S. (2019). Stigma and 
addiction treatment. In J. D. Avery & J. J. Avery (Eds.), 
The stigma of addiction: An essential guide (pp. 93–130). 
Springer.

Ritsher, J. B., & Phelan, J. C. (2004). Internalized stigma pre-
dicts erosion of morale among psychiatric outpatients. 
Psychiatry Research, 129(3), 257–265.

Ritter, A., & Cameron, J. (2006). A review of the efficacy and 
effectiveness of harm reduction strategies for alcohol, 
tobacco and illicit drugs. Drug and Alcohol Review, 25(6), 
611–624.

Robinson, P., Turk, D., Jilka, S., & Cella, M. (2019). Measuring 
attitudes towards mental health using social media: 
Investigating stigma and trivialisation. Social Psychiatry 
and Psychiatric Epidemiology, 54(1), 51–58.

Rodin, M., Price, J., Sanchez, F., & McElligot, S. (1989). 
Derogation, exclusion, and unfair treatment of persons 
with social flaws controllability of stigma and the attri-
bution of prejudice. Personality and Social Psychology 
Bulletin, 15(3), 439–451.

Rodriguez, L. M., & Prestwood, L. (2019). The stigma of addic-
tion in romantic relationships. In J. D. Avery & J. J. Avery 
(Eds.), The stigma of addiction: An essential guide (pp. 
55–69). Springer.

Roehrig, J. P., & McLean, C. P. (2010). A comparison of stigma 
toward eating disorders versus depression. International 
Journal of Eating Disorders, 43(7), 671–674.

Rüsch, N., Angermeyer, M. C., & Corrigan, P. W. (2005). 
Mental illness stigma: Concepts, consequences, and ini-
tiatives to reduce stigma. European Psychiatry, 20(8), 
529–539.

Russinova, Z., Griffin, S., Bloch, P., Wewiorski, N. J., & Rosoklija, 
I. (2011). Workplace prejudice and discrimination toward 

https://doi.org/10.1037/0022-3514.41.5.847
https://doi.org/10.2307/2676305
https://doi.org/10.2307/2676305
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jsat.2019.11.006
https://doi.org/10.1111/spc3.12005
https://doi.org/10.1111/spc3.12005
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.socscimed.2022.115612
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.socscimed.2022.115612
https://doi.org/10.1037/0022-3514.64.1.104
https://doi.org/10.1037/0022-3514.64.1.104
https://doi.org/10.3109/09638237.2011.583947
https://doi.org/10.3109/09638237.2011.583947
https://doi.org/10.1007/s40617-019-00345-6
https://doi.org/10.1007/s40617-019-00345-6


Psychological Science in the Public Interest 24(2) 	 125

individuals with mental illnesses. Journal of Vocational 
Rehabilitation, 35(3), 227–241.

Ryan, R. M., & Deci, E. L. (2000). Self-determination theory 
and the facilitation of intrinsic motivation, social devel-
opment, and well-being. American Psychologist, 55(1), 
68–78.

Ryan, R. M., Patrick, H., Deci, E. L., & Williams, G. C. (2008). 
Facilitating health behaviour change and its mainte-
nance: Interventions based on self-determination theory. 
European Health Psychologist, 10(1), 2–5.

Sadler, M. S., Kaye, K. E., & Vaughn, A. A. (2015). Competence 
and warmth stereotypes prompt mental illness stigma 
through emotions. Journal of Applied Social Psychology, 
45(11), 602–612.

Sadler, M. S., Meagor, E. L., & Kaye, K. E. (2012). Stereotypes 
of mental disorders differ in competence and warmth. 
Social Science & Medicine, 74(6), 915–922.

Sattler, S., Escande, A., Racine, E., & Göritz, A. S. (2017). 
Public stigma toward people with drug addiction: A fac-
torial survey. Journal of Studies on Alcohol and Drugs, 
78(3), 415–425.

Scheid, T. L. (1999). Employment of individuals with mental 
disabilities: Business response to the ADA’s challenge. 
Behavioral Sciences & the Law, 17(1), 73–91.

Scheid, T. L. (2005). Stigma as a barrier to employment: 
Mental disability and the Americans With Disabilities 
Act. International Journal of Law and Psychiatry, 28(6), 
670–690.

Schomerus, G., Lucht, M., Holzinger, A., Matschinger, H., 
Carta, M. G., & Angermeyer, M. C. (2011). The stigma 
of alcohol dependence compared with other mental 
disorders: A review of population studies. Alcohol and 
Alcoholism, 46(2), 105–112. https://doi.org/10.1093/
alcalc/agq089

Schultz, P. W., Khazian, A. M., & Zaleski, A. C. (2008). Using 
normative social influence to promote conservation 
among hotel guests. Social Influence, 3(1), 4–23. https://
doi.org/10.1080/15534510701755614

Schwarzer, R., & Fuchs, R. (1996). Self-efficacy and health 
behaviours. In M. Conner & P. Norman (Eds.), Predicting 
health behavior: Research and practice with social cogni-
tion models (pp. 163–196). Open University Press.

Schwarzer, R., & Weiner, B. (1991). Stigma controllability 
and coping as predictors of emotions and social sup-
port. Journal of Social and Personal Relationships, 8(1), 
133–140.

Sharac, J., Mccrone, P., Clement, S., & Thornicroft, G. (2010). 
The economic impact of mental health stigma and dis-
crimination: A systematic review. Epidemiology and 
Psychiatric Sciences, 19(3), 223–232.

Sheehan, L., Nieweglowski, K., & Corrigan, P. W. (2017). 
Structures and types of stigma. In W. Gaebel, W. Rössler, 
& N. Sartorius (Eds.), The stigma of mental illness — End 
of the story? (pp. 43–82). Springer.

Sherif, M. (1936). The psychology of social norms. Harper.
Sherif, M. (1966). In common predicament: Social psychol-

ogy of intergroup conflict and cooperation. Houghton 
Mifflin.

Sherman, J. W., Stroessner, S. J., Conrey, F. R., & Azam, O. 
A. (2005). Prejudice and stereotype maintenance pro-
cesses: Attention, attribution, and individuation. Journal 
of Personality and Social Psychology, 89(4), 607–622.

Shin, W.-G., Woo, C.-W., Jung, W. H., Kim, H., Lee, T. 
Y., Decety, J., & Kwon, J. S. (2020). The neurobehav-
ioral mechanisms underlying attitudes toward people 
with mental or physical illness. Frontiers in Behavioral 
Neuroscience, 14, Article 571225. https://doi.org/10.3389/
fnbeh.2020.571225

Sickel, A. E., Seacat, J. D., & Nabors, N. A. (2014). Mental 
health stigma update: A review of consequences. 
Advances in Mental Health, 12(3), 202–215.

Smith, C. B. R. (2011). A users’ guide to ‘juice bars’ and ‘liquid 
handcuffs’ fluid negotiations of subjectivity, space and the 
substance of methadone treatment. Space and Culture, 
14(3), 291–309.

Stangor, C., Sechrist, G. B., & Jost, J. T. (2001). Changing racial 
beliefs by providing consensus information. Personality 
and Social Psychology Bulletin, 27(4), 486–496. https://
doi.org/10.1177/0146167201274009

Steffian, G. (1999). Correction of normative misperceptions: 
An alcohol abuse prevention program. Journal of Drug 
Education, 29(2), 115–138. https://doi.org/10.2190/9XKX-
BM6K-N28X-3FTL

Steinka-Fry, K. T., Tanner-Smith, E. E., Dakof, G. A., & 
Henderson, C. (2017). Culturally sensitive substance use 
treatment for racial/ethnic minority youth: A meta-analytic 
review. Journal of Substance Abuse Treatment, 75, 22–37. 
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jsat.2017.01.006

Stelzmann, D., Toth, R., & Schieferdecker, D. (2021). Can 
intergroup contact in virtual reality (VR) reduce stigma-
tization against people with schizophrenia? Journal of 
Clinical Medicine, 10(13), Article 2961. https://doi.org/ 
10.3390/jcm10132961

Stringer, R. J., & Maggard, S. R. (2016). Reefer madness to 
marijuana legalization: Media exposure and American 
attitudes toward marijuana (1975-2012). Journal of Drug 
Issues, 46(4), 428–445.

Substance Abuse and Mental Health Services Administration. 
(2023, January 4). SAMHSA announces National Survey 
on Drug Use and Health (NSDUH) results detailing mental 
illness and substance use levels in 2021 [Press release]. 
https://www.samhsa.gov/newsroom/press-announce-
ments/20230104/samhsa-announces-nsduh-results-detail-
ing-mental-illness-substance-use-levels-2021

Sumnall, H. R., Atkinson, A. M., Montgomery, C., Maynard, 
O. M., & Nicholls, J. (2023). Effects of media representa-
tions of drug related deaths on public stigma and sup-
port for harm reduction. International Journal of Drug 
Policy, 111, Article 103909. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.drug 
po.2022.103909

Tajfel, H., & Turner, J. C. (2004). The social identity theory of 
intergroup behavior. Psychology Press.

Tanco, K., Dumlao, D., Kreis, R., Nguyen, K., Dibaj, S., Liu, 
D., Marupakula, V., Shaikh, A., Baile, W., & Bruera, E. 
(2019). Attitudes and beliefs about medical usefulness 
and legalization of marijuana among cancer patients in a 

https://doi.org/10.1093/alcalc/agq089
https://doi.org/10.1093/alcalc/agq089
https://doi.org/10.1080/15534510701755614
https://doi.org/10.1080/15534510701755614
https://doi.org/10.3389/fnbeh.2020.571225
https://doi.org/10.3389/fnbeh.2020.571225
https://doi.org/10.1177/0146167201274009
https://doi.org/10.1177/0146167201274009
https://doi.org/10.2190/9XKX-BM6K-N28X-3FTL
https://doi.org/10.2190/9XKX-BM6K-N28X-3FTL
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jsat.2017.01.006
https://doi.org/10.3390/jcm10132961
https://doi.org/10.3390/jcm10132961
https://www.samhsa.gov/newsroom/press-announcements/20230104/samhsa-announces-nsduh-results-detailing-mental-illness-substance-use-levels-2021
https://www.samhsa.gov/newsroom/press-announcements/20230104/samhsa-announces-nsduh-results-detailing-mental-illness-substance-use-levels-2021
https://www.samhsa.gov/newsroom/press-announcements/20230104/samhsa-announces-nsduh-results-detailing-mental-illness-substance-use-levels-2021
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.drugpo.2022.103909
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.drugpo.2022.103909


126	 Krendl, Perry

legalized and a nonlegalized state. Journal of Palliative 
Medicine, 22(10), 1213–1220.

Terry, D. J., & Hogg, M. A. (1996). Group norms and the 
attitude-behavior relationship: A role for group identifi-
cation. Personality and Social Psychology Bulletin, 22(8), 
776–793. https://doi.org/10.1177/0146167296228002

Thornicroft, G., Mehta, N., Clement, S., Evans-Lacko, S., 
Doherty, M., Rose, D., Koschorke, M., Shidhaye, R., 
O’Reilly, C., & Henderson, C. (2016). Evidence for 
effective interventions to reduce mental-health-related 
stigma and discrimination. The Lancet, 387(10023), 
1123–1132.

Todd, J., Green, G., Harrison, M., Ikuesan, B. A., Self, C., 
Pevalin, D. J., & Baldacchino, A. (2004). Social exclu-
sion in clients with comorbid mental health and sub-
stance misuse problems. Social Psychiatry and Psychiatric 
Epidemiology, 39(7), 581–587.

Tompkins, T. L., Shields, C. N., Hillman, K. M., & White, K. 
(2015). Reducing stigma toward the transgender com-
munity: An evaluation of a humanizing and perspective-
taking intervention. Psychology of Sexual Orientation and 
Gender Diversity, 2(1), 34–42.

Towler, A. J., & Schneider, D. J. (2005). Distinctions among 
stigmatized groups. Journal of Applied Social Psychology, 
35(1), 1–14.

Turner, R. N., Hewstone, M., Voci, A., & Vonofakou, C. (2008). 
A test of the extended intergroup contact hypothesis: The 
mediating role of intergroup anxiety, perceived ingroup 
and outgroup norms, and inclusion of the outgroup in the 
self. Journal of Personality and Social Psychology, 95(4), 
843–860. https://doi.org/10.1037/a0011434

Valente, T. W. (2012). Network interventions. Science, 
337(6090), 49–53.

Van Overwalle, F. (2009). Social cognition and the brain: A 
meta-analysis. Human Brain Mapping, 30(3), 829–858.

Vescio, T. K., Sechrist, G. B., & Paolucci, M. P. (2003). 
Perspective taking and prejudice reduction: The media-
tional role of empathy arousal and situational attributions. 
European Journal of Social Psychology, 33(4), 455–472.

Vinson, E. S., Abdullah, T., & Brown, T. L. (2016). Mental ill-
ness stigma intervention in African Americans: Examining 
two delivery methods. Journal of Nervous and Mental 
Disease, 204(5), 400–403. https://doi.org/10.1097/NMD 
.0000000000000458

Vogel, D. L., Shechtman, Z., & Wade, N. G. (2010). The role 
of public and self-stigma in predicting attitudes toward 
group counseling. The Counseling Psychologist, 38(7), 
904–922.

Vogel, D. L., Wade, N. G., & Hackler, A. H. (2007). Perceived 
public stigma and the willingness to seek counseling: The 
mediating roles of self-stigma and attitudes toward coun-
seling. Journal of Counseling Psychology, 54(1), 40–50. 
https://doi.org/10.1037/0022-0167.54.1.40

Wahl, O. F. (1999). Telling is risky business: Mental health 
consumers confront stigma. Rutgers University Press.

Wainberg, M. L., Cournos, F., Wall, M. M., Pala, A. N., Mann, 
C. G., Pinto, D., Pinho, V., & McKinnon, K. (2016). Mental 
illness sexual stigma: Implications for health and recov-
ery. Psychiatric Rehabilitation Journal, 39(2), 90–96.

Walsh, J., Vaida, N., Coman, A., & Fiske, S. T. (2023). Stories in 
action. Psychological Science in the Public Interest, 23(3), 
99–141. https://doi.org/10.1177/15291006231161337

Weeks, C., & Stenstrom, D. M. (2020). Stigmatization of opioid 
addiction based on prescription, sex and age. Addictive 
Behaviors, 108, Article 106469. https://doi.org/10.1016/ 
j.addbeh.2020.106469

Weiner, B. (1980). A cognitive (attribution)-emotion-action 
model of motivated behavior: An analysis of judgments of 
help-giving. Journal of Personality and Social Psychology, 
39(2), 186–200.

Weiner, B., Perry, R. P., & Magnusson, J. (1988). An attri-
butional analysis of reactions to stigmas. Journal of 
Personality and Social Psychology, 55(5), 738–748.

Wesselmann, E. D., & Parris, L. (2021). Exploring the links 
between social exclusion and substance use, misuse, 
and addiction. Frontiers in Psychology, 12, Article 2321. 
https://doi.org/10.3389/fpsyg.2021.674743

White, H. R. (2016). Substance use and crime. In K. J. Sher 
(Ed.), The Oxford handbook of substance use and sub-
stance use disorders: Volume 2 (pp. 347–378). Oxford 
University Press.

White, K. M., Smith, J. R., Terry, D. J., Greenslade, J. H., & 
McKimmie, B. M. (2009). Social influence in the theory of 
planned behaviour: The role of descriptive, injunctive, and 
in-group norms. British Journal of Social Psychology, 48(1), 
135–158. https://doi.org/10.1348/014466608x295207

Witte, T. H., Wright, A., & Stinson, E. A. (2019). Factors influ-
encing stigma toward individuals who have substance 
use disorders. Substance Use & Misuse, 54(7), 1115–1124.

Wood, L., Birtel, M., Alsawy, S., Pyle, M., & Morrison, A. 
(2014). Public perceptions of stigma towards people 
with schizophrenia, depression, and anxiety. Psychiatry 
Research, 220(1–2), 604–608. https://doi.org/10.1016/ 
j.psychres.2014.07.012

Woods, J. S., & Joseph, H. (2018). From narcotic to normal-
izer: The misperception of methadone treatment and the 
persistence of prejudice and bias. Substance Use & Misuse, 
53(2), 323–329.

Wright, E. R., Wright, D. E., Perry, B. L., & Foote-Ardah, C. E. 
(2007). Stigma and the sexual isolation of people with 
serious mental illness. Social Problems, 54(1), 78–98.

Yanos, P. T., Lucksted, A., Drapalski, A. L., Roe, D., & 
Lysaker, P. (2015). Interventions targeting mental health 
self-stigma: A review and comparison. Psychiatric 
Rehabilitation Journal, 38(2), 171–178.

Yu, B. C. L., Chio, F. H. N., Mak, W. W. S., Corrigan, P. 
W., & Chan, K. K. Y. (2021). Internalization process of 
stigma of people with mental illness across cultures: A 
meta-analytic structural equation modeling approach. 
Clinical Psychology Review, 87, Article 102029. https://
doi.org/10.1016/j.cpr.2021.102029

Zhong, S., Yu, R., & Fazel, S. (2020). Drug use disorders and 
violence: Associations with individual drug categories. 
Epidemiologic Reviews, 42(1), 103–116.

Zitek, E. M., & Hebl, M. R. (2007). The role of social norm 
clarity in the influenced expression of prejudice over 
time. Journal of Experimental Social Psychology, 43(6), 
867–876. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jesp.2006.10.010

https://doi.org/10.1177/0146167296228002
https://doi.org/10.1037/a0011434
https://doi.org/10.1097/NMD.0000000000000458
https://doi.org/10.1097/NMD.0000000000000458
https://doi.org/10.1037/0022-0167.54.1.40
https://doi.org/10.1177/15291006231161337
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.addbeh.2020.106469
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.addbeh.2020.106469
https://doi.org/10.3389/fpsyg.2021.674743
https://doi.org/10.1348/014466608x295207
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.psychres.2014.07.012
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.psychres.2014.07.012
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.cpr.2021.102029
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.cpr.2021.102029
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jesp.2006.10.010

